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AWARDED ITEMS IN RED

Item Part Number Quantity Bid Price Extended Price Reorder Price Bid Price Extended Price Reorder Price Bid Price Extended Price Reorder Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Reorder Price

Brand Name/Manufacturer
Joma or Equal 6000 System Less Curb-Runner 
Guard 76006-367000  NO BID  NO BID 

   10' System - FOB Any NDDOT District  $                1,300.00  $         1,833.62 

   11' System - FOB Any NDDOT District  $                1,430.00  $         1,984.00 

   12' System - FOB Any NDDOT District  $                1,560.00  $         2,116.00 

Joma or Equal 4' Rubber Edge 76006-367005  NO BID  NO BID 
   FOB Fargo District 150  $       410.00  $          61,500.00  $             572.00  $     85,800.00 
   FOB Grand Forks District 30  $       410.00  $          12,300.00  $             572.00  $     17,160.00 
   FOB Bismarck District 88  $       410.00  $          36,080.00  $             572.00  $     50,336.00 
   FOB Minot District 179  $       410.00  $          73,390.00  $             572.00  $   102,388.00 
   FOB Valley City District 72  $       410.00  $          29,520.00  $             572.00  $     41,184.00 
   FOB Dickinson District 10  $       410.00  $            4,100.00  $             572.00  $       5,720.00 

   FOB Any NDDOT District  $                   410.00  $            572.00 

Joma or Equal 3' Rubber Edge 76006-367006  NO BID  NO BID 
   FOB Fargo District 50  $       307.50  $          15,375.00  $             454.72  $     22,736.00 
   FOB Bismarck District 50  $       307.50  $          15,375.00  $             454.72  $     22,736.00 
   FOB Minot District 55  $       307.50  $          16,912.50  $             454.72  $     25,009.60 
   FOB Valley City District 36  $       307.50  $          11,070.00  $             454.72  $     16,369.92 
   FOB Dickinson District 5  $       307.50  $            1,537.50  $             454.72  $       2,273.60 

   FOB Any NDDOT District  $                   307.50  $            454.72 

Joma or Equal Curb Runner Guard 663158PLH (Left) 76006-367020  NO BID  NO BID 
   FOB Minot District 16  $         90.56  $            1,448.96  $               68.65  $       1,098.40 

   FOB Any NDDOT District  $                     90.56  $              68.65 

Joma or Equal Curb Runner Guard 663158PRH 
(Right) 76006-367020
   FOB Minot District 16  $         90.56  $            1,448.96  $               68.65  $       1,098.40 

   FOB Any NDDOT District  $                     90.56  $              68.65 

X-48-W Assembly 4' Polarflex front mount system 
C/W 5/8" x 6" Adapter Blades, 12' Plow (3Per) or 
Equal 76006-367700  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
   FOB Williston District 12  $    2,115.00  $          25,380.00 
   FOB Any NDDOT District  $                2,115.00 

5/8" X 6" Polarflex XSW-12 Adapter Blades - Or Equal 76006-367500 NO BID NO BID NO BID
   FOB Williston District 36  $         99.36  $            3,576.96 
   FOB Any NDDOT District  $                     99.36 

X-48-W-F, Complete 4' Section, Polarflex or Equal  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
   FOB Any NDDOT District  $                   705.00 

   FOB Any NDDOT District  $                   178.56 

AUX-48, Front Angle, Polarflex or Equal  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
   FOB Any NDDOT District  $                   117.60 

Polarflex Curb Guard 10620029 or Equal  NO BID  $                     36.70  NO BID  NO BID 

Through-Hardened Motor Grader 5/8" x 8 Bolt & Hole 
Punch - 5 FT 76006-361646  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
   FOB Fargo District 20  $      58.25  $        1,165.00 
   FOB Any NDDOT District  $               58.25 

Through-Hardened Motor Grader 5/8" x 8 Bolt & Hole 
Punch - 6 FT 76006-361653  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
   FOB Any NDDOT District  $               69.91 

Kueper Premium Carbide Snowplow Blade ECOFLEX / POLARFLEX -VALLEY BLADES LIMITED

VALLEY BLADES LTDKueper North America NORMONT EQUIPMENT CO.

BLACK CAT

IRONHAWK INDUSTRIAL DISTRIBUTION, LLC

IRONHAWK LAKE EFFECT
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Through-Hardened Motor Grader 5/8" x 8 Bolt & Hole 
Punch - 7 FT 76006-361778  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
   FOB Fargo District 60  $      81.65  $        4,899.00 
   FOB Any NDDOT District  $               81.65 

Through-Hardened Motor Grader 5/8" x 8 Bolt & Hole 
Punch - 8 FT 76006-361786  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
   FOB Any NDDOT District  $               93.22 

Through-Hardened Motor Grader 1/2" x 8 Bolt & Hole 
Punch - 6 FT - 6 FT 11" 76006-361661  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
   FOB Any NDDOT District  $               59.43 

Through-Hardened Motor Grader 1/2" x 8 Bolt & Hole 
Punch - 7 FT - 7 FT 11" 76006-361752  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
   FOB Any NDDOT District  $               69.33 

Through-Hardened Motor Grader 1/2" x 8 Bolt & Hole 
Punch - 8 FT - 8 FT 11" 76006-361794  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
   FOB Any NDDOT District  $               79.25 

Premium Sectional Tungsten Carbide Tipped Cutting 
Edges Snowplow and Underbody Scraper - 3 FT 76006-366505  NO BID 

   FOB Valley City District 200  $     188.40  $      37,680.00  $    131.52  $      26,304.00 
 $407.63 - Initial*
$298.64 - Repl.**  $     81,526.00 

   FOB Any NDDOT District  $                   195.00  $             131.52 
 $407.63 - Initial*
$298.64 - Repl.** 

Premium Sectional Tungsten Carbide Tipped Cutting 
Edges Snowplow and Underbody Scraper - 4 FT 76006-366510  NO BID 

   FOB Valley City District 400  $     251.20  $    100,480.00  $    175.36  $      70,144.00 
 $584.19 - Initial*
$388.87 - Repl.**  $   233,676.00 

   FOB Any NDDOT District  $                   260.00  $             175.36 
 $584.19 - Initial*
$298.64 - Repl.** 

Kris Engineering and NorMont Equipment Co - Black Cat does not meet specification for Premium Sectional Tungsten Carbide Tipped  Cutting Edges and Underbody Scraper - This item rejected.

MUST specify Front Plows or Underbody Plows 
when ordering

*Initial order blades include Urethane backer, carbide 
blade, clamp bar & hardware

IRONHAWK INDUSTRIAL DISTRIBUTION, LLCNORMONT EQUIPMENT CO.

Valk Manufacturing Company - NO BID 

Chemung Supply - Rejected-Bid received after bid opening date/time.

Kueper North America VALLEY BLADES LTD

**Replacement blades=Ice-O-Force carbide blade 
ONLY. Urethane & Clamp bars are reusable
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