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 BID#
96872/98826-13-050                       

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RATE PER HOUR RATE PER WEEK BIS VC DL MIN DIC GFK WIL FGO

BARANKO BROS. INC. $150.00 $140.00 $155.00 $140.00 $350.00 $140.00 YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES

Equipment

$150.00 $140.00 $148.00 $140.00 $350.00 $140.00

Equipment

$160.00 $140.00 $170.00 $140.00

Equipment

$160.00 $140.00

Equipment

CLOSE CONST. CO., INC. $175.00 $175.00 $125.00 $125.00 $105.00 $105.00 $175.00 $175.00 $21.50 $720.00 YES YES YES YES

Equipment

$140.00 $140.00 $125.00 $125.00 $175.00 $175.00

Equipment

$145.00 $145.00 $125.00 $125.00 $175.00 $175.00

Equipment

$135.00 $135.00 $125.00 $125.00 $155.00 $155.00

Equipment

$145.00 $145.00

Equipment

$145.00 $145.00

Equipment

$125.00 $125.00

Equipment

Buyer: 
Marilyn Langehaug

Item(s):  
Contractor Operated EquipmentSnow & Flood

NO BID

TRACTOR BACKHOEMOTOR GRADER

WA380 KOMATSU LOADER 
W/ SNOW BLOWER
DICKINSON

NO BID

1998 D6M-LGP CATERPILLAR
FACTORY 6 WAY BLADE
34" SHOES
DICKINSON

NO BID

2010 D65 PX 16 KOMATSU
30" PAD DOZER W/ BLADE
DICKINSON

2001 D8R CATERPILLAR
DEVILS LAKE

2006 D6N CATERPILLAR
DEVILS LAKE

2004 D6R CATERPILLAR
DEVILS LAKE

1999 D5M CATERPILLAR
DEVILS LAKE

2003 160H CATERPILLAR (2 UNITS)
W/ BLADE
DEVILS LAKE

1998 143H CATERPILLAR (2 UNITS)
W/ BLADE
DEVILS LAKE

1998 140H CATERPILLAR
W/ BLADE
DEVILS LAKE

2004 CAT 420D (15 FT)
DEVILS LAKE

2008 345-DL CATERPILLAR
DEVILS LAKE

2007 345-CL CATERPILLAR
DEVILS LAKE

2002 345-BL II CATERPILLAR
DEVILS LAKE

2005 330-CL CATERPILLAR (2 UNITS)
DEVILS LAKE

2001 325-CL CATERPILLAR (2 UNITS)
DEVILS LAKE

2001 320-CL CATERPILLAR (2 UNITS)
DEVILS LAKE

2002 315-CL CATERPILLAR
DEVILS LAKE

WATER PUMP

2007 WA430-6 KOMATSU AWD LOADER  
W/ FRONT MOUNT SNOW BLOWER
DICKINSON

GLENN BARANKO
PO BOX 820
DICKINSON, ND 58602
701-483-5868
Fax: 701-483-5960
glenn@barankoinc.com

2002 163H CATERPILLAR
W/ WING & PLOW
DICKINSON

1983 140 CATERPILLAR
W/ WING & PLOW
DICKINSON

NO BID

DOZER UNIT 
TRACTOR

With DOZER BLADE
AWD PAY-LOADER

with SNOW BLOWER
DISTRICT PREFERENCE

BIDDER CONTACT INFORMATION

1995 D65 PX 12 KOMATSU
WIDE PAD DOZER W/ BLADE
DICKINSON

NO BID

1985-1997 GORMAN RUPP
6" DIESEL
(4 UNITS)
(All rates w/o fuel, $2,200/Mth)

Pumps have 25' suction and 100' 
discharge hose.
DEVILS LAKE & MILTON

2010 140M CATERPILLAR
W/ BLADE
DEVILS LAKE

NO BID

BIDDER NAME

Opening Date & Time: 
August 20, 2013; 2:00 p.m. Central

2013 D65 WX 17 KOMATSU
WIDE PAD DOZER W/ BLADE
DICKINSON

EXCAVATOR

2013 872 GP JOHN DEERE
W/ WING & PLOW
DICKINSON

GREG CLOSE
311 2ND ST N
MILTON, ND 58260-6019
Cell: 701-739-1000
701-496-3200
Fax: 701-496-3560
rwccci@utma.com



SUMMARY OF BIDS ND DEPT OF TRANSPORTATION PROCUREMENT/FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT
BISMARCK ND 58505-0700

F:\PROCURE\SERVICES\CONTRACTED OPERATORS - FLOOD & SNOW\2013 - 2014 Season\Bid Summary Snow-Flood 082013.xlsx, September 12, 2012
ITB 96872/98826-13-050, CONTRACTOR OPERATED EQUIPMENT

PAGE 2 OF 4

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RATE PER HOUR RATE PER WEEK BIS VC DL MIN DIC GFK WIL FGO

TRACTOR BACKHOEMOTOR GRADER WATER PUMPDOZER UNIT 
TRACTOR

With DOZER BLADE
AWD PAY-LOADER

with SNOW BLOWER
DISTRICT PREFERENCE

BIDDER CONTACT INFORMATION
BIDDER NAME

EXCAVATOR

EXCAVATING INC. $170.00 $130.00 $160.00 $130.00 YES

Equipment

$170.00 $130.00 $180.00 $130.00

Equipment

$215.00 $130.00

Equipment

GOWAN CONST. $154.00 $165.00 $131.00 $165.00 $165.00 $165.00 $120.00 $165.00 $215.00 $165.00 $35.00 $1,500.00 YES YES YES YES YES

Equipment

$154.00 $165.00 $131.00 $165.00 $140.00 $165.00 $215.00 $165.00 $35.00 $1,500.00

Equipment

$166.00 $165.00 $131.00 $165.00 $140.00 $165.00 $190.00 $165.00 $125.00 $5,750.00

Equipment

$179.00 $165.00 $155.00 $165.00 $140.00 $165.00 $190.00 $165.00

Equipment

$179.00 $165.00 $155.00 $165.00 $140.00 $165.00 $190.00 $165.00

Equipment

$155.00 $165.00 $140.00 $165.00 $200.00 $165.00

Equipment

$155.00 $165.00 $140.00 $165.00

Equipment

$120.00 $165.00

Equipment

1993 140 G CATERPILLAR
SHEYENNE & GRAND FORKS

1989 980C CATERPILLAR
GRAND FORKS

1997 416C CATERPILLAR
GRAND FORKS

1999 345-BL CATERPILLAR
SHEYENNE & GRAND FORKS

1997 T6H3-B GORMAN RUPP
GRAND FORKS

1991 140 G CATERPILLAR
SHEYENNE & GRAND FORKS

1996 950F CATERPILLAR
SHEYENNE & GRAND FORKS

2005 345-BL CATERPILLAR
SHEYENNE & GRAND FORKS

2005 T6A3S-B GORMAN RUPP
GRAND FORKS

1998 D5M CATERPILLAR
11' LGP
GRAND FORKS

1991 140 G CATERPILLAR
GRAND FORKS

2003 WA400 KOMATSU 
NO SNOW BLOWER
SHEYENNE & GRAND FORKS

1994 330-L CATERPILLAR
GRAND FORKS

2007 CRISAFULLI PUMP
16" W/TRACTOR
GRAND FORKS

MILTON GOWAN
PO BOX 228
OSLO, MN 56744
701-699-5171
Fax: 701-699-3400
milt@gowanconstruction.com

1990 D4H CATERPILLAR
10' LGP
SHEYENNE & GRAND FORKS

1997 D6M CATERPILLAR
11' LGP
GRAND FORKS

2007 WA400 KOMATSU 
NO SNOW BLOWER
GRAND FORKS

1997 330-BL CATERPILLAR
SHEYENNE & GRAND FORKS

1998 D6M CATERPILLAR
11' LGP
SHEYENNE

1996 160 H CATERPILLAR
SHEYENNE & GRAND FORKS

2007 WA430-6 KOMATSU
GRAND FORKS

2007 330-DL CATERPILLAR
GRAND FORKS

1997 160 H CATERPILLAR
GRAND FORKS

2002 950G CATERPILLAR
SHEYENNE & GRAND FORKS

1997 163H CATERPILLAR
AWD
GRAND FORKS

1997 D6R IG CATERPILLAR
WIDE PAD, 175 HP, 43,500 LB
(Plus over width permit)

2012 650K JOHN DEERE LGP
100 HP, 21,000 LBS
MINOT

NO BID

1985 WA400 KOMATSU
GRAND FORKS

1998 330-BL CATERPILLAR
GRAND FORKS

1998 924F CATERPILLAR
GRAND FORKS

1994 D4H CATERPILLAR
10' LGP
SHEYENNE & GRAND FORKS

NO BID

2003 318-CL CATERPILLAR
43,000 LBS, 48" BUCKET
MINOT

NO BID

NO BID
2005 650J JOHN DEERE
LGP, 100 HP, 21,000 LB
MINOT

NO BID NO BID

2003 143 H CATERPILLAR
AWD
SHEYENNE & GRAND FORKS

NO BID

NO BID

JEFF ANDERSON
5820 HWY 2 EAST
MINOT, ND 58701-8223
701-839-1817
Fax: 701-852-4257
jeff@excavatinginc.com

2007 240-DLC JOHN DEERE
55,000 LBS, 48" BUCKET OR JRB 
GRAPPLE
(Plus over width permit)

NO BID NO BID NO BID
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RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RATE PER HOUR RATE PER WEEK BIS VC DL MIN DIC GFK WIL FGO

TRACTOR BACKHOEMOTOR GRADER WATER PUMPDOZER UNIT 
TRACTOR

With DOZER BLADE
AWD PAY-LOADER

with SNOW BLOWER
DISTRICT PREFERENCE

BIDDER CONTACT INFORMATION
BIDDER NAME

EXCAVATOR

GUTHMILLER & SON DIRTWORKS, INC. $310.00 $310.00 $170.00 $240.00 $285.00 $310.00 $115.00 $235.00 $265.00 $240.00 $85.00 $385.00 YES YES

Equipment

$205.00 $310.00 $170.00 $240.00 $255.00 $310.00

Equipment

INDUSTRIAL BUILDERS, INC. $170.00 $140.00 $140.00 $140.00 $235.00 $140.00 $110.00 $140.00 $150.00 $140.00 N/A $900.00 YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES

Equipment 

$150.00 $140.00 $110.00 $140.00 $159.00 $140.00 N/A $700.00

Equipment

$110.00 $140.00 $175.00 $140.00 N/A $700.00

Equipment

$210.00 $140.00

Equipment

K & H ELECTRIC INC. $220.00 $250.00 $115.00 $135.00 $185.00 $250.00 YES YES YES YES YES YES

Equipment

$185.00 $250.00

Equipment

Equipment

1995, 2006 & 2008
D&D HYDRAULIC
4" SUBMERSIBLE 30 - 50 HP
WEST FARGO

NO BID

(4 Units) 2002 - 2008
PC-300 KOMATSU
246 HP, 2 CY, 39' REACH
WEST FARGO

MISC. GORMAN RUPP TOWABLE
4"-6"
WEST FARGO

1995 675D FORD
16' REACH, 5/8 CY
WEST FARGO

1996 416B CATERPILLAR
18.16' REACH, 5/8 CY
WEST FARGO

1998 PC-300-LC KOMATSU
58" BUCKET
BISMARCK

BRIGGS & STRATTON 10"
BISMARCK

1963 D9G CATERPILLAR
12' SU BLADE, 30" TRACKS
BISMARCK

1990 740A CHAMPION
BISMARCK

2011 D65 PX-16 KOMATSU LGP
ALLIED H6H WINCH, 30" 
13'2" 6-WAY BLADE
LINTON

2002 DSM LGP CATERPILLAR
11' BLADE, 30" TRACKS
BISMARCK

(3 UNITS) 2013 420F CATERPILLAR
17'11" REACH
LINTON

2006 L90E VOLVO
1966 SICARD, BM-SNOW BLOWER
WEST FARGO

2005 PC-400 KOMATSU
345 HP, 2.5 CY, 44' REACH
WEST FARGO

1997 580SL CASE
18' REACH 5/8 CY
WEST FARGO

2005 CX-240 CASE
63' LONG REACH HOE
WEST FARGO

(7 Units) 2003 - 2009
PC-200, PC-228 KOMATSU
148 - 168 HP, 1.3 - 1.5 CY
32.5 - 34.5' REACH
WEST FARGO

2008 200-LC HD KOMATSU
HYDRAULIC THUMB
LINTON

1997 416C CATERPILLAR
5.8' LOAD HEIGHT
BISMARCK

2003 THOMPSON ROTARY
8", 1750 GPM 89 HP
WEST FARGO

TRENT GUTHMILLER
3401 MAJESTIC ST
BISMARCK, ND  58504
701-226-1939
Fax: 701-222-0743
guthmillerandsondirtworks@msn.com

NO BID

(2 UNITS) 2004, 2006
650 H JOHN DEERE
6-WAY BLADE, 28" TRACK
WEST FARGO

1989 740A CHAMPION
BISMARCK

NO BID

(2 UNITS) 1999, 2001
140H CATERPILLAR
WEST FARGO

1950 OSHKOSH
BISMARCK

1981 H2218 OSHKOSH
2 STAGE SNOW BLOWER
BISMARCK

ROGER HABERMAN
PO BOX 406
FARGO, ND 58107-0406
701-282-4977
Fax: 701-281-1409
rhaberman@industrialbuilders.com

(3 UNITS) 2000, 2005 & 2007
D65PX-15 KOMATSU
STRAIGHT TILT BLADE
36" TRACK
WEST FARGO

KATHY KRAMER
PO BOX 656
LINTON ND 58552
701-254-4689
701-254-4199
khbek@bektel.com

2011 D85PX-15EO KOMATSU LGP
CARCO 110 WINCH, 36" TRACK
14'4" STRAIGHT TILT BLADE
LINTON

NO BID NO BID NO BID
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RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RATE PER HOUR RATE PER WEEK BIS VC DL MIN DIC GFK WIL FGO

TRACTOR BACKHOEMOTOR GRADER WATER PUMPDOZER UNIT 
TRACTOR

With DOZER BLADE
AWD PAY-LOADER

with SNOW BLOWER
DISTRICT PREFERENCE

BIDDER CONTACT INFORMATION
BIDDER NAME

EXCAVATOR

Edward H. Schwartz Construction, Inc. $161.00 $159.00 $151.00 $159.00 $148.00 $159.00 $175.00 $159.00 $30.00 $2,100.00 YES

Equipment

$183.00 $159.00 $161.00 $159.00 $148.00 $159.00 $187.00 $159.00

Equipment

$298.00 $159.00 $156.00 $159.00 $148.00 $159.00 $187.00 $159.00

Equipment

$298.00 $159.00 $350.00 $159.00 $124.00 $134.00

Equipment
2013 PC-55MR-3 KOMATSU
38 HP, UNIT EXC-60
SW NORTH DAKOTA

2012 D85EX KOMATSU
W/ TRACKS UNIT C-40
SW NORTH DAKOTA

ANY OF THE ABOVE
W/ SNOW WING ATTACHMENT

2012 WA430-6 KOMATSU 
UNIT L-90
SW NORTH DAKOTA

2012 PC-360 KOMATSU
UNIT EXC-50
SW NORTH DAKOTA

2004 PC-220 KOMATSU
UNIT EXC-20
SW NORTH DAKOTA

6" WATER PUMP
UNIT WP-01
SW NORTH DAKOTA

2008 D61EX KOMATSU
W/ TRACKS UNIT C-25
SW NORTH DAKOTA

1986 - 2007 140H CATERPILLAR 
(5 UNITS - P-40,P-50,P-60,P-70,P-80)

NO BID
2009 WA380-6 KOMATSU 
UNIT L-70
SW NORTH DAKOTA

RANDAL SCHWARTZ
PO BOX 160
NEW ENGLAND ND 58647
701-579-4204
Fax: 701-579-4854
ehsc@ndsupernet.com

2012 D155AX KOMATSU
W/ TRACKS UNIT C-50
SW NORTH DAKOTA

ANY OF THE ABOVE
W/ SNOW BLOWER ATTACHMENT

2008 PC-300 KOMATSU
UNIT EXC-30
SW NORTH DAKOTA

NO BID

2007 D65W KOMATSU
W/ TRACKS UNIT C-30
SW NORTH DAKOTA

ANY OF THE ABOVE
W/ V-PLOW ATTACHMENT

2011 WA250 KOMATSU 
UNIT L-80
SW NORTH DAKOTA


	BID SUMMARY

