
BID # 840-84-12-050
CAMERA SITE MATERIALS

N.D. DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION
SUMMARY OF BIDS

July 6, 2012; 2:00 P.M.
Marilyn Langehaug

F:\PROCURE\CAMERAS\Camera Sites, Materials Only\2014\840-84-12-050 BID SUM revised.xls; Page 1 of 2

Vendor: Great Plains Towers, Inc.
Item Description Qty. Unit Price

1 Illuminator  1 - 5 No Bid
   6 - 10 No Bid

 11 - 15 No Bid
 16 - 20 No Bid

   21 > No Bid

2 30' Hinged Metal Pole  1 - 5 $2,900.00
   6 - 10 $2,900.00

 11 - 15 $2,800.00
 16 - 20 $2,800.00

   21 > $2,700.00
GPT HMP

3 40' Hinged Metal Pole  1 - 5 $3,900.00
   6 - 10 $3,900.00

 11 - 15 $3,800.00
 16 - 20 $3,800.00

   21 > $3,700.00
GPT HMP

4 50' Hinged Metal Pole  1 - 5 $4,900.00
   6 - 10 $4,900.00

 11 - 15 $4,800.00
 16 - 20 $4,800.00

   21 > $4,700.00
GPT HMP

5 30' Hinged Truss Tower  1 - 5 No Bid
   6 - 10 No Bid

 11 - 15 No Bid
 16 - 20 No Bid

   21 > No Bid

6 CCTV Pole Cabinet  1 - 5 No Bid
   6 - 10 No Bid

 11 - 15 No Bid
 16 - 20 No Bid

   21 > No Bid
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7 Rack Mntd. Fiber Optic Term. Panel  1 - 5 No Bid
   6 - 10 No Bid

 11 - 15 No Bid
 16 - 20 No Bid

   21 > No Bid

8 Rack Mntd. Outlet Strip  1 - 5 No Bid
   6 - 10 No Bid

 11 - 15 No Bid
 16 - 20 No Bid

   21 > No Bid
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