
BID#

745-65/68-20-050

BIDDER NAME

Fibrecrete (Grey 

Color) or Approved 

Equal/POUND

Bulking Stone or 

Approved 

Equal/POUND

Topping Stone or 

Approved 

Equal/POUND

Primer or Approved 

Equal/GALLON

Fibrecrete (Grey 

Color) or Approved 

Equal with Application 

Equipment

FOB Any 

NDDOT 

District/TRUC

KLOAD

Additional 

NDDOT District 

Drops Per 

Truck 

Load/DROP

Swanston Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Fibrecrete 

Preservation 

Technologies, Inc $1.25 $0.30 $0.38 $40.00 No Bid $3,100.00 $500.00

Brock White No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Midstates Equipment 

& Supply, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BID OPENING: 

06/11/2020 @ 2:00 PM CST

ITEMS: 

Mastic Products and Equipment Rentals

BUYER: 

Sean Lackner

Fibrecrete Preservation Technologies Concrete Repair Products 

Maximum Number NDDOT District Drops Per Tuckload     8

Maximum Truckload Capacity (Pounds):      42,500



BIDDER NAME

Samiscreed (Black 

Color) or Approved 

Equal product 

only/POUND

Samiscreed 

(Black Color) or 

Approved Equal 

Includes 

Application 

Equipment/POU

ND

FOB Any NDDOT 

District/TRUCKLO

AD

Additional NDDOT 

District Drops Per 

Truck Load/DROP

Swanston Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Fibrecrete 

Preservation 

Technologies, Inc $0.50 No Bid $3,100.00 $500.00

Brock White

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Midstates Equipment 

& Supply, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Fibrecrete Preservation Technologies Asphalt Pavement Repair Products

Maximum Number NDDOT District Drops Per Truckload   8

Maximum Truckload Capacity (Pounds):   43,000



BIDDER NAME Crafco Asphalt Pavement Repair Products

Mastic One or 

Approved 

Equal/POUND

Mastic One or 

Approved Equal 

Includes 

Application 

Equipment/POU

ND

FOB Any NDDOT 

District/TRUCKLO

AD

Additional NDDOT 

District Drops Per 

Truck Load/DROP

Swanston Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Fibrecrete 

Preservation 

Technologies, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brock White

$0.58 $0.79 $0.00 $200.00

Maximum Number NDDOT District Drops Per Truckload:  2

Maximum Truckload Capacity (Pounds):  46,200

Midstates Equipment 

& Supply, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



BIDDER NAME Maxwell Products Asphalt Pavement Repair Products

Gap Mastic Mod 201 

or Approved Equal - 

Product Only/POUND

Gap Patch 330 or 

Approved 

Equal/POUND

Gap Primer or 

Approved 

Equal/GALLON

Gap Mastic Mod 201 

or Approved Equal 

includes Application 

Equipment

Gap Patch 330 or 

Approved Equal / 

Includes Application 

Equipment

FOB Any 

NDDOT 

District/ 

TRUCKLOAD

Additional 

NDDOT District 

Drops Per 

Truck 

Load/DROP

Swanston Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Fibrecrete 

Preservation 

Technologies, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brock White No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Midstates Equipment 

& Supply, Inc

0.60 (truckload 

pricing)

0.53(truckload 

pricing) $40.95 No Bid No Bid $0.00 $150.00

Maximum Number NDDOT District Drops Per Truckload: 3 ($150.00/stop x 3 = $450.00)

Maximum Truckload Capacity (Pounds): Estimated $46,500



BIDDER NAME

Techcrete "R" 

(smaller stone for 

shallow patches less 

than 2" deep) or 

Techcrete TBR (for 

patches deeper than 

2")/POUND

Bulking Stone 50 

Lb Bag/POUND

Topping Stone 50 

Lb Bag /POUND

Primer Water Based 

in 5 gallon 

bucket/GALLON

Techcrete R or 

Techcrete TBR with 

Application 

Equipment

FOB Any 

NDDOT 

District/TRUC

KLOAD

Additional 

NDDOT District 

Drops Per 

Truck 

Load/DROP

Swanston Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Fibrecrete 

Preservation 

Technologies, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brock White 50 LB Bag 50 LB Bag

$1.23 $0.50 $0.60 $32.50 $1.85 $0.00 $200.00

Midstates Equipment 

& Supply, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Crafco Techcrete Concrete Repair Product

Maximum Number NDDOT District Drops Per Tuckload     2

Maximum Truckload Capacity (Pounds):      44,000



BIDDER NAME

Cimline C1 150 Gallon 

Mastic Mixer or 

Approved Equal / 

MONTH

Crafco 200 

Gallon Mastic 

Mixer or 

Approved Equal / 

MONTH

Marathon 250 

Gallon Mastic 

Mixer or 

Approved Equal / 

MONTH

Marathon 350 Gallon 

Mastic Mixer or 

Approved Equal / 

MONTH

Wheeled Hot Mastic 

Applicator / MONTH

Swanston Equipment $6,500.00 No Bid $6,000.00 $6,500.00 No Bid

Fibrecrete 

Preservation 

Technologies, Inc No Bid No Bid $6,000.00 $7,000.00 $500.00

Brock White

No Bid $6,200.00

2500 per month min 

3 month

Midstates Equipment 

& Supply, Inc No Bid No Bid $6,995.00 $7,695.00 No Bid

Flat iron and boxes can be determined upon rental. Equipment rental is determined by availability in 

Also available: Flat Iron = $55; Scraper = $35

Also available: Scraper; 6" Iron; Clean Out; 14" Box

**If Marathon melters are rented from Midstates Equipt. it is required that Maxwell Products, 

purchased from Midstates Equipment & Supply Inc., only be used in the rental melters.**

Included with Rental: 

1-6" Box

1-10" Box

1-18" Box

1-24 Box

4-Flat Irons

Midstates will supply oil, grease, and filters at no charge. Grease daily and change oil and filters every 

100 hours.

Mastic Mixer & Wheeled Hot Mastic Applicator Rental


