
BID SUMMARY - CUTTING EDGES - ITB 760-06-13-050 Bid Opening July 29, 2013; 2:00 p.m.
Buyer: Marilyn Langehaug
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Item Part Number Description Pg. Bid Price Reorder Price Bid Price Reorder Price Bid Price Reorder Price Bid Price Reorder Price

Brand Name/Manufacturer

1 Tungsten/Carbide Snowplow 5"H 76006-365597 3 FT 8  $           72.79  $           72.79  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

2 Tungsten/Carbide Snowplow 5"H 76006-365662 4 FT 8  $           71.93  $           71.93  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

3 Delivery Days ARO 30-45 45

4 Minimum reorder quantity - LF 100 LF

5 Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 5"H 76006-366009
3 FT

5/8" Hole 9  $           73.21  $           73.21  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

6 Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 5"H 76006-366009
3 FT

3/4" Hole 9  $           73.47  $           73.47  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

7 Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 5"H 76006-366108
4 FT

5/8" Hole 9  $           73.62  $           73.62  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

8 Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 5"H 76006-366108
4 FT

3/4" Hole 9  $           72.40  $           72.40  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

9 Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 5"H 76006-366157 5 FT 9  $           74.26  $           74.26  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

10 Delivery Days ARO 45 45

11 Minimum reorder quantity - LF 100 LF

12 Tungsten Motor Grader 8"H 76006-361604
3 FT

5/8" Hole 10  $           77.85  $           77.85  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

13 Tungsten Motor Grader 8"H 76006-361604
3 FT

3/4" Hole 10  $           76.00  $           76.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

14 Tungsten Motor Grader 8"H 76006-361638
4 FT

5/8" Hole 10  $           76.85  $           76.85  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

15 Tungsten Motor Grader 8"H 76006-361638
4 FT

3/4" Hole 10  $           76.85  $           76.85  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

16 Delivery Days ARO 45 45

17 Minimum reorder quantity - LF 100 LF

18 Thru-Hardened Vee Snowplow 76006-368005 5 FT 11  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

19 Thru-Hardened Vee Snowplow 76006-368104 6 FT 11  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

20 Thru-Hardened Vee Snowplow 76006-368153 7 FT 11  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

21 Delivery Days ARO

22 Minimum order quantity - LF

IRONHAWK INDUST. DIST. 
(EQUIP. EXPRESS)

KENNAMETAL INC.
WINTER EQUIPMENT 

COMPANY IRONHAWK INDUST. DIST. 

WINTER EQUIPMENT 
COMPANYKENNAMETAL INC.

KUEPER NORTH 
AMERICA LLC

KUEPER NORTH 
AMERICA LLC
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23 Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 76006-653693
3 FT
I.C.E. 14  $           73.96  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

24 Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 76006-654894
4 FT
I.C.E. 14  $           73.96  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

25 Delivery Days ARO 45

26 Minimum order quantity - LF 100 LF

27 Curb Guard - L - 3556530 (5/8); 5528929 (3/4) I.C.E. 14  $         245.15  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

28 Curb Guard - R - 3556530 (5/8); 5528929 (3/4) I.C.E. 14  $         245.15  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

29 Delivery Days ARO 45

30 Minimum order quantity - LF 10 EA

31 Curb Guard Standard - L A1,P2  $         245.15  No Bid  PC6312KL  $         103.55  BP126CL  $         143.70 

32 Curb Guard Standard - R A1,P2  $         245.15  No Bid  PS6312KR  $         103.55  BP126CR  $         143.70 

33 Delivery Days ARO 45 10 - 15 14 - 21

34 Minimum order quantity - LF No Freight No Minimum 10 EA

35 (Alter.) PS6412k  $           85.50 STRAIGHT  $         116.48 

36 (Alter.) CR463U  $           68.61 

37 TUCA SX 34855836X 76006-369155 3 FT A2,P2  No Bid  No Bid  $         550.50  No Bid  No Bid 

38 TUCA SX 34855936X 76006-369177 4 FT A2,P2  No Bid  No Bid  $         734.00  No Bid  No Bid 

39 Delivery Days ARO 10

40 Minimum order quantity - LF 20 LF

41 TUCA SX UB 3485583TX 3 FT A2,P2  No Bid  No Bid  $         550.50  No Bid  No Bid 

42 TUCA SX UB 3485593TX 4 FT A2,P2  No Bid  No Bid  $         734.00  No Bid  No Bid 

43 TUCA SX UB 3485603TX 5 FT A2,P2  No Bid  No Bid  $         917.50  No Bid  No Bid 

44 TUCA SX UB 3485653TX 6 FT A2,P2  No Bid  No Bid  $      1,101.00  No Bid  No Bid 

45 Delivery Days ARO 10

46 Minimum order quantity - LF 20 LF

47 Amendment 1 Returned? Yes Yes Yes Yes

48 Amendment 2 Returned? Yes Yes Yes Yes

49 Amendment 3 Returned? Yes Yes Yes Yes

50 If a restocking fee applies, indicate the percentage 0% 0% 0% 0%

51 Bids submitted by Valk Manufacturing Company, Titan Machinery, Bismarck, ND and Titan Machinery, Fargo, ND are rejected as non-responsive to the requirements of the solicitation.
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