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ND DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 
SUMMARY OF BIDS  

 

BID NO: 020-89-22-050 OPENING: November 30, 2022; 2:00 PM COMMODITY: Agricultural Tractor, 120 HP BUYER: Vanessa Brosten 

 

DESCRIPTION QTY 
UOM 

Northern Plains 
Equipment 

Mandan, ND 
True North Equipment 

Grafton, ND 
Leading Edge Equipment 

Devils Lake, ND 
Titan Machinery 
Jamestown, ND 

RDO Equipment Co on 
behalf of John Deere 

Fargo, ND 

RDO Equipment Co on 
behalf of John Deere 

Fargo, ND 

120 PTO HP Front Wheel Assist Tractor with 
Loader + Front PTO Loader per SSP-76-280-4 

   Tractor Make/Model 
   Loader Make/Model 

Tire Size FR/Rear 
 
 

 

 
Case IH Puma 150 CVX 
Case IH L106-repl. L765 
540/65R38 / 650/65R38 
Delivery ARO: 4th ¼ 2023 
to 1st ¼ 2024 
 

John Deere 6R 155 
John Deere 640R 
540/65R28 / 650/65R38 
Delivery ARO 250 Days  

John Deere 6R155 
John Deere640R 
540/65R28 / 650/65R38 
Delivery ARO 300 Days 

CASE IH PUMA 150 CUX 
CASE IH L106 
540/65R28 / 650/65R38 R1W 
Delivery ARO 545 Days 

John Deere 6R 155 
John Deere 640R 
650/65R38 / 540/65R28 
Delivery ARO 240 Days 
 
DOES NOT MEET SPEC 
NOTED BELOW 

John Deere 6R 145 
John Deere 640R 
650/65R38 / 540/65R28 
Delivery ARO 240 Days 
NOT ON QUALIFIED 
PRODUCT LIST 
DOES NOT MEET SPEC 
NOTED BELOW 

ITEM 1 – FOB Bismarck 1 EA $212,933.33 NO BID NO BID NO BID $208,206.30 $203,845.48 

ITEM 2 – FOB Valley City 1 EA $214,508.33 NO BID NO BID $219,500.00 $208,206.30 $203,845.48 

ITEM 3 – FOB Devils Lake 1 EA $214,854.83 NO BID $216,500.00 NO BID $208,206.30 $203,845.48 

ITEM 4 – FOB Grand Forks 2 EA $214,768.33 
($431,536.66) 

$250,807.90 
($501,615.80) 

$231,500.00 
($463,000.00) NO BID $208,206.30 

($416,412.60) 
$203,845.48 
(407,690.96) 

ITEM 5 – FOB Dickinson 1 EA $213,983.33 NO BID NO BID NO BID $208,206.30 $203,845.48 

ITEM 6 – FOB Williston 1 EA $215,343.33 NO BID NO BID NO BID $208,206.30 $203,845.48 

ITEM 7 – FOB Fargo 1 EA $215,033.33 NO BID NO BID NO BID $208,206.30 $203,845.48 

ITEM 8 OPT 1 - Filter Package  1 
SET $926.68 $1,049.04 $1,223.36 $735.03 0 0 

ITEM 9, OPT 2 – 120 PTO HP, FWA W/Loader, 
to Bismarck through 
November 30, 2023. 

1 EA $229,967.99 $253,807.90 $256,500.00 $230,500.00 NO BID NO BID 

ITEM 10, OPT 3 – Equip tractor with Nokian TRI 
2, Turf Type tires/tractor 
(4 tires) 

1 EA $14,050.00 $3,354.41 $3,999.00 $18,000.00 NO BID NO BID 

ITEM 11, OPT 4 – Trade-In New Holland tM30 
w/Miller Loader  

                                             DEDUCT: 
1 EA $31,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $40,000.00 $40,000.00 

ITEM 12 OPT 5 – Trade-In Challenger MT545B 
CVT w/Loader 

                                             DEDUCT: 
1 EA $38,100.00 NO BID $40,000.00 NO BID $44,000.00 $44,000.00 

ITEM 13 OPT 6 – Trade-In Challenger MT545B 
CVT w/Loader 

DEDUCT: 
1 EA $29,100.00 $31,625.00 $30,000.00  $15,000.00 $15,000.00 

ITEM 14 OPT 7 – Trade-In Challenger MT545B 
CVT w/Loader 

DEDUCT: 
1 EA $38,775.00 $2,000.00 $20,000.00  $41,250.00 $41,250.00 

ITEM 15 OPT 8 – Trade-In Challenger MT545B 
CVT w/Loader 

DEDUCT: 
1 EA $30,900.00 NO BID NO BID  $35,000.00 $35,000.00 

ITEM 16 OPT 9 – Trade-In Challenger MT545B 
CVT w/Loader 

DEDUCT: 
1 EA $35,400.00 NO BID NO BID  $40,000.00 $40,000.00 

Amendment No. 1 returned?  Yes Yes No No Yes Yes 

Amendment No.  2 returned?  Yes Yes No Yes Yes Yes 

Total Items 1-7, Less Trade-In Items $1,514,418.14    
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John Deere 6R 155 
 
Item 9 (a) (iii) - Electric or other positive differential lock, limited slip not accepted,  
Item 17 (d) – Width of bucket must exceed max width of tractor, 102: minimum bucket width required, 
Item 24 (d) – The successful bidder shall be fully responsible for any applicable delivery, pick-up, and site visit costs associated with warranty work throughout the warranty period. 
John Deere 6R 145 
 
Item 1 (b) – Minimum 120 PTO HP ISO rated, meeting US EPA Tier IV FINAL emissions standard, 
Item 9 (a) (iii) - Electric or other positive differential lock, limited slip not accepted,  
Item 17 (d) – Width of bucket must exceed max width of tractor, 102: minimum bucket width required, 
Item 24 (d) – The successful bidder shall be fully responsible for any applicable delivery, pick-up, and site visit costs associated with warranty work throughout the warranty period. 
 


