ND DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BID NO: 975-34-16-050-02 OPENING: February 11, 2016; 2:00pm | COMMODITY: Compact Track Loader, Mini Excavator Rental BUYER: Vanessa Brosten

Bidder: I;eom Make Model Qty Price/Hour Total Price
Bobcat of Fargo
t Track L
Compact Track Loader |, | 541 c 5016 Bobcat | T650/T750 | 14 $40.00 $112,000.00
200 hour minimum
Wheeled Machine in lieu of tracks
200 hour minimum 20pt1 4 $30.00 $24,000.00
All wheel steer machine in lieu of tracks
200 hour minimum 20pt2 1 $50.00 $10,000.00
Compact track excavator | 5| 4155016 Bobcat E85 3 $60.00 $18,000.00
100 hour minimum
North Central Rental & Leasing, LLC-subsidiary of Butler Machinery Company
Compact Track.Lf)ader 1 NO BID 14 NO BID
200 hour minimum
Wheeled Machine in lieu o.f ’Fracks 20pt1 NO BID 4 NO BID
200 hour minimum
All wheel steer machine in lieu qf 'Fracks 20pt 2 NO BID 1 NO BID
200 hour minimum
Compact track excavator .
100 hour minimum 3 Caterpillar 308 E 3 $60 $18,000.00
Ahern Rentals *Does not meet all specs*
Compact Track Loader 1 2015 Kubota OR SVL75 OR 14 $2095.00/28 day cycle + $200 each $352.360.00
200 hour minimum John Deere 323D way for delivery and pickup T
Wheeled Machine in lieu o.f ’Fracks 2 0pt 1 Kubota OR SSV75 OR 4 $1395.00/28 d:?\y cycle + S?OO each $67,360.00
200 hour minimum John Deere 318E/326E way for delivery and pickup
All wheel steer machine in lieu qf 'Fracks 20pt 2 NO BID 1 NO BID
200 hour minimum
Compact track ex.ca.vator 3 5015 Kubota KXO80 3 $2895.00/28 d:?\y cycle + S?OO each $104,620.00
100 hour minimum way for delivery and pickup




ND DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bidder: I::Zm Make Model Quantity Price/Hour Total Price
Machinery Power & Equipment (MP&E)
Compact Track Loader | 2014/2015 CAT 279D 14 $1,100.00/month $184,800.00
200 hour minimum
Wheeled Machine in lieu of tracks
200 hour minimum 20pt1l 4 $1,100.00/month $52,800.00
All wheel steer machine in lieu of Fracks 2 Opt 2 NO BID 1 NO BID
200 hour minimum
Compact track excavator | 4 2014/2015 CAT 308 3 $2,000/month $72,000.00
100 hour minimum




