
BID#
745-65/68-23-050

BIDDER NAME

Fibrecrete (Grey 
Color) or Approved 
Equal - $/POUND

Bulking Stone or 
Approved Equal - 
$/POUND

Topping Stone or 
Approved Equal - 
$/POUND

Primer or Approved 
Equal - $/GALLON

FOB Any NDDOT 
District/TRUCKLOAD

Additional 
NDDOT 
District Drops 
Per Truck 
Load/DROP

Fibrecrete 
Preservation 
Technologies, Inc $1.25 $0.30 $0.50 $45.00 $4,400.00 $500.00

Maximum Number NDDOT District Drops Per Truckload     8
Maximum Truckload Capacity (Pounds):      42,500

Brock White No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Midstates Equipment 
& Supply, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BID OPENING: 
02/22/2023 @ 2:00 PM CST

ITEMS: 
Mastic Products

BUYER: 
Jamie Bostyan

Fibrecrete Preservation Technologies or Approved Equal - Concrete Repair Products 



BIDDER NAME

Samiscreed (Black 
Color) or Approved 
Equal Product - 
$/POUND

FOB Any NDDOT 
District - 
$/TRUCKLOAD

Additional NDDOT 
District Drops Per Truck 
Load - $/DROP

Fibrecrete 
Preservation 
Technologies, Inc $0.55 $4,400.00 $500.00

Maximum Number NDDOT District Drops Per Truckload   8
Maximum Truckload Capacity (Pounds):   43,000

Brock White
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Midstates Equipment 
& Supply, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Fibrecrete Preservation Technologies Asphalt Pavement Repair Products or Approved 
Equal - Asphalt Pavement Repair Products



BIDDER NAME Crafco or Approved Equal - Asphalt Pavement Repair Products
Mastic One or 
Approved Equal - 
$/POUND

FOB Any NDDOT 
District - 
$/TRUCKLOAD

Additional NDDOT 
District Drops Per Truck 
Load - $/DROP

Midstates Equipment 
& Supply, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid

Fibrecrete 
Preservation 
Technologies, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brock White $0.605 $0.605 $100.00
Maximum Number NDDOT District Drops Per Truckload:  2

Maximum Truckload Capacity (Pounds):  46,200



BIDDER NAME

Gap Mastic Mod 201 
or Approved Equal - 
$/POUND

Gap Mastic Mod 202 
or Approved Equal - 
$/POUND

Gap Patch 330 or 
Approved Equal - 
$/POUND

Gap Patch 531 or 
Approved Equal - 
$/POUND

Gap Primer or 
Approved Equal - 
$/GALLON

FOB Any 
NDDOT 
District - $/ 
TRUCKLOAD

Additional 
NDDOT District 
Drops Per 
Truck Load - 
$/DROP

Fibrecrete 
Preservation 
Technologies, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brock White No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Midstates Equipment 
& Supply, Inc

0.672 (truckload 
pricing)

0.676 (truckload 
pricing)

0.625 (truckload 
pricing)

0.682 (truckload 
pricing) 44.95$                           $0.00 $150.00

Maxwell Products or Approved Equal - Asphalt Pavement Repair Products

Maximum Number NDDOT District Drops Per Truckload: 3 ($150.00/stop x 3 = $450.00)
Maximum Truckload Capacity (Pounds): Estimated $46,500
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