BID SUMMARY - CUTTING EDGES - ITB 760-06-19-050

Bid Opening August 6, 2019; 2:00 p.m.
Buyer: Vanessa Brosten

Winter i C y Inc. Valk uring Ca y Kueper North America Valley Blades Limited Normont Ch Supply Corp.
Item Part Number Description Pg. Bid Price Part # Bid Price Part # Bid Price Part # Bid Price Part # Bid Price Part # Bid Price Part #
Black Cat
Brand Name/Manufacturer Black Cat Wear Parts Valk Manufacturing Company Kennametal Valley Blades Limited Kennametal Evolution Edges
1 |Tungsten/Carbide Snowplow 5"H 76006-365597 ST 10 S 62.29 CIAV753644] $ 49.05 S 66.53 42.70 61.95 112.05
2 |Tungsten/Carbide Snowplow 5"H 76006-365662 4FT 10 $ 62.29 CIAV754844] $ 49.05 $ 66.53 42.70 61.95 149.40
3 |Delivery Days ARO 120 45-90 45 75-90 120 30-60
4 |Minimum reorder quantity - LF 3000 500 120 100 LF 1 1300
3FT
5 |Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 5"H 76006-366009 5/8" Hole 11 S 63.88 Clcv753644] S 49.05 S 71.40 42.70 63.50 118.17
3FT
6 |Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 5"H 76006-366009 3/4" Hole 11 $ 63.88 CICV753674] $ 49.05 $ 80.85 42.70 63.50 118.17
4FT
7 |Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 5"H 76006-366108 5/8" Hole 11 $ 63.88 CICV754844] $ 49.05 $ 71.40 42.70 63.50 157.56
4FT
8 |Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 5"H 76006-366108 3/4" Hole 11 $ 63.88 CICV754874] $ 49.05 $ 80.85 42.70 63.50 157.56
9 |Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 5"H 76006-366157 5FT 11 S 63.88 CIcv756044] S 49.05 S 71.40 42.70 63.50 196.95
10 _|Delivery Days ARO 120 45-90 45 75-90 120 30-60
11 [Minimum reorder quantity - LF 3000 500 LF 120 100 LF! 1 1300
3FT
12 [Tungsten Motor Grader 8"H 76006-361604 5/8" Hole 12 S 73.04 MIS-CICV883644] $ 54.30 S 87.15 46.70 72.85 130.17
3FT
13 [Tungsten Motor Grader 8"H 76006-361604 3/4" Hole 12 S 73.04 MIS-CICV883674] $ 54.30 S 87.15 46.70 72.85 130.17
4FT
14 [Tungsten Motor Grader 8"H 76006-361638 5/8" Hole 12 S 73.04 MIS-CIcv8g4844] $ 54.30 S 87.15 46.70 72.85 173.56
4FT
15 [Tungsten Motor Grader 8"H 76006-361638 3/4" Hole 12 S 73.04 MIS-CICV884874) $ 54.30 S 87.15 46.70 72.85 173.56
**Quoting 1" thickness x 8" high as opposed
to 7/8"thickness per spec.
16 |Delivery Days ARO 120 45-90 45 75-90 120 30-60
17 |Minimum reorder quantity - LF 3000 500 120 100 1 1300
Carbon:
$11.73
18 [Thru-Hardened Vee Snowplow 76006-368005 5FT 113 S 12.32 MIS-PBB4806044-A| No Bid $13.88| 13.10 48.60
Carbon:
$11.73
19 [Thru-Hardened Vee Snowplow 76006-368104 6 FT 13 $ 12.32 PBB4807244-A No Bid $13.88! 13.10 58.32
Carbon:
$11.73
20 [Thru-Hardened Vee Snowplow 76006-368153 7FT 113 S 12.32 MIS-PBB4808444-A| No Bid $13.88| 13.10 68.04,
21 |Delivery Days ARO 120 30-45 60-90 45 30-60
22 |Minimum order quantity - LF 0 500 100 1 1500
3FT
23 |Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper I.C.E. 18
24 | Beveled Top Edge-2035932 76006-653693 18 $ 97.19 MIS-CICI753644 No Bid $ 79.50 197.00 93.41 268.38|
25 | Square Top Edge-1553693 18 S 97.19 MIS-CIAI753644 No Bid $ 79.50 197.00 94.00 256.38
4FT
26 |Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 76006-654894 I.C.E. 18
27 | Beveled Top Edge-2035931 18 $ 99.07 MIS-CICI754844 No Bid $ 79.50 197.00 93.44 357.84/
28 | Square Top Edge-1553694 18 S 99.07 MIS-CIAI754844 No Bid $ 79.50 197.00 93.90 341.84/
29 |Delivery Days ARO 120 45! 75-90 30 30-60
30 [Minimum order quantity - LF 3000 100 100 1 1300
31 |Curb Guard - L - 3556530 (5/8) I.C.E. 18 No Bid No Bid $ 197.80 5416583 150.00 **+*V45-50CAL-L| 145.05 **%3390176-KCWB-0578| No Bid
32 5528929 (3/4) No Bid No Bid
33 |Curb Guard - R - 3556530 (5/8) I.C.E. 18 No Bid No Bid $ 197.80 5416583 150.00 **+*V45-50CAL-R| 145.05 ***3390176-KCWB-0578| No Bid
34 5528929 (3/4) No Bid No Bid
35 |Delivery Days ARO 40 90 30
36 _[Minimum order quantity - EA 10 50 1
37 |Curb Guard Standard - L 19 S 155.85 PCC6312KL| $ 79.25 CCB-.75-6L-3-3] $ 100.33 1012592 135.00 V45-HFL-12| No Bid No Bid
38 |Curb Guard Standard - R 19 S 155.85 PCC6312KR] $ 79.25 CCB-.75-6R-3-3] $ 100.33 1012592 135.00 V45-HFR-12| No Bid No Bid
39 |Delivery Days ARO 21 45-70 45 75-90
40 |Minimum order quantity - EA 10 20 40 50 EA
Gauge to be
determined when
41 ordering
42 [TUCA SX 34855836X 76006-369155 ST 14 No Bid No Bid $ 585.00! No Bid No Bid No Bid
43 [TUCA SX 34855936X 76006-369177 4FT 14 No Bid No Bid S 780.00| No Bid No Bid No Bid
44 |Delivery Days ARO 10!
45 |Minimum order quantity - LF 11 LF]
46 [TUCA SX UB 3485583TX ST 15 No Bid No Bid $ 195.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
47 |TUCA SX UB 3485593TX 4FT 15 No Bid No Bid S 195.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
48 [TUCA SX UB 3485603TX 5FT 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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49 [TUCA SX UB 3485653TX 6 FT 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

50 [Delivery Days ARO 10!

51 [Minimum order quantity - LF 11 LF

52 |Amendment 1 Returned? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No

53 |If a restocking fee applies, indicate the percentage 0% N/A 0% 15% N/A N/A

Awarded Item in Red
Valk - Item 18-20 option for Boron $13.32/LF
Normont Equipment, Lines 31 & 33 REJECTED - DO NOT MEET SPECIFICATION

Valley Blades Limited, Lines 31 & 33 REJECTED - DID NOT SUBMIT PRODUCT LITERATURE
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