SUMMARY OF BIDS

ND DEPT OF TRANSPORTATION

PROCUREMENT/FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT

BISMARCK ND 58505-0700

BID# Opening Date & Time: Item(s): Buyer:
975-34-14-050-03 February 25, 2014, 2:00 p.m. Construction Equipment Rental Marilyn Langehaug
*NOT ALL UNITS HAVE BEEN AWARDED DUE TO THE PRICE INCREASE FROM PREVIOUS YEARS.
Butler Machinery Company | Titan Machinery | Hertz Equip. Rental Corp. | United Rentals, Inc.
Description Item |Qty|*Award
MOTOR GRADER (Rate/Hr) 1 9 S 209.00 No Bid| $ 988.56 No Bid
Hourly rate x 100 Annual Hrs. x 1 Unit S 29,000.00 S 98,856.00
Year 2013/2014 2010 or Newer
Make Caterpillar John Deere
Model 140M2 AWD 670CH
Agrees to provide and availability date
Bismarck (1) Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14
Valley City (1) 140M2 Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14
Devils Lake (1) Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14
Minot (1) 140M2 Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14
Dickinson (2) Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14
Grand Forks (1) Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14
Williston (1) Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14
Fargo (1) 140M2 Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14
All or None? (Yes/No) 3 Units No No
AWD ARTICULATED WHEEL LOADER
2 4 | Award | $ 100.00 $45.00| S 501.60| $ 746.00
(Rate/Hr)
Hourly rate x 100 Annual Hrs. x 1 Unit S 10,000.00| $ 4,500.00| $ 50,160.00] $ 74,600.00
Year 2013/2014 2014 2010 or Newer 2011
Make Caterpillar Case Case John Deere
Model 924K 521F, 521FXR, 521FXT 621D 544K - Cab
Agrees to provide and availability date
Valley City (1) 521 Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14 No
Dickinson (1) 521 Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14 No
Williston (2) 521 Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14 No
Fargo (1) 521 Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14
All or None? (Yes/No) 5 Units No Yes No No
TRACTOR BACKHOE (Rate/Hr) 3 | 1 | Award | $ 70.00| $ 30.00| S 239.76 No Bid
Hourly rate x 100 Annual Hrs. x 1 Unit S 7,000.00| $ 3,000.00 $ 23,976.00
Year 2013/2014 2014 2010 or Newer
Make Caterpillar Case John Deere
Model 420F 580 Super N Ax4
Agrees to provide and availability date
Fargo (1) 580N Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14
All or None? (Yes/No) 1 Unit No Yes No
LGP DOZER 150 HP (Rate/Hr) 4 | 6 | Award | $ 170.00| $ 80.00( $ 477.36 No Bid
Hourly rate x 100 Annual Hrs. x 1 Unit S 17,000.00| $ 8,000.00| S 47,736.00
Year 2013/2014 2014 2010 or Newer
Make Caterpillar Case John Deere
Model D6N LGP 1650M 6501
Agrees to provide and availability date
Bismarck (1) 1650M Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14
Devils Lake (1) Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14
Minot (1) Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14
Dickinson (1) Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14
Williston (1) Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14
Grand Forks & Fargo (1) 1650M Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14
All or None? (Yes/No) 2 Units No Yes No
LGP DOZER 125 HP OPTIONAL (Rate/Hr) |5 0PT| | Award | $ 116.00| $ 55.00 $ 477.36 No Bid
Year 2013/2014 2014 2010 or Newer
Make Caterpillar Case John Deere
Model D6K LGP 1150M 650
Bismarck (1) Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14
Devils Lake (1) 1150M Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14
Minot (1) 1150M Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14
Dickinson (1) 1150M Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14
Williston (1) 1150M Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14
Fargo (1) Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14 Yes, 05/01/14
All or None? (Yes/No) 4 Units No Yes No
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