
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BUYER:  SUE EBERLE

 PROCUREMENT/FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT

608 E BLVD AVE

BISMARCK ND  58505-0700

Item

 No. Item & Vendor Qty. Unit Brand Model No. Unit Price Total Price 

Acme Tools 1 Ea. CST/Berger 57-LD400YEL 168.00$     168.00$      

Bierschbach Equipment 1 Ea. CST/Berger 57-LD440G 290.00$     290.00$      

      

Acme Tools 10 Ea. Estwing E44A 39.00$       390.00$      

Bierschbach Equipment 10 Ea. Seco 9070-00 43.45$       434.50$      

       

Acme Tools 2 Ea. Seco 5199-050 14.05$       28.10$        

Bierschbach Equipment 2 Ea. Seco 5199-050 14.45$       28.90$        

      

Acme Tools 2 Ea. Seco 5194-10 64.30$       128.60$      

Bierschbach Equipment 2 Ea. Seco 5194-10 65.98$       131.96$      

      

Acme Tools 1 Ea. Seco 5128-08 241.80$     241.80$      

Bierschbach Equipment 1 Ea. Seco 5128-08 248.15$     248.15$      

      

Acme Tools 10 Ea. Seco 3003-06 8.47$         84.70$        

Bierschbach Equipment 10 Ea. Seco 3003-06 8.72$         87.20$        

      

Acme Tools                                    3 Ea. Seco 5200-150 50.30$       150.90$      

Bierschbach Equipment 3 Ea. Seco 5200-150 51.79$       155.37$      

      

Acme Tools 4 Ea. Seco 90553 268.00$     1,072.00$   

Bierschbach Equipment  4 Ea. Seco 90553 275.60$     1,102.40$   

      

Acme Tools 6 Ea. Krylon K07096 17.00$       102.00$      

Bierschbach Equipment 6 Ea. Seymour 2-606 16.80$       100.80$      

      

Acme Tools   6 Ea. Krylon K7095 15.40$       92.40$        

Bierschbach Equipment 6 Ea. Seymour 2-605 13.80$       82.80$        

      

Acme Tools 6 Ea. Estwing E6-48E 24.75$       148.50$      

Bierschbach Equipment 6 Ea. Jackson 1197000 12.75$       76.50$        

       

Acme Tools 4 Ea. Estwing E44A 39.00$       156.00$      

Bierschbach Equipment 4 Ea. Seco/Estwing 9070-00 43.42$       173.68$      

      

 

Rust Oleum Marking Wand, Survey Supply 239300

Tri-Max Tripod, Seco 90553

100-Ft. Open Reel Fiberglass Tape, Seco 3003-06

GNSS Rover Rod w/Grads., Seco 5128-08

6

7

BID #305-00-15-050                         BID OPENING:  4/8/2015, 2:00 P.M.                       ITEM:  Engineering Equipment

1

2

3

4

5

Center Punch Point, Seco 5194-10

Rotary Laser Detector, CST/Berger LD-400G

Camper Axe with Sheath. Seco 9070-00

ATV Ball Clamp, 5199-050

8

48-Oz. Estwing Engineer's Hammer, Forestry Supply 67243

9

10

Rust Oleum Marking Pistol, Survey Supply 210188

11

12

EstwingAll Steel Camper's Axe with Sheath, Forestry Supply 33054

Claw Series Quick-Release Controller/Collector Crades, Seco 5200-150
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SUMMARY OF BIDS

BUYER:  SUE EBERLE

 PROCUREMENT/FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT

608 E BLVD AVE

BISMARCK ND  58505-0700

Item

 No. Item & Vendor Qty. Unit Brand Model No. Unit Price Total Price 

Acme Tools 3 Ea. Estwing E3-16$ 21.85$       65.55$        

Bierschbach Equipment 3 Ea. NO BID

      

Acme Tools 3 Ea. Estwing E3-20$ 25.00$       75.00$        

Bierschbach Equipment 3 Ea. NO BID

      

Acme Tools 4 Ea. NO BID

Bierschbach Equipment 4 Ea. NO BID

      

Acme Tools 4 Ea. NO BID

Bierschbach Equipment 4 Ea. NO BID

      

Acme Tools 4 Ea. Union 2430900 8.00$         32.00$        

Bierschbach Equipment 4 Ea. Union 2433100 19.25$       77.00$        

      

Acme Tools 1 Ea. Seco 5196-02 121.00$     121.00$      

Bierschbach Equipment 1 Ea. Seco 5196-02 124.05$     124.05$      

       

Acme Tools 2 Set CST/Berger 04-501 17.25$       34.50$        

Bierschbach Equipment 2 Set CST/Berger 04-501 17.40$       34.80$        

      

Acme Tools 1 Ea. Stabila 36572 250.00$     250.00$      

Bierschbach Equipment 1 Ea. NO BID

      

Acme Tools 1 Ea. Stabila 36548 200.00$     200.00$      

Bierschbach Equipment 1 Ea. Stabila 36548 228.30$     228.30$      

       

Acme Tools 9 Ea. CST/Berger 32-400 101.98$     917.82$      

Bierschbach Equipment 9 Ea. Rolotape 32-400 108.70$     978.30$      

      

Acme Tools 7 Ea. CST/Berger 19-550 545.90$     3821.3

Bierschbach Equipment 7 Ea. CST/Berger 19-550 582.35$     4,076.45$   

      

Acme Tools 3 Ea. NO BID

Bierschbach Equipment 3 Ea. Chief NDESK 25.00$       75.00$        

       

15

17

16

BID #305-00-15-050                         BID OPENING:  4/8/2015, 2:00 P.M.                       ITEM:  Engineering Equipment

Mag-Lok Fiberglass Shovel Handle, Forestry Supply 33267

Mag-Lock Fiberglass Shovel Head, Forestry Supply 33274

Spade Shovel, Forestry 33878

14

Estwing Rip Claw Hammer, 20-Oz Head, Forestry Supply 67272

13

Estwing Rip Claw Hammer, 16-Oz. Head, Forestry Supply 67271

Magnetic Locator, Ben Meadow 109235, CST/Berger 19-550

Smart Level, Digital, 48-Inch, Stabila 36548

18

19

20

Tripod Laptop Bracket, Seco 5196-02

Marking Pins, Seco 2183-00

Electronic TECH Level, 72-Inch, Stabila 36948

24

Chief Steering Wheel Desk, NDESK

21

22

23

Measuring Wheel, MP401, Ben Meadow, Keson 134608
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BUYER:  SUE EBERLE
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Acme Tools 4 Ea. Stractron HE-3 10.00$       40.00$        

Bierschbach Equipment 4 Ea. Jackson 1196300 9.87$         39.48$        

      

Acme Tools 13 Ea. Seco 3003-15 8.48$         110.24$      

Bierschbach Equipment 13 Ea. Seco 3003-15 8.72$         113.36$      

      

Acme Tools 3 Ea. Seco 98010 147.40$     442.20$      

Bierschbach Equipment 3 Ea. Seco 98010 151.32$     453.96$      

      

Acme Tools 2 Ea. CST/Berger 78-R251 6.10$         12.20$        

Bierschbach Equipment 2 Ea. CST/Berger 78-R251 5.80$         11.60$        

      

Acme Tools 1 Ea. CST/Berger 20-766 38.00$       38.00$        

Bierschbach Equipment 1 Ea. CST/Berger 20-766 39.98$       39.98$        

       

Acme Tools 2 Ea. Aervoe 245 16.50$       33.00$        

Bierschbach Equipment 2 Ea. Seymour 2-606 16.80$       33.60$        

      

Acme Tools 10 Ea. CST/Berger 20-750 22.15$       221.50$      

Bierschbach Equipment 10 Ea. CST/Berger 20-750 22.70$       227.00$      

       

Acme Tools 5 Ea. Krylon K07096 17.00$       85.00$        

Bierschbach Equipment 5 Ea. Seymour 2-606 16.80$       84.00$        

      

Acme Tools 1 Ea. Seco 2133-03 46.49$       46.49$        

Bierschbach Equipment 1 Ea. Seco 2133-03 47.68$       47.68$        

      

Acme Tools 1 Ea. Seco 5198-059 59.83$       59.83$        

Bierschbach Equipment 1 Ea. Seco 5198-059 61.33$       61.33$        

      

Acme Tools 1 Ea. Seco 5194-007 1.96$         1.96$          

Bierschbach Equipment 1 Ea. Seco 5194-007 2.00$         2.00$          

       

Acme Tools 1 Ea. Seco 5114-40-01 315.98$     315.98$      

Bierschbach Equipment 1 Ea. Seco 5114-40-01 323.49$     323.49$      

      

34

Pole Clamp with 0.15 x 0.92 Inch Slot, Seco 5198-059

35

Dull-Point for Tripod or Prism Pole, Seco 5194-007

BID #305-00-15-050                         BID OPENING:  4/8/2015, 2:00 P.M.                       ITEM:  Engineering Equipment

25-Ft. Heavy-Duty Tape, Seco 4769-02

29

Heavy-Duty Bag, 38-Inch, Seco 8102-01-ORG

30

31

Surveyor's Stake Tacks, CST/Berger 20-750

28

Aervoe Marking Stick, Seco 9020-10

25

26

27

32

36

100-Ft. Open Reel Fiberglass Tape, Seco 3003-15

25-Ft. Rod SVR Oval Road, Seco 98010

33

Antenna Radio Bracket, Seco 2133-03

3-Lb. Engineer Hammer, Forestry 67233

Ouik-Mark Wheel Hand Held Want, Krylon K07096

PT-150 UTV Roll Cage Transporter for GNSS Rods, Seco 5114-40-01
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SUMMARY OF BIDS

BUYER:  SUE EBERLE

 PROCUREMENT/FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT

608 E BLVD AVE

BISMARCK ND  58505-0700

Item

 No. Item & Vendor Qty. Unit Brand Model No. Unit Price Total Price 

Acme Tools 1 Ea. Seco 5128-00 241.98$     241.98$      

Bierschbach Equipment 1 Ea. Seco 5128-00-GT 242.24$     242.24$      

      

Acme Tools 1 Ea. Seco 5194-003 1.96$         1.96$          

Bierschbach Equipment 1 Ea. Seco 5194-003 7.46$         7.46$          

      

Acme Tools 1 Ea. CST Berger 61-4500 BLK 114.00$     114.00$      

Bierschbach Equipment 1 Ea. CST Berger 61-4500 BLK 121.10$     121.10$      

     

Acme Tools 8 Ea. CST Berger 60-WDF20MX 113.50$     908.00$      

Bierschbach Equipment 8 Ea. CST Berger 60-WDF20 121.25$     970.00$      

       

Acme Tools 18 Ea. Lufkin PHV1425D 13.60$       244.80$      

Bierschbach Equipment 18 Ea. USTape 53025 8.65$         155.70$      

Acme Tools 6 Ea. CST Berger 32-415 108.50$     651.00$      

Bierschbach Equipment 6 Ea. CST Berger 32-415 113.20$     679.20$      

Acme Tools 4 Ea. MD 92296 118.00$     472.00$      

Bierschbach Equipment 4 Ea. MD Building Prd 92296 127.89$     511.56$      

Acme Tools 6 Ea. NO BID

Bierschbach Equipment 6 Ea. Seco 98010 151.33$     907.98$      

Acme Tools YES

Bierschbach Equipment NO

44

Sokkia SK Oval-Shaped Level Rod, Forestry 43259 or Equal

25-Ft. Engineering Tape, Forestry 39423

Measuring Wheel, 4-Ft., Disk, Forestry 415 or Equal

42

41

SmartTool Level, Forestry 43774

43

Tribrach with Optical Plummet, Seco 2152-05-BLK

40

Heavy-Duty Wood/Fiberglass Tripod, Seco 37694

37

2-Meter Carbon Fiber Rover Rod, Seco 5128-00 GT

38

Prism Pole Point, Seco 5194-003

39

BID #305-00-15-050                         BID OPENING:  4/8/2015, 2:00 P.M.                       ITEM:  Engineering Equipment

45

Option 1 - RE-ORDER AGREEMENT FOR ITEMS 1 THRU 44 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2015.
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