
F:\PROCURE\SALT & DEICER\LIQUID DEICERS – ALL\CF7\2017 CF7 

ND DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 
SUMMARY OF BIDS  

 
BID NO: 192-46-17-050 OPENING: JUL 28, 2017; 2:00PM COMMODITY: DE-ICER, POTASSIUM ACETATE BUYER: ALEXIS BARNES 

 

 
 
 
 

BIDDER: ITEM NO. QTY. SPECIFICATIONS UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE 

Two Rivers Terminal, LLC. 1 9000 GAL 

 
De-Icer, Potassium Acetate 
FOB: Bismarck, ND 
Delivery Days ARO: 2 
 

$4.60 $41,400.00 

 

2 9000 GAL 

 
De-Icer, Potassium Acetate 
FOB: Hillsboro, ND 
Delivery Days ARO: 2 
 

$4.50 $40,500.00 

3 UNKNOWN 

 
De-Icer: Potassium Acetate 
FOB: Any NDDOT District 
Delivery Days ARO: 2 
 

$3.80 N/A 

General Atomics International 
Services Corp. a.k.a. Cryotech 
Deicing Technology 

1 9000 GAL 

 
De-Icer, Potassium Acetate 
FOB: Bismarck, ND 
Delivery Days ARO: 2 
 

$4.61 $41,490.00 

“*Full truckload orders are shipped 
in approximately 4,200-4,500 
quantities. 
**If CF7 is purchased for districts 
other than Bismarck District or 
Fargo District, the freight will be 
determined at time of purchase.  
Item #3 is base price per gallon 
only; freight charges will be 
additional” 

2 9000 GAL 

 
De-Icer, Potassium Acetate 
FOB: Hillsboro, ND 
Delivery Days ARO: 2 
 

$4.48 $40,320.00 

3 UNKNOWN 

 
De-Icer: Potassium Acetate 
FOB: Any NDDOT District 
Delivery Days ARO: 2 
 

$3.75 N/A 



F:\PROCURE\SALT & DEICER\LIQUID DEICERS – ALL\CF7\2017 CF7 

 

Envirotech Services, Inc. 1 9000 GAL 

 
De-Icer, Potassium Acetate 
FOB: Bismarck, ND 
Delivery Days ARO: 
 

NO BID NO BID 

 

2 9000 GAL 

 
De-Icer, Potassium Acetate 
FOB: Hillsboro, ND 
Delivery Days ARO: 
 

NO BID NO BID 

3 UNKNOWN 

 
De-Icer: Potassium Acetate 
FOB: Any NDDOT District 
Delivery Days ARO: 
 

NO BID NO BID 

Seneca Mineral Company 1 9000 GAL 

 
De-Icer, Potassium Acetate 
FOB: Bismarck, ND 
Delivery Days ARO: 2 with AM order 
 

$4.60 $41,400.00 

*Freight to be determined upon 
receipt of order 

2 9000 GAL 

 
De-Icer, Potassium Acetate 
FOB: Hillsboro, ND 
Delivery Days ARO: 2 with AM order 
 

$4.69 $42,210.00 

3 UNKNOWN 

 
De-Icer: Potassium Acetate 
FOB: Any NDDOT District 
Delivery Days ARO: 2 with AM order 
 

$4.15 N/A 


