BID SUMMARY - CUTTING EDGES - ITB 760-06-16-050

K tal

Kueper North America

Valley Blades Limited

Item Part Number Description | Pg. Bid Price Reorder Price Bid Price Reorder Price Bid Price Reorder Price
Brand Name/Manufacturer Kennametal 785 WPTSB/Valley Blades Limited

1 [Tungsten/Carbide Snowplow 5"H 76006-365597 3FT 10 No Bid No Bid| $ 46.67| S 46.67 43.88| $ 43.88

2 |Tungsten/Carbide Snowplow 5"H 76006-365662 4FT 10 No Bid No Bid| $ 47.43| S 47.43 43.88| $ 43.88

3 |Delivery Days ARO 45 90

4 [Minimum reorder quantity - LF 100 LF 100 LF
3FT

5 [Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 5"H 76006-366009 5/8" Hole 11 No Bid No Bid| $ 53.11| $ 53.11 43.88| $ 43.88
3FT

6 |Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 5"H 76006-366009 3/4" Hole 11 No Bid No Bid| $ 54.67| $ 54.67 43.88| $ 43.88
4FT

7 |Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 5"H 76006-366108 5/8" Hole 11 No Bid No Bid| $ 52.92| $ 52.92 43.88| $ 43.88
4FT

8 |Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 5"H 76006-366108 3/4" Hole 11 No Bid No Bid| $ 66.25 S 66.25 43.88| $ 43.88

9 |Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 5"H 76006-366157 S5FT 11 No Bid No Bid| $ 59.00 $ 59.00 43.88| $ 43.88

10 |Delivery Days ARO 45 90

11 |Minimum reorder quantity - LF 100 LF 100 LF
3FT

12 [Tungsten Motor Grader 8"H 76006-361604 5/8" Hole 12 No Bid No Bid| $ 60.00| $ 60.00 51.88| S 51.88
3FT

13 [Tungsten Motor Grader 8"H 76006-361604 3/4" Hole 12 No Bid No Bid| $ 60.00| $ 60.00 51.88| S 51.88
4FT

14 |Tungsten Motor Grader 8"H 76006-361638 5/8" Hole 12 No Bid No Bid| $ 60.00| $ 60.00 51.88| S 51.88
4FT

15 [Tungsten Motor Grader 8"H 76006-361638 3/4" Hole 12 No Bid No Bid| $ 60.00| $ 60.00 51.88| S 51.88

16 |Delivery Days ARO 45 90

17 |Minimum reorder quantity - LF 100 LF 100 LF
3FT

23 |Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper I.C.E. 18

24 | Beveled Top Edge-2035932 76006-653693 $221.00/Blade $221.00/Blade

25 | Square Top Edge-1553693 $221.00/Blade $221.00/Blade
4FT

26 |Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 76006-654894 I.C.E. 18

27 | Beveled Top Edge-2035931 $295.00/Blade $295.00/Blade

28 | Square Top Edge-1553694 $295.00/Blade $295.00/Blade

29 |Delivery Days ARO 30-45

30 [Minimum order quantity - LF 100 LF

31 [Curb Guard - L - 3556530 (5/8) I.C.E. 18 S 218.72| $ 218.72 No Bid

32 5528929 (3/4) S 218.72| $ 218.72

33 [Curb Guard - R - 3556530 (5/8) I.C.E. 18 S 218.72| $ 218.72 No Bid

34 5528929 (3/4) S 218.72| $ 218.72

35 |Delivery Days ARO 30-45

36 |Minimum order quantity - EA 10 EA
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BID SUMMARY - CUTTING EDGES - ITB 760-06-16-050

Kueper North America K tal Valley Blades Limited
Item Part Number Description | Pg. Bid Price Reorder Price Bid Price Reorder Price Bid Price Reorder Price
Brand Name/Manufacturer Kennametal 785 WPTSB/Valley Blades Limited
$135.48 (5/8) $135.48 (5/8)
37 |Curb Guard Standard - L 19 $135.48 (3/4) $135.48 (3/4) 122.80
$135.48 (5/8) $135.48 (5/8)
38 |Curb Guard Standard - R 19 $135.48 (3/4) $135.48 (3/4) 122.80
39 |Delivery Days ARO 30-45 45
40 |Minimum order quantity - EA 10 EA 50 EA
41
42 |TUCA SX 34855836X 76006-369155 3FT 14 s 567.00 $ 567.00 No Bid No Bid
43 |TUCA SX 34855936X 76006-369177 4FT 14 s 756.00{ $ 756.00 No Bid No Bid
44 |Delivery Days ARO 10
45 [Minimum order quantity - LF 11 LF
46 |TUCA SX UB 3485583TX 3FT 15| S 567.00 $ 567.00 No Bid No Bid
47 |TUCA SX UB 3485593TX 4FT 15| S 756.00{ $ 756.00 No Bid No Bid
48 |TUCA SX UB 3485603TX 5FT 15| S 945.00{ $ 945.00 No Bid No Bid
49 |TUCA SX UB 3485653TX 6 FT 15| S 1,134.00{ $ 1,134.00 No Bid No Bid
50 |Delivery Days ARO 10
51 [Minimum order quantity - LF 10 LF
52 |Amendment 1 Returned? Yes Yes Yes
53 |If a restocking fee applies, indicate the percentage 10%

* Items disqualifed-No reorder prices available per line as requested in bid.

Awarded Items
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