
ND DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

SUMMARY OF BIDS

BISMARCK DISTRICT

BUYER:  GABRIEL HOGGARTH

Item
No. Description Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price

1 Wix 33644 3 8.73$                26.19$              7.60$                22.80$              13.70$              41.10$              7.12$                
2 Wix 33651 20 6.55$                131.00$            4.69$                93.80$              8.46$                169.20$            5.14$                

3 Wix 33721 4 11.26$              45.04$              8.33$                33.32$              13.41$              53.64$              9.90$                
4 Wix 51522 30 2.52$                75.60$              1.12$                33.60$              5.55$                166.50$            2.87$                

5 Wix 57073 7 2.94$                20.58$              1.14$                7.98$                8.75$                61.25$              2.50$                
6 Wix 57181 2 2.94$                5.88$                2.87$                5.74$                4.00$                8.00$                7.19$                
7 Wix 51660 5 14.32$              71.60$              10.18$              50.90$              16.53$              82.65$              12.21$              
8 Wix 57526 35 6.40$                224.00$            5.89$                206.15$            NO BID NO BID 3.30$                

9 Wix 24070 2 7.56$                15.12$              4.97$                9.94$                7.27$                14.54$              5.14$                

10 Wix 57703 3 18.36$              55.08$              13.68$              41.04$              24.68$              74.04$              15.18$              

11 Wix 33995 4 21.56$              86.24$              13.73$              54.92$              24.77$              99.08$              15.84$              
12 Wix 51040 2 2.94$                5.88$                1.08$                2.16$                4.39$                8.78$                2.50$                
13 Wix 51042 13 3.32$                43.16$              1.09$                14.17$              8.03$                104.39$            2.83$                
14 Wix 51068 20 2.94$                58.80$              1.26$                25.20$              4.45$                89.00$              2.41$                
15 Wix 51085 11 3.20$                35.20$              1.26$                13.86$              5.83$                64.13$              2.70$                
16 Wix 51348 40 2.94$                117.60$            1.26$                50.40$              4.00$                160.00$            2.50$                

17 Wix 51372 90 3.20$                288.00$            1.26$                113.40$            5.00$                450.00$            2.70$                
18 Wix 51516 2 2.94$                5.88$                1.12$                2.24$                5.11$                10.22$              2.50$                
19 Wix 51791 24 5.25$                126.00$            5.06$                121.44$            9.00$                216.00$            5.28$                
20 Wix 51792 2 10.83$              21.66$              7.78$                15.56$              12.82$              25.64$              9.24$                
21 Wix 51799 6 14.28$              85.68$              11.29$              67.74$              20.36$              122.16$            13.20$              
22 Wix 57415 20 50.40$              1,008.00$         21.19$              423.80$            NO BID NO BID 21.61$              
23 Wix 57060 150 2.94$                441.00$            1.14$                171.00$            4.13$                619.50$            2.50$                
24 Wix 57082 20 3.80$                76.00$              1.40$                28.00$              NO BID NO BID 3.03$                
25 Wix 57502 95 3.24$                307.80$            1.28$                121.60$            NO BID NO BID 3.30$                
26 Wix 57740 10 44.45$              444.50$            35.54$              355.40$            63.48$              634.80$            42.57$              
27 Wix 57746 15 29.35$              440.25$            20.30$              304.50$            33.14$              497.10$            21.78$              

TOTAL  4,261.74$         2,390.66$         3,771.72$         
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Interstate Power Systems

OPEN:  5/29/2015, 2:00 P.M.BID NO:  060-42-15-050 ITEM: Filters, Vehicle - Bismarck

CarquestFactory Motor PartsA and I Distributors
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