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Item Part Number Description Pg. Bid Price Reorder Price Bid Price Reorder Price Bid Price Reorder Price Bid Price Reorder Price

Brand Name/Manufacturer
1 Tungsten Snowplow 76006-365597 3 FT 8  $           61.56  $           64.64  $           47.74  $           48.24  No Bid  $           55.76  $           57.22 
2 Tungsten Snowplow 76006-365662 4 FT 8  $           60.82  $           63.86  $           47.74  $           48.24  No Bid  $           55.76  $           57.22 

3 Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 76006-366009
3 FT

5/8" Hole 9  $           65.68  $           68.96  $           47.74  $           48.24  No Bid  $           57.65  $           59.15 

4 Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 76006-366009
3 FT

3/4" Hole 9  $           66.23  $           69.55  $           47.74  $           48.24  No Bid  $           57.65  $           59.15 

5 Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 76006-366108
4 FT

5/8" Hole 9  $           63.08  $           66.24  $           47.74  $           48.24  No Bid  $           57.65  $           59.15 

6 Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 76006-366108
4 FT

3/4" Hole 9  $           65.15  $           68.41  $           47.74  $           48.24  No Bid  $           57.65  $           59.15 
7 Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 76006-366157 5 FT 9  No Bid  $           47.74  $           48.24  No Bid  No Bid 

8 Tungsten Motor Grader 76006-361604
3 FT

5/8" Hole 10  $           70.10  $           73.61  $           52.52  $           53.04  No Bid  $           60.56  $           62.12 

9 Tungsten Motor Grader 76006-361604
3 FT

3/4" Hole 10  $           68.34  $           71.75  $           52.52  $           53.04  No Bid  $           60.56  $           62.12 

10 Tungsten Motor Grader 76006-361638
4 FT

5/8" Hole 10  $           69.22  $           72.68  $           52.52  $           53.04  No Bid  $           60.56  $           62.12 

11 Tungsten Motor Grader 76006-361638
4 FT

3/4" Hole 10  $           68.59  $           72.02  $           52.52  $           53.04  No Bid  $           60.56  $           62.12 

12 Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 76006-653693
3 FT
I.C.E. 13  $           69.55  $           73.03  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

13 Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 76006-654894
4 FT
I.C.E. 13  $           69.55  $           73.03  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

14 Curb Guard I.C.E.  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
15 Joma or Equal 6000 System Less Curb-Runner Guard 76006-367000 Set 14  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $      1,875.84  $      2,113.71 
16 Joma or Equal 4' Rubber Edge 76006-367005 EA 14  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $         575.00  $         637.30 
17 Joma or Equal 4' Back Support BS23901 76006-367010 EA 14  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           32.10  $           42.47 
18 Joma or Equal 4SEH Strap 76006-367015 EA 14  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           18.18  $           24.80 
19 Joma or Equal Curb Guard 76006-367020 EA 14  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           78.55  $           89.79 
20 Thru-Hardened Motor Grader 76006-361646 5 FT 16  No Bid  $           18.00  $           18.00  $           15.49  $           15.49  No Bid 
21 Thru-Hardened Motor Grader 76006-361778 7 FT 16  No Bid  $           18.00  $           18.00  $           15.49  $           15.49  No Bid 

22 Thru-Hardened Motor Grader 76006-361778
7 FT

3/4" Hole 16  No Bid  $           18.00  $           18.00  $           15.49  $           15.49  No Bid 
23 Thru-Hardened Motor Grader 76006-361786 8 FT 16  No Bid  $           18.00  $           18.00  $           15.49  $           15.49  No Bid 
24 Thru-Hardened Vee Snowplow 76006-368005 5 FT 17  No Bid  $           12.60  $           12.60  No Bid  No Bid 
25 Thru-Hardened Vee Snowplow 76006-368104 6 FT 17  No Bid  $           12.60  $           12.60  No Bid  No Bid 
26 Thru-Hardened Vee Snowplow 76006-368153 7 FT 17  No Bid  $           12.00  $           12.60  No Bid  No Bid 

27 Curb Guard Steel 18  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 Price varies by size selected 

KENNAMETAL INC. VALK MFG. CO. CATERPILLAR
BLACK CAT - TUNGSTEN
JOMA - RUBBER EDGE

KENNAMETAL INC. VALK MFG. CO. BUTLER MACHINERY CO. KRIS ENGINEERING
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Item Part Number Description Pg.

Brand Name/Manufacturer
1 Tungsten Snowplow 76006-365597 3 FT 8
2 Tungsten Snowplow 76006-365662 4 FT 8

3 Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 76006-366009
3 FT

5/8" Hole 9

4 Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 76006-366009
3 FT

3/4" Hole 9

5 Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 76006-366108
4 FT

5/8" Hole 9

6 Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 76006-366108
4 FT

3/4" Hole 9
7 Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 76006-366157 5 FT 9

8 Tungsten Motor Grader 76006-361604
3 FT

5/8" Hole 10

9 Tungsten Motor Grader 76006-361604
3 FT

3/4" Hole 10

10 Tungsten Motor Grader 76006-361638
4 FT

5/8" Hole 10

11 Tungsten Motor Grader 76006-361638
4 FT

3/4" Hole 10

12 Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 76006-653693
3 FT
I.C.E. 13

13 Tungsten/Carbide Underbody Scraper 76006-654894
4 FT
I.C.E. 13

14 Curb Guard I.C.E.
15 Joma or Equal 6000 System Less Curb-Runner Guard 76006-367000 Set 14
16 Joma or Equal 4' Rubber Edge 76006-367005 EA 14
17 Joma or Equal 4' Back Support BS23901 76006-367010 EA 14
18 Joma or Equal 4SEH Strap 76006-367015 EA 14
19 Joma or Equal Curb Guard 76006-367020 EA 14
20 Thru-Hardened Motor Grader 76006-361646 5 FT 16
21 Thru-Hardened Motor Grader 76006-361778 7 FT 16

22 Thru-Hardened Motor Grader 76006-361778
7 FT

3/4" Hole 16
23 Thru-Hardened Motor Grader 76006-361786 8 FT 16
24 Thru-Hardened Vee Snowplow 76006-368005 5 FT 17
25 Thru-Hardened Vee Snowplow 76006-368104 6 FT 17
26 Thru-Hardened Vee Snowplow 76006-368153 7 FT 17

27 Curb Guard Steel 18

Bid Price Reorder Price Bid Price Reorder Price Bid Price Reorder Price Bid Price Reorder Price

 $           56.81  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           44.60  $           47.00 
 $           56.89  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           44.60  $           47.00 

 $           58.83  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           44.60  $           47.00 

 $           58.83  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           44.60  $           47.00 

 $           58.82  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           44.60  $           47.00 

 $           58.82  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           44.60  $           47.00 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 $           61.79  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           48.18  $           54.00 

 $           61.79  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           48.18  $           54.00 

 $           61.79  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           48.18  $           54.00 

 $           61.79  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           48.18  $           54.00 

 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  $      2,310.00  $      2,310.00  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  $         397.44  $         397.44  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  $         131.56  $         131.56  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  $           86.88  $           86.88  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  $           25.70  $           25.70  No Bid  No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 $           33.99  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 $         229.77  No Bid  No Bid 

CHEMUNG SUPPLY

BLACK CAT POLAR FLEX - RUBBER EDGE WINTER EQUIPMENT CO. EVOLUTION EDGES

TITAN MACHINERY VALLEY BLADES LTD EQUIP. EXPRESS

 PC6312 L or R = $137.73
PS6412 = $112.62
CR463U = $74.21 
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