ND DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION

SUMMARY OF BIDS

BISMARCK DISTRICT
BUYER: SUE EBERLE

BID NO: 060-42-12-050 OPENING DATE: 5/25/2011, 2:00 P.M. ITEM: Filters, Vehicle-Bismarck
FACTORY MYERS PARTS OF PETERBILT WALLWORK TRUCK
MOTOR PARTS BISMARCK OF BISMARCK CENTER

Item # |Description | Qty | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1{Wix 24073 12| 634|$ 7608|% 941(%$ 11292|$ 870|$ 10440|$ 892|$ 107.04
2|Wix 24112 12| $ 27.08 |$ 3249619 2981 |$ 357.72|% 2579|8% 30948 |3 247213 296.64
3|Wix 24315 6|3 2914 |3 17484[$ 19143 11484]3% 1940($ 11640|$ 24.18($ 145.08
4|Wix 24428 12|$ 434|9 520813 53119 6372|% 498|% 5976|% 512($ 6144

5|Wix 24545 12/$ 176119 21132|% 682|% 8184|%$ 6.70|$ 8040 NO BID
6|Wix 24430 12/$ 585]|% 70201% 774|% 9288|% B874|% 10488 (% 644|3 7728

7|Wix 33243 12]|$ 6.00[$ 7200|$ 599|% 7188|% 580(% 69.60 NO BID
8|Wix 33248 6l 3074|9 18444 |3 474|% 2844|3 376|$ 2256|% 447|$  26.82
9|Wix 33311 12/|$ 513|% 6156|% 5403 64803 564|% 6768[(% 6863 8232
10|Wix 33405 6/ 748 (% 4488|% 75913 4554|% 649|% 3894|% 638[3% 3828
11|Wix 33418 12]1$ 845([% 10140|$ 922{$% 11064 [($ 759|%$ 9108|%$ 762[($ 9144
12|Wix 33472 6| 389|% 23341% 612|% 3672|$ 587|$% 3522|3$ 648|9% 3888
13| Wix 33481 12|$ 336|$ 4032|% 501]% 6012($ 328|% 3936|% 606]1% 7272
14|Wix 33537 6| 115919 6954|% 1221|$ 7326|% 811|$ 4866|9$ 1387|$ 83.22
15|Wix 33579 6|3 767|% 4602|% 598|% 3583|% 602]|$ 36.12|$ 496|$ 2976
16|Wix 33595 6| 565|% 3390|% 400|$ 2400|$ 477|% 2862|% 603|% 36.18
17|Wix 33644 6|$ 960|$ 5760|9 742|$ 4452|% 665|$% 3990|$ 507($ 3042
18|Wix 33651 6/$ 600|$ 36.00|$ 495($ 2970|$ 472($ 2832|$ 409]% 2454
19|Wix 33721 6|$ 1222}% 7332|% 1032|$ 6192|$ 888|$% 5328|$ 800|$ 48.00
20{Wix 33899 6|9 3355|% 201.30|% 2988 ([$ 17928|% 2917|$ 17502 |$ 2745[3 16470
21|Wix 33995 6]|$ 1540|$% 92409 2028 |% 1216818% 1392|% 8352|$% 2226|3 133.56
22|Wix 42061 1% 28183 2811% 3.08]|% 308|1% 351198 351|1$% 422|9 4.22
23| Wix 42491 2|$ 2385|% 4770|9% 3275|% 6550|9% 2862|$ 5724|9% 3901|%$ 7802
24iWix 42651 2[$ 1922|$ 3844 |% 1908($ 3816|$ 1520|$ 3040|$ 1560($  31.20
25|Wix 42808 2|$ 5143 |9$ 10286 |$ 3745|% 7490|9$ 3383|$% 6766]9% 3403|% 68.06
26|Wix 42843 6/$ 58 |% 3516|%$ 612|($ 3672|$ 627|$ 3762|% 606({3 3636

27|Wix 46035 2|]$ 68{% 1364|% 6534[% 1068|$ 502|%$ 10.04 NO BID
28{Wix 46077 2|$ 35419 708|% 4309 860|$ 452]|5% 90419 48519 9.70
29|Wix 46117 2|$ 728|$ 1456|% 558|% 1116|$ 543|$ 10865 698]% 13.96
30jWix 46302 2|$ 377]% 754|% 48119 962|$ 545|$% 1090|$ 57819 11.56
31{Wix 46406 2|3 846|% 1692|% 725|% 1450|% 924|$ 1848)% 1538|9% 30.76
32|Wix 46433 2|$ 1652{$ 3304|9% 1819[% 3638|% 1538|% 307619 1426[|% 2852
33{Wix 46617 2]$ 4999|$ 9998 |% 4257|%$ 8514|9% 3752|$ 7504)% 3301]% 66.02
34|{Wix 46814 2/$ 828|% 1656|% 767[%$ 1534|% 659|$ 1318|% 6.73|%$ 13.46
35|Wix 46571 2{$ 1510|$ 3020|% 1422($ 2844|$ 1323|$ 2646|8$ 1435[% 28.70
36[Wix 46871 2|$ 3116]|% 6232($ 2858|$ 57.16|% 2680|% 5360(% 3496|$ 6992
37{Wix 46882 2]$ 6157|% 12314 (% 4507|$ 9014|9$ 3824|% 7648|8% 39.70|% 7940
38| Wix 49088 2|$ 5335(% 106.70|% 39.06|% 7812|% 3480|$ 6960]|% 3452|% 69.04
39|Wix 51036 12]$ 1878 22449 241|$ 2892|% 246|% 2952|% 251]|% 3012
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40fWix 51040 12| 8 191(8% 2292 |% 241]|% 2892(% 253]% 3036|$ 244[$ 29 28
41|Wix 51042 12|$ 200f$ 2400|$ 272|% 3264[(% 344|3$ 4128|% 384|% 46.08
42}Wix 51060 121 18718 22443 241[$ 2892|$ 267|% 3204|3 254|% 30.48
43|Wix 51061 1219 187|$ 2244|3% 273[($ 3276|$ 256|$% 3072|% 341|$ 4092
44|Wix 51068 12]|$ 190}$ 2280)% 230($ 2760|$ 238|% 2856|% 252]|$% 30.24
45|Wix 51085 12|$ 190($ 2280|$% 261]% 3132($ 261|$ 3132|$ 248|$ 29.76
46|Wix 51158 12|$ 366|% 4392]% 619|% 7428|% 698|]% 8376|% 467(% 56.04
47|Wix 51243 12]|$ 235($ 2820|% 296]% 3552(% 275|%$ 3300|$% 293|% 35.16
48|Wix 51348 12[$ 180]% 2160($ 2413 2892|% 249|% 2988|% 276(% 33.12
49|Wix 51372 12[$ 231}1$ 2772(% 261|$ 3132|$% 284($ 3408|% 272(% 32.64
50{Wix 51515 12|$ 218|$ 2616|%$ 241|% 2892($ 230|$ 2760|$ 389|% 4668
51|Wix 51516 12|$ 21418% 2568|% 2418 2892($% 310|$ 3720|%$ 290($ 34.80
52{Wix 51607 12|$ 263]8% 3156|$ 381|% 4572[(% 335|$ 4020|$ 329}% 39.48
53{Wix 51714 12|$ 724|% ©8688|% 648|% 7776(% 394|3$ 4728|3% 6.13]|$ 73.56
54|Wix 51734 12/$ 6.09]|% 7308[($ 770|$ 9240|$ 691[$ 8292|% 672]% 80.64
55{Wix 51747 6|3 545|% 3270|% 863|$ 5178|% 738|% 4428[% 716]|3% 4296
56|Wix 51772 6| 7211$ 4326|3 576|% 3456|3% 421]|% 25263 4201]% 25.20
57|Wix 51774 6|3 42613 2556[% 564|$ 3384|3 484|% 2904(3% 568|% 34.08
58|Wix 51791 12|$ 38518 4620|% 513|% 6156[(% 443|% 5316[3$ 4219 50.52
59[{Wix 51792 12[$ 707]|$ 8484[% 983|% 11796|% 805[(% 9660|% 753([% 90.36
60|Wix 51799 12[$ 992 |9% 11904 |$ 1368|$ 16416 |% 1148[% 13776 (3% 1151]% 138.12
61|Wix 51833 2|$ 8643 1728|% 1606|$ 3212|% 1419|% 2838|% 14299 28.58
62|Wix 51860 6/$ 1039|% 6234|% 1206|$ 72363 1339|$ 8034|% 1346|$% 80.76
63{Wix 57415 6% 2037|% 12222|% 1898 [% 113.88 NO BID $ 2796|9% 167.76
64]Wix 57060 6] 212|% 1272]|$ 241|$ 1446|3% 233|$ 1398|$ 24219 14.52
65|Wix 57082 6| 241]|% 1446[% 315|$% 1890}|% 3.08[$% 1848 NO BID
66|Wix 57181 6/$ 180|% 1080|$ 742|% 4452}|3% 627]|$ 3762|% 59619 35.76
67|Wix 57502 6| 274|% 1644($ 287|% 1722|% 501[$ 30.06 NO BID
68|Wix 57703 6|9 16.18|% 97.08|% 1436|%$ 86.16[% 13.19|$ 7914|3% 15391]$% 92.34
69|Wix 57740 12/ $ 3749 |8 44988 |3 4054 |9$ 48648|3% 3575|% 42900|% 3521(3 42252
70|Wix 57746 6|$ 1969]|$ 11814 % 2320|$ 13920|$ 2079|$% 12474]% 2032|$ 121.92
71|Wix 58608 2|$ 1199|% 2398|3% 1545|% 3090|$ 1622[3% 3244|% 2091]5% 41.82
72|Wix 58611 2|$ 843|3% 1686|% 2095|% 4190|% 1295(% 2590 NO BID
73|Wix 58613 2]$ 1009|$ 2018|$ 1100|$ 2200|$ 842|$ 1684}9$ 1333|9% 26.66
74[Wix 58815 2/$ ©918]9% 1836|% 1375|$% 2750|% 1096 |% 2192 NO BID
75|Wix 58904 2|$ 1034|$ 20683 1062[$ 2124|% 963|$ 1926]|% 1083 |$ 21.86
76|Wix 58917 2]$ 1201|$ 2402]% 1380|% 2760|$ 114418 2288|8% 1277]% 25.54
77|Wix 58918 2|$ 1214]|% 2428}% 1089|% 2178|% 851]|% 1702|$ 911]% 18.22
78| Wix 58934 2|$ 563|% 1126)(% 803|$ 1606|% 737]% 1474[% 1035]% 20.70
79]Wix 58955 2/$ 1086|% 2172}% 1208|$ 2416|9% 1105}% 2210|$ 1090|$ 21.80

N
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Item # | Description Qty. | Unit Price Total Unit Price] Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
80|Wix 568968 2|$ 1467 ]|9$ 2934|193 1680|% 3360|% 16.09($ 32.18 18.49| $ 36.98
81{Wix 568995 6|$ 11613 6966|% 1343 |3 8058|% 1439|% 86.34 14.66( $ 87.96
"ALL OR NOTHING"
Disc Off Mfg. not on
list 60% Blue - 55% 57% 62%
82
Brand Name AcDelco Napa Gold Baldwin FleetGuard
Mfg. Price Date 5/1/2012 5/24/2012 1/1/2012 5/1/2012
TOTAL ALL ITEMS
BY VENDOR $4,884.09 $4,967.26 $4,413.25 $ 454316
TOTAL FOR LOW
BID LESS "NO BIDS' $4,398.79 $4,583.46 $ 4,156.85 $ 4,375.40

Any item with a "No Bid" from a vendor has been removed from all vendor award totals.
(73 total line items for low bid calculations.)




