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 BID#
968-72/988-26-16-050                       

RUNNING 
UNIT HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RATE PER HOUR RATE PER WEEK RUNNING 
UNIT HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

BIS VC DL MIN DIC GFK WIL FGO

BARANKO BROS. INC. $157.00 $163.00 $152.00 $163.00 $125.00 $163.00 $165.00 $163.00 YES YES YES

Equipment

$185.00 $163.00 $163.00 $163.00 $135.00 $163.00 $145.00 $163.00

Equipment

$168.00 $163.00 $18.00 $200.00 $163.00

Equipment

$178.00 $163.00 $18.00

Equipment

$162.00 $163.00

Equipment

$168.00 $163.00

Equipment

Chad's Excavating, Inc. $145.00 $200.00 $195.00 $300.00 YES YES YES YES

Equipment

$135.00 $200.00 $155.00 $300.00

Equipment

$145.00 $300.00

Equipment

$115.00 $300.00

Equipment

CLOSE CONST. CO., INC. 185.00 185.00 145.00 145.00 145.00 145.00 110.00 110.00 185.00 185.00 $26.50 w/out fuel $885/week
$2700/month

YES YES

Equipment

160.00 160.00 135.00 135.00 145.00 145.00 185.00 185.00

Equipment

160.00 160.00 160.00 160.00 200.00 200.00

Equipment

155.00 155.00 160.00 160.00 170.00 170.00

Equipment

145.00 145.00 185.00 185.00 185.00 185.00

Cat, D7H, 1994
210hp, straight blade, standard 
track
Dickinson Yard

Komatsu, D61PX, 2015
168hp, 6 way blade, LGP
Dickinson Yard

Cat 962G 1999-2001 (3)
Wheel Loader No Blower 5 CY 
Bucket
Devils Lake & Milton

Cat 972G II 2002-2004 (2)
Wheel Loader No Blower 6.5 CY 
Bucket
Devils Lake & Milton

Buyer: 
Vanessa Brosten

Item(s):  
Contractor Operated Equipment Snow & Flood

Cat, 416C, 1997
75hp, 15' digging depth
Dickinson Yard

TRACTOR BACKHOEMOTOR GRADER

Cat, 420F IT, 2015
93hp, 15' digging depth
Dickinson Yard

WATER PUMP

NO BID
Cat, 163H, 1997, 1998, 2002, 2005
220hp, 14' blade
Dickinson Yard

John Deere, 872GP, 2013
185hp, 14' blade
Dickinson Yard

Cat, 330BL, 1998
210hp, 38ft reach
Dickinson Yard

DOZER UNIT TRACTOR
With DOZER BLADE

Cat 966G II 2002-2005 (3)
Wheel Loader No Blower 6.0 CY 
Bucket
Devils Lake & Milton

AWD PAY-LOADER
with SNOW BLOWER

DISTRICT PREFERENCE
BIDDER CONTACT INFORMATION

Komatsu, D85EX-15, 2006
240hp, straight blade, standard 
track, Dickinson Yard

Komatsu, PC220LC, 2004
168hp, 29' reach
Dickinson Yard

EXCAVATOR

Cat 420D 2004
15' 
Devils Lake

Cat 345DL 2008 & 345CL 2007 (2)
Hydraulic Excavator
Devils Lake

Cat 345BL II 2002-2004 (4)
Hydraulic Excavator
Devils Lake & Milton

Cat 330CL 2003 Long Reach
Hydraulic Excavator
Devils Lake

Cat 330 DL 2006 (1) 330CL 2003 (1)
330L 1994 (1)
Hydraulic Excavator
Devils Lake & Milton 

Joe Kessel
PO Box 820
Dickinson, ND, 58602
701-483-5868
joe@barankoinc.com

NO BID

V-Plow Attachment
Dickinson Yard

BIDDER NAME

Opening Date & Time: 
January 10, 2017; 2:00 p.m. Central

Komatsu, D65WS-17, 2013
205hp, 6 way blade, LGP
Dickinson Yard

Right hand wing attachment
Dickinson Yard

Cat 950G 1999
Wheel Loader No Blower 4.5 CY 
Bucket
Devils Lake

Cat, D6M, 1998
190 hp, 6 way blade, LGP
Dickinson Yard

NO BID

Komatsu, D65PX-16, 2010
205hp, 6 way blade, LGP
Dickinson Yard

Cat D8T 2010
Blade/Tracks
Devils Lake

Cat D6R 2006 Series II (2)
LGP Blade/Tracks
Devils Lake & Milton

Cat D6R 2003-2004 Series II (4)
LGP (3) XW (1) Blade/Tracks
Devils Lake & Milton

NO BID

NO BID

Cat D6N 2004-2006 (2)
LGP Blade/Tracks
Devils Lake & Milton

Cat 140 M 2009-2011 (3)
AWD Hydraulic Blade
Devils Lake & Milton

Cat 160 H 2001-2003 (2)
AWD Hydraulic Blade
Devils Lake & Milton

NO BIDNO BID
John Deere, 240 D, 2007
LGP, 60' reach NO BID

John Deere 650H, 2005
6 way blade LGP

SNOWCAT

Komatsu, PC360LC, 2012
257hp, 36' reach
Dickinson Yard

John Deere, 75D, 2011,
14' reach

Caterpillar, D6, 2000
6 way blade, LGP NO BID

John Deere, 230C, 2003
LGP, 36' reach Chad Hanson

373 156th Ave NE
Mayville, ND 58257
701-430-0182
chanson@hotmail.comCase, CX210, 2005

LGP, 32' reach

Greg Close
311 2nd St. N
Milton, ND 58260-6019

 

Gorman Rupp 1981-1998 (6 pumps)
6" Diesel Water Pumps
Devils Lake & Milton

Pumps have 25' suction and 100'
of discharge hose
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RUNNING 
UNIT HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RATE PER HOUR RATE PER WEEK RUNNING 
UNIT HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

BIS VC DL MIN DIC GFK WIL FGO

TRACTOR BACKHOEMOTOR GRADER WATER PUMPDOZER UNIT TRACTOR
With DOZER BLADE

AWD PAY-LOADER
with SNOW BLOWER

DISTRICT PREFERENCE
BIDDER CONTACT INFORMATION

EXCAVATOR

BIDDER NAME

SNOWCAT

Equipment

185.00 185.00 185.00 185.00 165.00 165.00

Equipment

185.00 185.00 180.00 180.00

Equipment

160.00 160.00

Equipment

145.00 145.00

Equipment

Dana Brandenburg / Tie Guy $150.00 $150.00 YES

Equipment

$150.00 $150.00

Equipment

Excavating, Inc. $160.00 $140.00 $170.00 $140.00 YES

Equipment

$160.00 $140.00 $190.00 $140 + Permit

Equipment

$235.00 $140 + Permit

Equipment

$220.00 $140 + Permit

Equipment

Gratech Company LLC $163.97 $170.60 $180.36 $170.60 $156.60 $170.60 $144.30 YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES

Equipment

$183.54 $170.60 $182.36 $170.60 $222.70 $185.90

Equipment

$163.97 $170.60 $235.97 $185.90

Equipment

Gravel Products, Inc. $175.00 $135.00 $105.00 $135.00 $165.00 $135.00 $80.00 $3,200.00 YES YES YES YES YES YES YES

Equipment

$80.00 $3,200.00

NO BID

Komatsu, D51, 2008
6 way blade, LGP 130hp
Ward County

Cat D6T 2012
6 way dozer LGP tracks
Minot

Magnum 6" 2012
on trailer
Minot

Harley Neshem
Gratech Company, LLC
8201 282nd Street NW
Berthold, ND, 58718
701-453-3434
hneshem@gratechnd.com

NO BID

Crisafulli 12" 2008
High Lift Trailer Pump PTO Driven
Ward County

NO BID

NO BID

Cat 320DL 2001 (1) 320CL 1997 (1)
Hydraulic Excavator
Devils Lake

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Cat 323F, 2015
50,900 Lbs, 48" Bucket
Minot

John Deere 650J, 2005
LGP, 100hp, 21,000 Lbs.
Minot

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Caterpillar D6N 2006-2009, 6 
way dozer, LGP, 140hp (13 units)
Sherican, Ward, Wells, McKenzie 
Counties

Caterpillar 14H 2004-2005 (4units)
180hp
Ward, Wells, McKenzie Counites

NO BID

2012 L225 New Holland 
Skidsteer
With 12' Bucket 83hp

John Deere 650K, 2012
LGP, 100hp, 21,000 Lbs.
Minot

Cat 980H 2010 (1)
Wheel Loader No Blower 7.5 CY 
Bucket
Devils Lake & Milton 

2008 L185 New Holland 
Skidsteer
With 11' 6" Bucket
Smaller Buckets also- 60" 84" 
80hp

NO BID

Komatsu, D61, 2010,
6 way blade, LGP 130hp
Ward County

Caterpillar 160H 2005-2007 (6units)
180hp
Ward, Wells, McKenzie Counties

NO BID NO BID

Caterpillar 330B, 330C, 330D, 
1999-2007, 3.0 to 3.5 CY (5 units)
Ward, Wells, McKenzie Counties

Cat D5M 1998-1999 (2)
LGP Blade/Tracks
Devils Lake & Milton

Cat 980G 1997-2001 (11)
Wheel Loader No Blower 7.5 CY 
Bucket
Devils Lake & Milton

Cat 324E 2012 (1) Long Reach
Hydraulic Excavator
Devils Lake

Cat D8R 1999 (1)
Blade/Tracks
Devils Lake

Cat 980G II 2002-2005 (9)
Wheel Loader No Blower 7.5 CY 
Bucket
Devils Lake & Milton

Cat 325DL 2006 (1) 325CL 2003 (1)
325BL 2001 (1)
Hydraulic Excavator
Devils Lake & Milton

Cat 315CL 2002 (1)
Hydraulic Excavator
Devils Lake

 
   

,  
701-496-3200
cell: 701-739-1000
rwccci@utma.com

Cat 320CL 2001 (1) Long Reach
Hydraulic Excavator
Devils Lake

Tie Guy
Dana Brandenburg
8041 Cty Rd 35
Jud, ND 58454
701-685-2250
cell: 701-709-0072
firsttieguy1@hotmail.com AND 
firsttieguy1@icloud.com

John Deere 850K, 2012
LGP, 200hp, 46,500 Lbs.
Minot

Excavating Inc.
Jeff Anderson
5280 Hwy 2 East
Minot, ND 58701-8223
701-839-1817
jeff@excavatinginc.com

NO BID

NO BID

John Deere 240 DLC, 2007
55,000 Lbs, 48" Bucket or JRB 
Grapple
Minot

Cat D6R IG, 1997
Wide Pad, 175hp, 43,500 Lbs.
Minot

Percy Schriock
  

  
  

Caterpillar 320C, 320D, 2006-2007
2.0 CY (5 units)
Ward, Wells, McKenzie Counties

NO BID NO BID
Cat 420E, 2006
Extendable Boom
Minot

Cat 330BL 1998
Standard Boom
Minot

NO BID

Caterpillar 345B, 345C, 2003-2007
4.0 to 4.5 CY (2units)
Ward, McKenzie Counties
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RUNNING 
UNIT HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RATE PER HOUR RATE PER WEEK RUNNING 
UNIT HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

BIS VC DL MIN DIC GFK WIL FGO

TRACTOR BACKHOEMOTOR GRADER WATER PUMPDOZER UNIT TRACTOR
With DOZER BLADE

AWD PAY-LOADER
with SNOW BLOWER

DISTRICT PREFERENCE
BIDDER CONTACT INFORMATION

EXCAVATOR

BIDDER NAME

SNOWCAT

Equipment

$80.00 $3,200.00

Equipment

JMAC Resources, Inc. $250.00 $338.50 $292.00 $338.50 $373.00 $338.50 YES

Equipment

$250.00 $338.50

Equipment

$250.00 $338.50

Equipment

$250.00 $338.50

Equipment

$250.00 $338.50

Equipment

$250.00 $338.50

Equipment

$250.00 $338.50

Equipment

$250.00 $338.50

Equipment

K & H Electric, Inc. $200.00 $200.00 $135.00 $135.00 $200.00 $200.00 YES YES YES NO NO NO NO NO

Equipment 

$135.00 $135.00

Equipment

$135.00 $135.00

Equipment

Keller Paving & Landscaping, Inc. $300.00 $300.00 $450.00 $300.00 $200.00 $300.00 $225.00 $300.00 YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES

Equipment

$300.00 $300.00 $175.00 $300.00 $275.00 $300.00

Equipment

$275.00 $300.00

Cat D6N LGP, 2013
6 way blade, LG Tracks
Williston

Magnum 6" 2012
on trailer
Minot

Magnum 6" 2012
on trailer
Minot

Cat D6N LGP, 2012
6 way blade, LG Tracks
Williston

Cat 163H, 2003
Vplow and right snow wing
Williston

Caterpillar 420F2IT 4x4, 2016
Extendable stick 21', 6" reach
Linton

Cat 330CL, 2001
24' digging depth, 34' reach
Minot (3 available)

Komatsu D65PX16, 2012
6 way LGP Tracks
Linton

John Deere 850J LGP, 2008, 6 
way blade LGP Tracks
Minot

Steiger 420
18' blade, LGP Tracks
Minot

Cat 143h, 2003
Blade w/Vplow
Minot

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

Caterpillar 420F2IT 4x4, 2016
Extendable stick 21', 6" reach
Linton

John Deere 850J LGP, 2009, 6 
way blade LGP Tracks
Minot

Cat 143h, 2003
Blade w/Vplow
Minot

Caterpillar 420F2IT 4x4, 2016
Extendable stick 21', 6" reach
Linton

Cat D6N LGP, 2013
6 way blade, LG Tracks
Williston

NO BID

Cat D6N LGP, 2012
6 way blade, LG Tracks
Williston

NO BID

John Deere 544 Loader
Blower SnowBlast MN000 MD
2012 - 1500 TPH, 84" W x 42" H, 
130 HP

 
Gravel Products, Inc
2920 Railway Ave
Minot, ND 58703
701-852-4751
percys@gravelproductsinc.com

Cat D6N LGP, 2013
6 way blade, LG Tracks
Williston

Cat D6N LGP, 2007
6 way blade, LG Tracks
Williston

Cat D6N LGP, 2008
6 way blade, LG Tracks
Williston

Cat D6N LGP, 2006
6 way blade, LG Tracks
Williston

Mylo Kramer
K & H Electric Inc.
PO BOX 656
Linton, ND 58552
701-254-4689
khbek@bektel.com

Komatsu PC200HD, 2009
LGP Track, Bucket w/Thumb
Linton

Cat 320CL 2002
13' digging depth, 30' reach
Minot (4 available)

NO BID

Robert Krom
JMAC Resources, Inc.
1505 N. Miller St.
Wenatchee, WA, 98801
509-423-7494
robk@jmacresources.com

NO BIDNO BID NO BID

NO BID

Justin Thurn
Keller Paving & Landscaping, Inc.
1820 Highway 2 Bypass E
Minot, ND 58701

NO BID
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RUNNING 
UNIT HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RATE PER HOUR RATE PER WEEK RUNNING 
UNIT HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

BIS VC DL MIN DIC GFK WIL FGO

TRACTOR BACKHOEMOTOR GRADER WATER PUMPDOZER UNIT TRACTOR
With DOZER BLADE

AWD PAY-LOADER
with SNOW BLOWER

DISTRICT PREFERENCE
BIDDER CONTACT INFORMATION

EXCAVATOR

BIDDER NAME

SNOWCAT

Equipment

$250.00 $300.00

Equipment

Knife River Corporation - North Central $206.55 $310.00 $207.30 $310.00 $120.65 $310.00 $273.30 $310.00 NO NO NO YES YES NO YES NO

Equipment

$207.30 $310.00 $273.30 $310.00

Equipment

$207.30 $310.00

Equipment

Martin Construction, Inc. $140.00 $250.00 $185.00 $250.00 $315.00 $300.00 $170.00 $250.00 YES NO NO NO YES NO YES NO

Equipment

$150.00 $250.00 $185.00 $250.00 $330.00 $300.00 $200.00 $250.00

Equipment

$165.00 $250.00 $195.00 $250.00

Equipment

$130.00 $250.00

Equipment

Mikkelsen Aggregates, LLC $145.00 $100.00 $130.00 $100.00 $160.00 $100.00 $110.00 $100.00 $180.00 $100.00 YES YES

Equipment

$145.00 $100.00 $120.00 $100.00 $145.00 $100.00 $160.00 $100.00

Equipment

$145.00 $100.00 $150.00 $100.00 $145.00 $100.00

Equipment

$140.00 $100.00 $145.00 $100.00

Equipment

$140.00 $100.00

Equipment

$140.00 $100.00

Equipment

NCZ Express, Inc. $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 YES YES YES

Joshua Lorenz
Mikkelsen Aggregates, LLC
PO Box 55
Bottineau, ND 58318
701-228-2233
cell: 701-871-8999
mikkagg@utma.com

Komatsu 380-3, 1998
5 CY bucket

Komatsu 380-7, 2007
4 CY bucket
Bottineau

Cat, 140H, 2007
Motor Grader
Williston

Cat, 140M, 2012
Motor Grader
Williston

Cat, D6N - LGP, 2014
Tracked Dozer
Williston

Cat, 140M, 2012
Motor Grader
Williston

NO BID NO BID

Jim Trull
Knife River Corporation - North Central
5654 134th Ave NW
Williston, ND 58801
701-774-2066
jim.trull@kniferiver.com

Cat 330CL, 2005
Excavator
Bismarck

NO BID

John Deere 750J LGP, 2005, 6 
way blade LGP Tracks
Minot

Cat, 430F, 2015
Backhoe Loader, 15' Reaach
Williston

 
    

    
Minot, ND 58701
701-852-5030
justin@kellerpaving.net

NO BID

Caterpillar D6K LGP, 2008, 6 way 
blade LGP Tracks
Minot

Cat, D6K Series 2, 2013
6 way, LGP
Dunn County

NO BID
Cat, 160M AWD, 209
16MG
Stark and Dunn County

Cat 950H, 2011
Tech LM 220 Snowblower
Mandaree

NO BID
Cat 324EL, 2014
Std Boom & stick
Dickinson

NO BID

Cat, 336EL, 2012
Excavator
Williston

Brad Riely
Martin Construction Inc.
3685 116th Ave SW
Dickinson, ND 58601
701-483-3478
briely@martinnd.com

Cat, D6N, (3 units) 2003, 2012, 
2014
6 way LGP
Stark and Dunn County

Cat, 163H AWD, 1999
14MB
Stark and Dunn County

Cat 966K, 2012
Snowblast, M-9000 HD Snowblower

Cat 324EL LR, 2012
Long reach Boom & stick
Dickinson

Optional-Does not meet spec 
Cat D6T (4 units) 07, 11, 12 (2)
XW Tracks (No LGP), SU Blade 
No 6 way

Cat 336EL, (2), 2012 & 2014
Std boom & stick
Stark & Dunn County

Optional-Does not meet spec
Cat D5N 2004, 115hp
LGP Tracks, 6 way blade

Komatsu PC240LC, 2013
6', 3 CY bucket, 34' reach
Bottineau

Cat D6R II, XW, 2005
11', Semi-U Blade, 32" pads

Cat 950K, 2014
4.5 CY bucket
Bottineau

Komatsu PC200LC, 2010
5', 2.5 bucket, 30' reach
Bottineau

Cat 950G, 1998
4 CY bucket
Bottineau

Komatsu PC200LC, 2011
5', 2.5 CY bucket, 30' reach
Bottineau

NO BID
Cat D6R II LGP, 2005
13' straight blade 36" pads
Bottineau

NO BID
Cat 143H, 2005
AWD with V-Plow, 14' moldboard
Bottineau

Cat 966 G II, 2006
5.25 CY bucket
Bottineau

Cat 420D, 2002
18' Backhoe digging depth
Bottineau

Cat 330DL 2007
Hyd. Thumb 4 CY, 6' bucket
38' reach
Bottineau

Cat D6R II LGP, 2006
13' straight blade 36" pads
Bottineau

Cat 143H, 2007
AWD with Multi Shank Ripper,
14' moldboard
Bottineau

Komatsu WA 400-6, 2005
4.35 CY Bucket
Bottineau
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RUNNING 
UNIT HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RUNNING UNIT 
HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

RATE PER HOUR RATE PER WEEK RUNNING 
UNIT HOUR

TRANSPORT UNIT 
HOUR

BIS VC DL MIN DIC GFK WIL FGO

TRACTOR BACKHOEMOTOR GRADER WATER PUMPDOZER UNIT TRACTOR
With DOZER BLADE

AWD PAY-LOADER
with SNOW BLOWER

DISTRICT PREFERENCE
BIDDER CONTACT INFORMATION

EXCAVATOR

BIDDER NAME

SNOWCAT

Equipment

$200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00

Equipment

$200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00

Equipment

$200.00 $200.00

Equipment

$200.00 $200.00

Equipment

Fettigs Custom Speed Shop, Inc. $250/hour
$500 each way
$750 each way
over 75 miles

YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES

Equipment

Selland Construction $160.00 $150.00 $165.00 $150.00 $250.00 $150.00 $130.00 $150.00 YES YES YES

Equipment

$160.00 $150.00 $165.00 $150.00 $130.00 $150.00

Equipment

$165.00 $150.00

Equipment

$165.00 $150.00

Equipment

Strata $195.00 $230.00 $165.00 $230.00 $150.00 $185.00 $230.00 YES YES YES YES YES YES

Equipment

$192.00 $230.00 $165.00 $230.00

Equipment

$250.00 $230.00

Equipment

$195.00 $230.00

Equipment

Sundre Sand & Gravel $225.00 $155.00 $185.00 $155.00 $140.00 $125.00 $175.00 $155.00 $55.00 YES YES

Equipment

New Holland, 2013, Snowbucket

JD 310SG, 2004, Rubber Tire
New Rockford

Cat 322-L, 1996, 6 YD bucket
for snow & drains
New Rockford

NO BID

Mark Rue
NCZ Express, Inc.
2053 HWY 281
New Rockford, ND 58356
701-739-7225
701-947-2511
pam_rue@hotmail.com

D6R, 1998, LGP
New Rockford

Volvo L220E, 2004, 8 YD bucket
New Rockford

Cat 325-CI, 1998, 4 YD bucket
New Rockford

Cat 980C, 1986, 7 YD Bucket
New Rockford

Komatsu 200L6, 1996, 2.5 YD bucket
New Rockford

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

2008 Prinoth BR350R
16', 12 way snow blade
355hp, 66"wide tracks, 
15mph max, 17000 GVW
5025 N Broadway, Minot

Ralph Fettig
Fettigs Custom Speed Shop, Inc.
6650 Co. Rd 12W
Minot, ND 58701
701-822-3467
fettigrd@gmail.com

Bobcat, 2013 Track Snow Blower

D6K2, 2015, LGP
New Rockford NO BID

160H, 1998 with chains
New Rockford

Cat 950K, 2012, 8 YD bucket
New Rockford

2006 D6N, LGP
Williston

NO BID 2005 Cat 143H
Williston

FWD Truck Snow Blower
Williston

2004 Cat 420D NO BID NO BID

Mike Kummer
PO Box 119
Wenatchee, WA 98807
775-224-3250
mikek@sellandconstruction.com

2012, D6T (Not LGP)
Williston

2006 Cat 143H
Williston 2005 Cat 420D

2001 Cat 160H
Williston

2005, Cat 160H,
Williston

2008 D6T, LPG (3) NO BID 2007-2010 140H (12) NO BID 2010 420 Cat (4) 2010, 326 Cat (10) NO BID

Andy Mack
PO Box 13500
Grand Forks, ND 58208-3500
701-775-4205
cell: 701-741-4143
andy.mack@stratacorporation.com

2007 DGR, LGP (5) 2010 672 JD (4)

2008 D8T (4)

Cat D6T, 2013
Blade 13' 6" Track-Standdard
Minot

NO BID
Cat 143H, 2006
L 28' 6", H-10' 3", w-8' 4"
Minot

NO BID
John Deere 310SG, 2003
17' 8" Reach from swivel
Minot

Komatsu PC350, 2011
15' 8" height
Minot

Gorman Rupp PAC60, 2012
Minot

David Abel
6220 37th Ave SE
Minot, ND 58701
701-838-4455
dave@sundregravel.com

2009 850J, LGP (4)
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