Bid No:

988-89-16-050-02

Purchasing Agent:
Gabriel Hoggarth
701-328-4465

Bid Opening:
May 2, 2016; 2:30 PM

Summary of Bids

25 of the 28 bid items were bid by at least 1 bidder. Crop Production Services was low bid on 18 of the 25 items bid.

As the sole awardee, Crop Production Services can provide 23 of the 28 bid items, whereas the competing bidder could have provided 12 of the 28 bid items.

Bidder: Crop Production Services

Commodity:

Herbicides, Surfactants, Drift Control, and Fertilizer

Due to the administrative costs associated with administering multiple contracts and as allowed by Bidder Instruction No. 3, Crop Production Services will be awarded the entire contract.

ltem No. Item Detail Equivalent Proposed Alternate Bid Amount
Bid 2.5 Gallon Sizes Unless Stated Otherwise 1 to 3 Units 4 to 7 Units 8 or More

1 Roundup (min. 50% Glyphosate) Exact Roundup Pro Concentrate S 3755 | S 3755 | S 37.55
2 Generic Glyphosate (min. 50% Glyphosate) Approved Equal Mad Dog 5.4 S 32.25 | S 32.25 | S 32.25
3 Roundup (min. 40% Glyphosate) Exact Ranger Pro S 29.25 | S 29.25 | S 29.25
4 Generic Glyphosate (min. 40% Glyphosate) Approved Equal Makaze Herbicide S 27.25 | S 27.25 | S 27.25
5 Plateau (min. 20% Imazapic) Exact Bidding 1 Gal S 100.40 | $ 100.40 | S 100.40
6 Generic Imazapic (min. 20% Imazapic) Approved Equal No Bid No Bid No Bid

7 Generic Imazapyr (min. 20 Imazapyr) Approved Equal Arsenal Herbicide S 117.75 | S 117.75 | S 117.75
8 Pramitol 25E (min. 25% Prometon) Exact 7875 | S 7875 | S 78.75
9 Generic Prometon (min. 20% Prometon) Approved Equal No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 Rodeo (min. 50% Glyphosate) Exact S 51.25| S 51.25| S 51.25
11 Aqua Star (min. 50% Glyphosate) Exact No Bid No Bid No Bid

12 Generic Aquatic Glyphosate (min. 50% Glyphosate) Approved Equal AquaNeat Herbicide S 3450 | S 3450 | S 34.50
13 Amine 2,4-D (min. 45% 2,4-D) Exact 25.25 | S 25.25 | S 25.25
14 Generic 2,4-D (min. 45% 2,4-D) Approved Equal Platoon 2, 4-D Amine S 2475 | S 2475 | S 24.75
15 Curtail Herbicide (min. 5% clopyralid MEA salt and 38% 2,4-D)[Exact or Approved Equal |Curtail Herbicide S 93.50 | S 93.50 | S 93.50
16 Cody Herbicide (min. 5% clopyralid MEA salt and 38% 2,4-D) |Exact or Approved Equal No Bid No Bid No Bid

17 Generic Dicamba (min. 40% Dicamba) Approved Equal Rifle Herbicide S 10750 | $ 10750 | S 107.50
18 Picloram 22k Exact or Approved Equal |Tordon 22k S 11450 | S 11450 | S 114.50
19 Tordon 22k Exact or Approved Equal |Tordon 22k S 11450 | S 11450 | S 114.50
20 Preference Surfactant Exact or Approved Equal |Activator 90 Surfactant S 3850 | S 3850 | S 38.50
21 Gordon Lawn & Pasture Liquid Fertilizer, 20-0-0 Exact or Approved Equal |Starline 18-3-6 S 35.00 | $ 35.00 | S 35.00
22 Snapshot 2.5 TG Granular Pre-Emergent, 45 lb Bag Min. Exact or Approved Equal |Snapshot, 50 Ib Bag S 105.00 | S 105.00 | S 105.00
23 Sahara DG for Total Bareground Control, 9 Ib Bag Min. Exact or Approved Equal |Imazuron Herbicide, 10 Ib Bag S 71.00 | S 71.00 | S 71.00
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24 Bronc + Surfactant, 38 |Ib Bag Min. Exact or Approved Equal |Flame, 2.5 Gal Container S 57.75 | S 57.75 | S 57.75
25 R11 Spreader-Activator, 1 Quart Min. Exact or Approved Equal |Spreader 90 Surfactant S 3350 | S 3350 | S 33.50
26 Crosshair Drift control, 1 Quart Min. Exact or Approved Equal |Reign LC, 1 Quart S 9.80 | $ 9.80 (S 9.80
27 Chem-Trol Drift Control Agent, 1 Quart Min. Exact or Approved Equal |Reign, 2.5 Gal S 30.00 | $ 30.00 | S 30.00
28 Ammonium Sulfate Fertilizer, 45 Ib Bag Min. Exact or Approved Equal |Actamaster, 51 Ib Bag S 15.30 | $ 15.30 [ S 15.30
Bidder: Red River Specialties, Inc.
ltem No. Item Detail Equivalent Proposed Alternate Bid Amount
Bid 2.5 Gallon Sizes Unless Stated Otherwise 1 to 3 Units 4 to 7 Units 8 or More
1 Roundup (min. 50% Glyphosate) Exact _ S 40.57 | S 40.57 | S 40.57
2 Generic Glyphosate (min. 50% Glyphosate) Approved Equal No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 Roundup (min. 40% Glyphosate) Exact _No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 Generic Glyphosate (min. 40% Glyphosate) Approved Equal Razor by Nufarm S 23.57 | S 23.57 | S 23.57
5 Plateau (min. 20% Imazapic) Exact Bidding 1 Gal S 11730 | $ 11730 | S 117.30
6 Generic Imazapic (min. 20% Imazapic) Approved Equal Panoramic 2SL by Alligare, 1 Gal S 99.63 | S 99.63 | S 99.63
7 Generic Imazapyr (min. 20 Imazapyr) Approved Equal Polaris by Nufarm S 115.82 | S 115.82 | S 115.82
8 Pramitol 25E (min. 25% Prometon) Exact No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 Generic Prometon (min. 20% Prometon) Approved Equal No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 Rodeo (min. 50% Glyphosate) Exact No Bid No Bid No Bid
11 Aqua Star (min. 50% Glyphosate) Exact No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 Generic Aquatic Glyphosate (min. 50% Glyphosate) Approved Equal AquaNeat by Nufarm S 3492 | S 3492 | S 34.92
13 Amine 2,4-D (min. 45% 2,4-D) Exact 26.32 | S 2632 (S 26.32
14 Generic 2,4-D (min. 45% 2,4-D) Approved Equal 2, 4-D Amine by Alligare S 26.32 | S 2632 |S 26.32
15 Curtail Herbicide (min. 5% clopyralid MEA salt and 38% 2,4-D)|Exact or Approved Equal No Bid No Bid No Bid
16 Cody Herbicide (min. 5% clopyralid MEA salt and 38% 2,4-D) |Exact or Approved Equal No Bid No Bid No Bid
17 Generic Dicamba (min. 40% Dicamba) Approved Equal No Bid No Bid No Bid
18 Picloram 22k Exact or Approved Equal No Bid No Bid No Bid
19 Tordon 22k Exact or Approved Equal No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 Preference Surfactant Exact or Approved Equal |RRSI NIS by Red River S 19.92 | S 19.92 [ S 19.92
21 Gordon Lawn & Pasture Liquid Fertilizer, 20-0-0 Exact or Approved Equal No Bid No Bid No Bid
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22 Snapshot 2.5 TG Granular Pre-Emergent, 45 |b Bag Min. Exact or Approved Equal No Bid No Bid No Bid
23 Sahara DG for Total Bareground Control, 9 Ib Bag Min. Exact or Approved Equal No Bid No Bid No Bid
24 Bronc + Surfactant, 38 Ib Bag Min. Exact or Approved Equal No Bid No Bid No Bid
25 R11 Spreader-Activator, 1 Quart Min. Exact or Approved Equal |RRSI NIS by Red River S 467 | S 467 | S 4.67
26 Crosshair Drift control, 1 Quart Min. Exact or Approved Equal |Elite Velocity by Red River, 2.5 Gal S 7750 | S 7750 | S 77.50
27 Chem-Trol Drift Control Agent, 1 Quart Min. Exact or Approved Equal |RRSI 1% Solution by Red River, 2.5 Gal S 10.45 | S 10.45 | S 10.45
28 Ammonium Sulfate Fertilizer, 45 Ib Bag Min. Exact or Approved Equal No Bid No Bid No Bid
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