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ND DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

SUMMARY OF BIDS  
 

 
BID NO: 

775-45-10-050 

 
OPENING: 

2:00 pm Central, July 27, 2010 

 
COMMODITY: 

Salt, Road Maintenance 

 
BUYER: 

Marilyn Langehaug 

 

BIDDER 
BISMARCK 

DISTRICT 

VALLEY 

CITY 

DISTRICT 

DEVILS 

LAKE 

DISTRICT 

MINOT 

DISTRICT 

DICKINSON 

DISTRICT 

GRAND 

FORKS 

DISTRICT 

WILLISTON 

DISTRICT 

FARGO 

DISTRICT 

TOTAL 

ESTIMATE 

Estimated Usage  

TONS 
7,720 8,130 2,050 4,100 3,600 5,050 1,500 5,375 37,525 

          

*North American 

Salt Co. Overland, 

KS 

$95.34 $70.22 $84.77 $84.52 $111.72 $63.78 $91.16 $67.31  

Bidder Total Est. $736,024.80 $570,888.60 $173,778.50 $346,532.00 $402,192.00 $322,089.00 $136,740.00 $361,791.25 $3,050,036.15 

          

NSC Minerals 

Saskatoon SK 
$61.40 $69.35 $60.21 $53.18 $64.59 $63.21 $58.56 $71.43  

Bidder Total Est. $474,008.00 $563,815.50 $123,430.50 $218,038.00 $232,524.00 $319,210.50 $87,840.00 $383,936.25 $2,402,802.75 

          

Morton Salt 

Chicago, IL 
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  

Bidder Total Est.          

          

**H & H Trucking 

Minot, ND 
$88.50 NO BID $79.50 $70.00 NO BID NO BID $77.50 NO BID  

Bidder Total Est. $683,220.00    $162,975.00  $287,000.00      $116,250.00      

*Tested product sample did not meet gradation test. 
**Ineligible, Reference bidder instruction #16, Page 2 of 14. 

 


