
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BUYER:  SUE EBERLE

 PROCUREMENT/FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT
608 E BLVD AVE

BISMARCK ND  58505-0700

F:\PROCURE\ENGR\Construction 14\Bid Summary RFB 305-00-14-050.xls Page 1

Item
 No. Item & Vendor Qty. Unit Brand Model No. Unit Price Total Price 

Acme Tools 1 Ea. Seco 3003-05 5.46$         5.46$          
Bierschbach Equipment 1 Ea. Seco 3003-05 5.44$         5.44$          
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 1 Ea. Seco 3003-05 6.15$         6.15$          

Acme Tools 4 Ea. Seco 3003-06 8.50$         34.00$        
Bierschbach Equipment 4 Ea. Seco 3003-06 8.49$         33.96$        
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 4 Ea. Seco 3003-06 9.50$         38.00$        

Acme Tools 4 Ea. Seco 3003-07 16.45$       65.80$        
Bierschbach Equipment 4 Ea. Seco 3003-07 16.44$       65.76$        
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 4 Ea. Seco 3003-07 18.53$       74.12$        

Acme Tools 6 Ea. Seco 3003-15 8.50$         51.00$        
Bierschbach Equipment 6 Ea. Seco 3003-15 8.49$         50.94$        
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 6 Ea. Seco 3003-15 9.59$         57.54$        

Acme Tools 3 Ea. Seco 3003-17 16.45$       49.35$        
Bierschbach Equipment 3 Ea. Seco 3003-17 16.44$       49.32$        
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 3 Ea. Seco 3003-17 18.53$       55.59$        

Acme Tools 2 Ea. Seco 3006-06 18.28$       36.56$        
Bierschbach Equipment 2 Ea. Seco 3006-06 18.29$       36.58$        
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 2 Ea. Seco 3006-06 20.50$       41.00$        

Acme Tools                                  Head's 3 Ea. Seco 4769-02 7.29$         21.87$        
Bierschbach Equipment (Flip coin)-Tails 3 Ea. Seco 4769-02 7.29$         21.87$        
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 3 Ea. Seco 4769-02 8.13$         24.39$        

Acme Tools 8 Ea. Seco 4769-04 9.11$         72.88$        
Bierschbach Equipment  8 Ea. Seco 4769-04 9.09$         72.72$        
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 8 Ea. Seco 4769-04 10.28$       82.24$        

Acme Tools 4 Ea. Seco 4770-00 13.95$       55.80$        
Bierschbach Equipment 4 Ea. Seco 4770-00 13.94$       55.76$        
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 4 Ea. Seco 4770-00 15.63$       62.52$        

Acme Tools   9 Ea. Keson MP301 94.00$       846.00$      
Bierschbach Equipment 9 Ea. Keson MP301 104.94$     944.46$      
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 9 Ea. Keson MP301-1A 96.33$       866.97$      

Acme Tools 1 Ea. Seco 4040-30 80.75$       80.75$        
Bierschbach Equipment 1 Ea. Seco 4040-30 80.74$       80.74$        
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 1 Ea. Seco 4040-30 80.73$       80.73$        

Acme Tools 2 Ea. Seco 4850-05-T 415.00$     830.00$      
Bierschbach Equipment 2 Ea. Seco 4850-05-T 414.99$     829.98$      
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 2 Ea. Seco 4850-05 468.75$     937.50$      

25-Ft. Heavy-Duty Tape, Seco 4769-02

10

Measuring Wheel, Keson MP301-1A

11

12

8

Hand Level, 2X Zoom with External Vial with Case, Seco 4040-30

9
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1

2

3

4

5

33-Ft. Heavy Duty Tape, SECO 4769-04

100-Ft. Open Reel Fiberglass Tape, Seco 3006-06

200-Ft. Open Reel Fiberglass Tape, Seco 3003-17

6

7

100-Ft. Open Reel Fiberglass Tape, Seco 3003-15

50-Ft. Open Reel Fiberglass Tape, Seco 3003-05

100-Ft. Open Reel Fiberglass Tape, Seco 3003-06

200-Ft. Open Reel Fiberglass Tape, Seco 3003-07

Laser Level, Rotating, Seco 4850-05-T

Fiberglass Folding Ruler, Seco 4770-00
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Item
 No. Item & Vendor Qty. Unit Brand Model No. Unit Price Total Price 

Acme Tools 1 Ea. Seco 5001-25 67.10$       67.10$        
Bierschbach Equipment 1 Ea. Seco 5001-25 67.09$       67.09$        
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 1 Ea. Seco 5001-25 75.50$       75.50$        

Acme Tools 1 Ea.    NO BID
Bierschbach Equipment 1 Ea. Seco 5114-01 193.49$     193.49$      
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 1 Ea. Seco 5114-1 193.52$     193.52$      

Acme Tools 5 Ea. Seco 5128-00 231.00$     1,155.00$   
Bierschbach Equipment 5 Ea. Seco 5128-00 231.79$     1,158.95$   
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 5 Ea. Seco 5128-00 260.78$     1,303.90$   

Acme Tools 1 Ea. Seco 5144-02 43.25$       43.25$        
Bierschbach Equipment 1 Ea. Seco 5144-02 43.24$       43.24$        
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 1 Ea. Seco 5144-02 42.34$       42.34$        

Acme Tools 2 Ea. Seco 5190-00 6.67$         13.34$        
Bierschbach Equipment 2 Ea. Seco 5190-00 6.64$         13.28$        
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 2 Ea. Seco 5190-00 7.53$         15.06$        

Acme Tools 4 Ea. Seco 5191-00 9.27$         37.08$        
Bierschbach Equipment 4 Ea. Seco 5191-00 9.29$         37.16$        
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 4 Ea. Seco 5191-00 10.38$       41.52$        

Acme Tools 2 Ea. Seco 5192-02 43.25$       86.50$        
Bierschbach Equipment 2 Ea. Seco 5192-02 43.29$       86.58$        
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 2 Ea. Seco 5192-02 48.74$       97.48$        

Acme Tools 2 Ea. Seco 5194-01 7.88$         15.76$        
Bierschbach Equipment 2 Ea. Seco 5194-01 7.89$         15.78$        
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 2 Ea. Seco 5194-01 8.90$         17.80$        

Acme Tools 6 Ea. Seco 5194-003 1.96$         11.76$        
Bierschbach Equipment 6 Ea. Seco 5194-003 1.94$         11.64$        
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 6 Ea. Seco 5194-003 2.25$         13.50$        

Acme Tools 3 Ea. Seco 5194-03 7.28$         21.84$        
Bierschbach Equipment 3 Ea. Seco 5194-03 7.29$         21.87$        
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 3 Ea. Seco 5194-03 8.13$         24.39$        

Acme Tools 1 Ea. Seco 5195-01 34.60$       34.60$        
Bierschbach Equipment 1 Ea. Seco 5195-01 34.59$       34.59$        
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 1 Ea. Seco 5195-01 38.96$       38.96$        

Acme Tools 1 Ea. Seco 5200-065 55.25$       55.25$        
Bierschbach Equipment 1 Ea. Seco 5200-065 55.29$       55.29$        
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 1 Ea. Seco 5200-065 62.21$       62.21$        

Claw Series Quick-Release Controller/Collector Cradles, Seco 5200-065

21

22

23

Prism Pole Point, Seco 5194-03

Pole Peg Adjusting Jig, Seco 5195-01

Prism Pole Point, Seco 5194-003

18

19

20

Prism Pole, Tope Shoe, Seco 5191-00

Tope Shoe & Point Combo, Seco 5192-02

Center Punch Point, Seco 5194-01

Triple Mag Mount, Seco 5114-11

13

24

17

16
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2-Meter Carbon Fiber Rover Rod, Seco 5128-00

1/2 Meter Pole, Seco 5144-02

Prism Pole Point - Stell Body, Seco 5190-00

14

15

10-Minute Heads-Up Level, Seco 5001-25
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Item
 No. Item & Vendor Qty. Unit Brand Model No. Unit Price Total Price 

Acme Tools 3 Ea. Seco 5217-15-ABK 38.90$       116.70$      
Bierschbach Equipment 3 Ea. Seco 5217-15-ABK 38.94$       116.82$      
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 3 Ea. Seco 5217-15-ABK 43.84$       131.52$      

Acme Tools 1 Ea. Seco 5311-30-ORG 74.35$       74.35$        
Bierschbach Equipment 1 Ea. Seco 5311-30-ORG 74.39$       74.39$        
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 1 Ea. Seco 5311-30-ORG 83.73$       83.73$        

Acme Tools 4 Ea. Seco 7301-00 12.15$       48.60$        
Bierschbach Equipment 4 Ea. Seco 7301-00 12.14$       48.56$        
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 4 Ea. Seco 7301-00 13.71$       54.84$        

Acme Tools 4 Ea. Seco 8090-20-ORG 36.00$       144.00$      
Bierschbach Equipment 4 Ea. Seco 8090-20-ORG 35.99$       143.96$      
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 4 Ea. Seco 8090-20-ORG 40.56$       162.24$      

Acme Tools 4 Ea. Seco 8102-01-ORG 55.20$       220.80$      
Bierschbach Equipment 4 Ea. Seco 8102-01-ORG 55.29$       221.16$      
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 4 Ea. Seco 8102-01-ORG 62.21$       248.84$      

Acme Tools 1 Ea. Seco 91411 12.60$       12.60$        
Bierschbach Equipment 1 Ea. Seco 91411 12.59$       12.59$        
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 1 Ea. Seco 91411 14.13$       14.13$        

Acme Tools 3 Ea. Stabila 36548 (New #) 183.41$     550.23$      

Bierschbach Equipment (IS NOT EQUIVALENT) 3 Ea.
Macklandburg
Duncan 92248 (92296 132.39$     397.17$      

Tiger Supplies, Inc. 3 Ea. Stabila 37948 (Disc'd #) 186.25$     558.75$      

Acme Tools 1 Ea. Seco 92021 55.90$       55.90$        
Bierschbach Equipment 1 Ea. Seco 92021 55.94$       55.94$        
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 1 Ea. Seco 92021 62.96$       62.96$        

Acme Tools 2 Ea.    NO BID
Bierschbach Equipment 2 Ea. Seco 92041 83.94$       167.88$      
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 2 Ea. NW Instrument ES2043 36.25$       72.50$        

Acme Tools 2 Ea.    NO BID
Bierschbach Equipment 2 Ea.    NO BID
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 2 Ea. Agatec ES2682 131.25$     262.50$      

Acme Tools 1 Ea. Seco ML-1M 688.86$     688.86$      
Bierschbach Equipment 1 Ea. Seco ML-1M 703.99$     703.99$      
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 1 Ea. Seco ML-1M 631.21$     631.21$      

Acme Tools 1 Box Seco 9036-06 7.16$         7.16$          
Bierschbach Equipment 1 Box Seco 9036-06 7.14$         7.14$          
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 1 Box Seco 9036-06 8.06$         8.06$          

Level Rod, Rectangular Series, Seco 92021

Ideal-Mark Valve Action Marker-Red, Seco 9036-06

Bipod, 12-Inch Open Clamp, Seco 5217-15-ABK
25

26

27

32

36

Tripod, Heavy-Duty aluminum With Quick Clamp and Dome Head, Seco 5311-30-ORG

Pocket Rod with 10 Graduations, Seco 7301-00

31

Smart Level, Digital, 48-Inch, Stabila 37948

28

Rod Bag, Seco 91411

33

16-Ft. Aluminum Grade Rod, NW Instrument ES2043
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Heavy-Duty Bag, 18-Inch, Seco 8090-20-ORG

29

Heavy-Duty Bag, 38-Inch, Seco 8102-01-ORG

30

34

13-Ft. Agatec Kombo Rod & Tripod Model 1-16250, Agatec ES2682

35

Magnetic Locator, Seco ML-1M
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Item
 No. Item & Vendor Qty. Unit Brand Model No. Unit Price Total Price 

Acme Tools 1 Box Seco 9063-14 44.10$       44.10$        
Bierschbach Equipment 1 Box Seco 9063-14 44.09$       44.09$        
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 1 Box Seco 9063-14 49.64$       49.64$        

Acme Tools 80 Bld. Seco 9050-02 3.57$         285.60$      
Bierschbach Equipment 80 Bld. Seco 9050-02 3.59$         287.20$      
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 80 Bld. Seco 9050-02 4.06$         324.80$      

Acme Tools 4 Ea. Seco 9070-03 31.55$       126.20$      
Bierschbach Equipment 4 Ea. Seco 9070-03 31.59$       126.36$      
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 4 Ea. Seco 9070-03 35.58$       142.32$      

Acme Tools 4 Ea. Seco 9500-13 10.35$       41.40$        
Bierschbach Equipment 4 Ea. Seco 9500-13 10.34$       41.36$        
Tiger Supplies, Inc. 4 Ea. Seco 9500-13 11.65$       46.60$        

YES NO
Acme Tools X     
Bierschbach Equipment X   
Tiger Supplies, Inc. X

41
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Option 1 - RE-ORDER AGREEMENT FOR ITEMS 1 THRU 40 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2014.

Ideal-Mark Valve Action Marker-Black, Seco 9036-14

38

Marking Whiskers, Seco 9050-02

39

Rock Pick, Seco 9070-03

40

Machete, Seco 9500-13

37


	Sheet1

