ND DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BID NO: 550-82-13-050

OPENING: 11/13/2013; 2:00 p.m.

COMMODITY: Counters, Traffic & Road Tubing

BUYER: Sue Eberle

Item L
No Description Qty. ACT TRAFFIC SOLUTIONS INC DIAMOND TRAFFIC PRODUCTS
Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
1 AUTOMATIC TRAFFIC RECORDERS 40 $1,225.00 $49,000.00 $1,377.00 $55,080.00
Diamond Traffic /

Make / Model Peek / ADR Sabre PHO-C 4RT 80C MMS USB

2 ADR SABRE USB MICRO-B TO A CABLE 2 $20.00 $40.00 $15.20 $30.40
Make / Model Peek / Micro B to A Cable Diamond Traffic / USB Cable

PORTABLE ADR-4 INPUT AIR SWITCH, 4 HOSE

3 INPUT 10 $175.00 $1,750.00 NO BID
Make / Model Peek / ADR 4RT Airswitch

4 TRAFFIC VOLUME RECORDERS 75 NO BID $288.54 $21,640.50
Make / Model Diamond Traffic/ TT-6

5 TRAFFIC VOLUME RECORDERS 45 NO BID $323.70 $14,566.50
Make / Model Diamond Traffic / TT-8

6 TRAFFIC COUNTER TESTER (TCT) 1 NO BID $695.00 $695.00
Make / Model Diamond Traffic/ 1111

7 | COUNTER ROAD TUBE 1/4” 9/16”, 120 FT. ROLLS | 10 560/Ft $.510/Ft. $5.385.60 $.588/Ft $6,209.28
Make / Model Hanna Rubber Diamond Traffic/RT R ¥ N 120

8 REORDER AGREEMENT FOR ITEM 1 THRU 7

Opt 1 | HELD FIRM UNTIL APRIL 30, 2014 N/A YES




