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ND DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 
SUMMARY OF BIDS  

BID NO: 760-00-15-050 OPENING: November 10, 2015; 2:00 PM COMMODITY: Attachments, Skid Steer BUYER: Vanessa Brosten 

 

BIDDER: ITEM NO. QTY SPECIFICATIONS UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE 

ACME TOOLS 

MAKE/MODEL 
1 

1 
Rotary Mower Attachment 
Grand Forks 

NO BID  

 Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 NO BID  

 2 OPT 1 1 
Deck Mulching Kit 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

NO BID  

 3 OPT 2 1 
Deck Side Discharge Kit 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

NO BID  

 4 OPT 3 1 
Complete Set of Replacement Blades 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

NO BID  

MAKE/MODEL 
5 

1 
HD Brush Mower Attachment 
Dickinson 

7300.00 7300.00 

Erskine 901102 Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 7300.00 7300.00 

 6 OPT 4 1 
Guide Wheel Kit for Front of Mower 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

287.00 287.00 

 7 OPT 5 1 
Offset Blade Kit, Complete 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

N/A  

MAKE/MODEL 

8 

1 
Sweeper W/Gutterbroom 
Dickinson 

5775.00 5775.00 

Erskine 901066 w/Curb Sweeper att. 
21 Days ARO 

2 Bismarck 5775.00 5775.00 

 Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 5775.00 5775.00 

 9 OPT 6 1 
Caster Wheel Kit, Adjustable 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

N/A  

 10 OPT 7 1 
Water Kit for Dust Control 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

2615.00 2615.00 

MAKE/MODEL 
11 

1 
84” Snow Blower 
Grand Forks 

7200.00 7200.00 

Erskine 900983 – 28 Days ARO Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 7200.00 7200.00 

MAKE/MODEL 
12 

1 
Stump Grinder Attachment 
Bismarck 

5730.00 5730.00 

Erskine 900551 Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 5730.00 5730.00 

MAKE/MODEL 
13 

3 
Mower Angle Broom 
Dickinson 

5250.00 15750.00 

Erskine 901060 Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 5250.00 5250.00 

MAKE/MODEL 
14 

1 
40” Cold Planer 
Williston 

NO BD  

 Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 NO BD  
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BUTLER MACHINERY COMPANY 

MAKE/MODEL 

1 

1 
Rotary Mower Attachment 
Grand Forks 

No Bid  

 Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 No Bid  

 2 OPT 1 1 
Deck Mulching Kit 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

No Bid  

 3 OPT 2 1 
Deck Side Discharge Kit 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

No Bid  

 4 OPT 3 1 
Complete Set of Replacement Blades 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

No Bid  

MAKE/MODEL 

5 

1 
HD Brush Mower Attachment 
Dickinson 

7948.00 7948.00 

Erskine Dual Rotary Brush Mower 
30 Days ARO 

Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 7948.00 7948.00 

 6 OPT 4 1 
Guide Wheel Kit for Front of Mower 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

Included  

 7 OPT 5 1 
Offset Blade Kit, Complete 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

N/A  

MAKE/MODEL 

8 

1 
Sweeper W/Gutterbroom 
Dickinson 

5478.00 5478.00 

Erskine Pickup Broom 84” 
30 Days ARO 

2 Bismarck 5478.00 10956.00 

 Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 5478  

 9 OPT 6 1 
Caster Wheel Kit, Adjustable 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

N/A  

 10 OPT 7 1 
Water Kit for Dust Control 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

2650.00 2650.00 

MAKE/MODEL 

11 

1 
84” Snow Blower 
Grand Forks 

7478.00 7478.00 

Erskine ES2410XL 85” 
30 Days ARO 

Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16   

MAKE/MODEL 

12 

1 
Stump Grinder Attachment 
Bismarck 

5792.00 5792.00 

Erskine Stump Grinder 
30 Days ARO 

Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 5792.00 5792.00 

MAKE/MODEL 

13 

3 
Mower Angle Broom 
Dickinson 

5578.00 16734.00 

Erskine Power Angle Broom 
30 Days ARO 

Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 5578.00 5578.00 

MAKE/MODEL 

14 

1 
40” Cold Planer 
Williston 

NO BID  

 Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 NO BID  
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EASTERN FARM MACHINERY 

MAKE/MODEL 
1 

1 
Rotary Mower Attachment 
Grand Forks 

NO BID  

 Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 NO BID  

 2 OPT 1 1 
Deck Mulching Kit 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

NO BID  

 3 OPT 2 1 
Deck Side Discharge Kit 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

NO BID  

 4 OPT 3 1 
Complete Set of Replacement Blades 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

NO BID  

MAKE/MODEL 
5 

1 
HD Brush Mower Attachment 
Dickinson 

8830.00 8830.00 

Erskine 901102 
45 Days ARO 

Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 8330.00 8330.00 

 6 OPT 4 1 
Guide Wheel Kit for Front of Mower 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

335.00 335.00 

 7 OPT 5 1 
Offset Blade Kit, Complete 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

N/A  

MAKE/MODEL 

8 

1 
Sweeper W/Gutterbroom 
Dickinson 

6591.00 6591.00 

Erskine 901066 
45 Days ARO 

2 Bismarck 6591.00 13182.00 

 Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 6091.00 6091.00 

 9 OPT 6 1 
Caster Wheel Kit, Adjustable 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

STD  

 10 OPT 7 1 
Water Kit for Dust Control 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

2995.00 2995.00 

MAKE/MODEL 

11 

1 
84” Snow Blower 
Grand Forks 

8159.00 8159.00 

Erskine 900983 
45 Days ARO 

Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 7659.00 7659.00 

MAKE/MODEL 

12 

1 
Stump Grinder Attachment 
Bismarck 

6911.00 6911.00 

Erskine 900551 
45 Days ARO 

Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 6411.00 6411.00 

MAKE/MODEL 

13 

3 
Mower Angle Broom 
Dickinson 

5859.00 17577.00 

Erskine 901059 
45 Days ARO 

Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 5359.00 5359.00 

MAKE/MODEL 

14 

1 
40” Cold Planer 
Williston 

26276.00 26276.00 

Roadhog CP405G Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 25476.00 25476.00 
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QUICK ATTACH 

MAKE/MODEL 
1 

1 
Rotary Mower Attachment 
Grand Forks 

NO BID  

 Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 NO BID  

 2 OPT 1 1 
Deck Mulching Kit 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

NO BID  

 3 OPT 2 1 
Deck Side Discharge Kit 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

NO BID  

 4 OPT 3 1 
Complete Set of Replacement Blades 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

NO BID  

MAKE/MODEL 

5 

1 
HD Brush Mower Attachment 
Dickinson 

6995.00 6995.00 

Quick Attach Brush Buster Max # 
901102 – 21 Days ARO 

Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 6795.00 6795.00 

 6 OPT 4 1 
Guide Wheel Kit for Front of Mower 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

304.00 304.00 

 7 OPT 5 1 
Offset Blade Kit, Complete 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

210.00 210.00 

MAKE/MODEL 

8 

1 
Sweeper W/Gutterbroom 
Dickinson 

5690.00 5690.00 

Quick Attach Clean Sweep Pickup 
Broom 901066 – 21 Days ARO 

2 Bismarck 5690.00 11380.00 

 Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 5490.00 5490.00 

 9 OPT 6 1 
Caster Wheel Kit, Adjustable 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

128.00 128.00 

 10 OPT 7 1 
Water Kit for Dust Control 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

1995.00 1995.00 

MAKE/MODEL 

11 

1 
84” Snow Blower 
Grand Forks 

8045.00 8045.00 

Quick Attach Quick Snow-Away 
2410XL 85” – 28 Days ARO 

Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 7845.00 7845.00 

MAKE/MODEL 

12 

1 
Stump Grinder Attachment 
Bismarck 

6250.00 6250.00 

Quick Attach Quick Stump-Away 
900551 – 28 Days ARO 

Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 6050.00 6050.00 

MAKE/MODEL 

13 

3 
Mower Angle Broom 
Dickinson 

5745.00 17235.00 

Quick Attach Quick Sweep Power 
Angle Broom 840X 901059 
21 Days ARO 

Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 5545.00 5545.00 

MAKE/MODEL 
14 

1 
40” Cold Planer 
Williston 

NO BID  

 Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 NO BID  
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BOBCAT 

MAKE/MODEL 
1 

1 
Rotary Mower Attachment 
Grand Forks 

3941.00 3941.00 

Bobcat 90” Mower – 45 Days ARO Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 3941.00 3941.00 

 2 OPT 1 1 
Deck Mulching Kit 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

428.97 428.97 

 3 OPT 2 1 
Deck Side Discharge Kit 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

392.66 392.66 

 4 OPT 3 1 
Complete Set of Replacement Blades 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

74.34 74.34 

MAKE/MODEL 

5 

1 
HD Brush Mower Attachment 
Dickinson 

5161.79 5161.79 

Bobcat 80” Brushcat (HF) 
45 DaysARO 

Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 5161.79 5161.79 

 6 OPT 4 1 
Guide Wheel Kit for Front of Mower 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

758.56 758.56 

 7 OPT 5 1 
Offset Blade Kit, Complete 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

225.85 225.85 

MAKE/MODEL 

8 

1 
Sweeper W/Gutterbroom 
Dickinson 

4706.90 4706.90 

Bobcat 84” Sweeper – 45 Days ARO 2 Bismarck 4706.90 9413.80 

 Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 4706.90 4706.90 

 9 OPT 6 1 
Caster Wheel Kit, Adjustable 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

766.50 766.50 

 10 OPT 7 1 
Water Kit for Dust Control 
Extend pricing through 4/30/16 Y/N 

1382.50 1382.50 

MAKE/MODEL 

11 

1 
84” Snow Blower 
Grand Forks 

5631.50 5631.50 

Bobcat 84” Snow Blower SBX240 
45 Days ARO 

Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 5631.50 5631.50 

MAKE/MODEL 

12 

1 
Stump Grinder Attachment 
Bismarck 

6045.20 6045.20 

Bobcat SCX 60 Stump Grinder 
45 Days ARO 

Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 6045.20 6045.20 

MAKE/MODEL 

13 

3 
Mower Angle Broom 
Dickinson 

4053.00 12159.00 

Bobcat 84” Angle Broom 
45 Days ARO 

Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 4053.00 4053.00 

MAKE/MODEL 
14 

1 
40” Cold Planer 
Williston 

18574.50 18574.50 

Bobcat 40” Planer High Flow Unknown Extended price through 4/30/16 18574.50 18574.50 


