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1 Joma or Equal 6000 System Less Curb-Runner Guard 76006-367000  NO BID  NO BID 
2    10' System  $   1,936.90  $   1,845.50 
3    11' System  $   2,119.70  $   2,018.08 
4    12' System  $   2,302.50  $   2,190.57 

5 Joma or Equal 4' Rubber Edge 76006-367005  $      662.03  $      662.50  NO BID  NO BID 
6    FOB Fargo District  $       662.03  $       575.64 
7    FOB Bismarck District  $       662.03  $       610.87 
8    FOB Minot District  $       662.03  $       610.32 
9    FOB Dickinson District  $       662.03  $       575.62 

10 Joma or Equal 3' Rubber Edge 76006-367006  $      502.13  $      504.38  NO BID  NO BID 
11    FOB Fargo District  $       502.13  $       457.71 
12    FOB Bismarck District  $       502.13  $       475.32 
13    FOB Minot District  $       502.13  $       457.74 
14    FOB Dickinson District  $       502.13  $       457.69 

15 Joma or Equal 4' Back Support BS23901 76006-367010  $        69.37  $        67.67  NO BID  NO BID 
16    FOB Bismarck District  $         69.37  $         36.55 
17    FOB Minot District  $         69.37  $         36.00 

18 Joma or Equal 3' Back Support BS23902 76006-367011  $        61.82  $        58.27  NO BID  NO BID 
19    FOB Bismarck District  $         61.82  $         29.19 
20    FOB Minot District  $         61.82  $         28.77 

21 Joma or Equal 4SEH Strap 20# 76006-367015  $        36.10  $        49.99  NO BID  NO BID 
22    FOB Bismarck District  $         36.10  $         20.51 
23    FOB Minot District  $         36.10  $         19.96 

24 Joma or Equal 3SEH Strap 15# 76006-367016  $        20.77  $        45.00  NO BID  NO BID 
25    FOB Bismarck District  $         20.77  $         15.93 
26    FOB Minot District  $         20.77  $         15.51 

27 Joma or Equal Curb Runner Guard 663158PLH (Left) 76006-367020  $        72.92  $      113.79  NO BID  $     75.33 

28 Joma or Equal Curb Runner Guard 663158PRH (Right) 76006-367020  $        72.92  $      113.79  NO BID  $     75.33 

29
X-48-W Assembly 4' Polarflex front mount system C/W 5/8" x 
6" Adapter Blades, 12' Plow (3Per) or Equal  NO BID  NO BID  $ 2,115.00  NO BID 
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5/8" X 6" Polarflex XSW-12 Adapter Blades - Or Equal 76006-367500 99.36

31    FOB Bismarck District  $       99.36 

32    FOB Dickinson District  $       99.36 

33 X-48-W-F, Complete 4' Section, Polarflex or Equal  NO BID  NO BID  $    705.00  NO BID 
34    FOB Dickinson District  $     705.00 

35 BUX-48-W, 4' Adapter Blade, Polarflex or Equal  NO BID  NO BID  $    178.57  NO BID 
36    FOB Dickinson District  $     178.56 

37 AUX-48, Front Angle, Polarflex or Equal  NO BID  NO BID  $    117.60  NO BID 
38    FOB Dickinson District  $     117.60 

39 Polarflex Curb Guard 10620029 or Equal  NO BID  NO BID  $     36.70  NO BID 

40 Through-Hardened Motor Grader 5/8" Bolt & Hole Punch 76006-361646  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

41 Through-Hardened Motor Grader 5/8" Bolt & Hole Punch 76006-361653  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

42 Through-Hardened Motor Grader 5/8" Bolt & Hole Punch 76006-361778  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

43 Through-Hardened Motor Grader 5/8" Bolt & Hole Punch 76006-361786  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
44 Through-Hardened Vee Snowplow 76006-368005  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

45 Through-Hardened Vee Snowplow 76006-368054  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

46 Through-Hardened Vee Snowplow 76006-368104  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

47 Through-Hardened Vee Snowplow 76006-368153  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
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