ND Department of Transportation
Summary of Bids

Bid No: 345-79-16-050 | Opening: 09/07/2016 02:00 PM | Commodity: Safety Jackets | Buyer: Gabriel Hoggarth|
Bidding Company: | USA Safety Supply [ Acme Tools (Bismarck) [ Ray O'Herron Co., Inc.
Brand Bid Part No. Brand Bid Part No. Brand Bid Part No.
Majestic 75-1383 Bid Price Majestic 75-1383 Bid Price Majestic 75-1383 Bid Price
I:\‘e:W Description Qty. Size Qty. Size Qty. Size
1to3 Medium $ 57.25 1to3 Medium $ 57.24 1to3 Medium $ 69.00
1to3 Large $ 57.25 1to3 Large $ 57.24 1to3 Large $ 69.00
1to3 XL $ 57.25 1to3 XL $ 57.24 1to3 XL $ 69.00
1to3 2XL $ 57.25 1to3 2XL $ 57.24 1to3 2XL $ 69.00
1to3 3XL $ 57.25 1to3 3XL $ 57.24 1to3 3XL $ 69.00
1to3 4XL $ 57.25 1to3 4XL $ 57.24 1to3 4XL $ 69.00
1to3 5XL $ 57.25 1to3 5XL $ 57.24 1to3 5XL $ 69.00
1to3 6XL $ 57.25 1to3 6XL $ 57.24 1to3 6XL $ 69.00
1to3 Large Tall $ 59.75 1to3 Large Tall $ 59.68 1to3 Large Tall $ 69.00
1to3 2X Large Tall $ 59.75 1to3 2X Large Tall $ 59.68 1to3 2X Large Tall $ 69.00
1to3 3X Large Tall $ 59.75 1to3 3X Large Tall $ 59.68 1to3 3X Large Tall $ 69.00
1to3 4X Large Tall $ 59.75 1to3 4X Large Tall $ 59.68 1to3 4X Large Tall $ 69.00
4t06 Medium $ 55.25 4t06 Medium $ 57.24 4t0 6 Medium $ 69.00
4t06 Large $ 55.25 4t06 Large $ 57.24 4t0 6 Large $ 69.00
4t06 XL $ 55.25 4t06 XL $ 57.24 4t0 6 XL $ 69.00
4t06 2XL $ 55.25 4t06 2XL $ 57.24 4t0 6 2XL $ 69.00
4t06 3XL $ 55.25 4t06 3XL $ 57.24 4t0 6 3XL $ 69.00
4t06 4XL $ 55.25 4t06 4XL $ 57.24 4t0 6 4XL $ 69.00
1 Majestic 75-1383 or Approved Equal 4106 5XL $ 55.25 4106 5XL $ 57.24 4106 5XL $ 69.00
4t06 6XL $ 55.25 4t06 6XL $ 57.24 4t0 6 6XL $ 69.00
4t06 Large Tall $ 57.25 4t06 Large Tall $ 59.68 4t0 6 Large Tall $ 69.00
4t06 2X Large Tall $ 57.25 4t06 2X Large Tall $ 59.68 4t0 6 2X Large Tall $ 69.00
4t06 3X Large Tall $ 57.25 4t06 3X Large Tall $ 59.68 4t0 6 3X Large Tall $ 69.00
4t06 4X Large Tall $ 57.25 4t06 4X Large Tall $ 59.68 4t0 6 4X Large Tall $ 69.00
7 or More Medium $ 54.50 7 or More Medium $ 57.24 7 or More Medium $ 69.00
7 or More Large $ 54.50 7 or More Large $ 57.24 7 or More Large $ 69.00
7 or More XL $ 54.50 7 or More XL $ 57.24 7 or More XL $ 69.00
7 or More 2XL $ 54.50 7 or More 2XL $ 57.24 7 or More 2XL $ 69.00
7 or More 3XL $ 54.50 7 or More 3XL $ 57.24 7 or More 3XL $ 69.00
7 or More 4XL $ 54.50 7 or More 4XL $ 57.24 7 or More 4XL $ 69.00
7 or More 5XL $ 54.50 7 or More 5XL $ 57.24 7 or More 5XL $ 69.00
7 or More 6XL $ 54.50 7 or More 6XL $ 57.24 7 or More 6XL $ 69.00
7 or More Large Tall $ 56.00 7 or More Large Tall $ 59.68 7 or More Large Tall $ 69.00
7 or More 2X Large Tall $ 56.00 7 or More 2X Large Tall $ 59.68 7 or More 2X Large Tall $ 69.00
7 or More 3X Large Tall $ 56.00 7 or More 3X Large Tall $ 59.68 7 or More 3X Large Tall $ 69.00
7 or More 4X Large Tall $ 56.00 7 or More 4X Large Tall $ 59.68 7 or More 4X Large Tall $ 69.00
TOTAL:| $ 2,028.00 TOTAL:| $ 2,089.92 TOTAL:| $ 2,484.00




Bidding Company:

USA Safety Supply

Acme Tools (Bismarck)

Ray O'Herron Co., Inc.

Brand Bid Part No. Brand Bid Part No. Brand Bid Part No.

Tingley 126172 Bid Price Tingley 126172 Bid Price No Bid No Bid Bid Price
I:\‘e:W Description Qty. Size Qty. Size Qty. Size
1to3 Small $ 49.00 1to3 Small $ 48.91 1to3 Small No Bid
1to3 Medium $ 49.00 1to3 Medium $ 48.91 1to3 Medium No Bid
1to3 Large $ 49.00 1to3 Large $ 48.91 1to3 Large No Bid
1to3 XL $ 49.00 1to3 XL $ 48.91 1to3 XL No Bid
1to3 2XL $ 49.00 1to3 2XL $ 52.38 1to3 2XL No Bid
1to3 3XL $ 49.00 1to3 3XL $ 52.38 1to3 3XL No Bid
1to3 4XL $ 49.00 1to3 4XL $ 52.38 1to3 4XL No Bid
1to3 5XL $ 49.00 1to3 5XL $ 52.38 1to3 5XL No Bid
4t06 Small $ 47.00 4t06 Small $ 48.91 4t0 6 Small No Bid
4t06 Medium $ 47.00 4t06 Medium $ 48.91 4t0 6 Medium No Bid
4t06 Large $ 47.00 4t06 Large $ 48.91 4t0 6 Large No Bid
4106 XL $ 47.00 4106 XL $ 48.91 4106 XL No Bid
2 Tingley J26172 or Approved Equal 4106 2XL $ 47.00 4106 2XL $ 52.38 4106 2XL No Bid
4106 3XL $ 47.00 4106 3XL $ 52.38 4106 3XL No Bid
4106 4XL $ 47.00 4106 4XL $ 52.38 4106 4XL No Bid
4106 5XL $ 47.00 4106 5XL $ 52.38 4106 5XL No Bid
7 or More Small $ 45.00 7 or More Small $ 48.91 7 or More Small No Bid
7 or More Medium $ 45.00 7 or More Medium $ 48.91 7 or More Medium No Bid
7 or More Large $ 45.00 7 or More Large $ 48.91 7 or More Large No Bid
7 or More XL $ 45.00 7 or More XL $ 48.91 7 or More XL No Bid
7 or More 2XL $ 45.00 7 or More 2XL $ 52.38 7 or More 2XL No Bid
7 or More 3XL $ 45.00 7 or More 3XL $ 52.38 7 or More 3XL No Bid
7 or More 4XL $ 45.00 7 or More 4XL $ 52.38 7 or More 4XL No Bid
7 or More 5XL $ 45.00 7 or More 5XL $ 52.38 7 or More 5XL No Bid
TOTAL:| $ 1,128.00 TOTAL:| $ 1,215.48 TOTAL:| &




