
BIDDER
BISMARCK
DISTRICT

VALLEY CITY 
DISTRICT

DEVILS LAKE
DISTRICT

MINOT
DISTRICT

DICKINSON
DISTRICT

GRAND FORKS
DISTRICT

WILLISTON
DISTRICT

FARGO
DISTRICT

TOTAL
ESTIMATE

 Estimated Usage
TONS 5,900 9,402 2675 4,620 2,525 8,790 6,900 6,300 47,112

NSC Minerals $87.47 $102.08 $84.75 $77.29 $91.27 $93.58 $88.63 $105.85

Bidder Total Est. $516,073.00 $959,756.16 $226,706.25 $357,079.80 $230,456.75 $822,568.20 $611,547.00 $666,855.00 4,391,042.16$    
Pneumatic Delivery 
Charge $20/ton $20/ton $20/ton $20/ton $20/ton $20/ton $20/ton $20/ton
Off-Season Delivery 
Discount May 1-July 31 5% 5% 5% 5% 5% 5% 5% 5%

Compass Minerals NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Morton Salt, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

ND DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
SUMMARY OF BIDS

775-45-19-050-02 2:00 PM Central, September 27, 2019
BUYER:
Vanessa Brosten

COMMODITY:
Salt, Road Maintenance

OPENING:BID NO:
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