

Vendor:		Electronic Communications, Inc.		Great Plains Towers, Inc.
Item	Description	Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price
1	Illuminator	1 - 5	\$1,136.00	No Bid
		6 - 10	\$1,086.00	No Bid
		11 - 15	\$1,036.00	No Bid
		16 - 20	\$1,036.00	No Bid
		21 >	\$1,036.00	No Bid
			Raytec RM200-FAI-30	
			Wall Mount Add \$27.00 EA	
			Pole Mount Add \$75.00 EA	
			FOB Destination First Year Only	
			Delivery 3-4 weeks	
2	30' Hinged Metal Pole	1 - 5	No Bid	\$2,900.00
		6 - 10	No Bid	\$2,900.00
		11 - 15	No Bid	\$2,800.00
		16 - 20	No Bid	\$2,800.00
		21 >	No Bid	\$2,700.00
				GPT HMP
3	40' Hinged Metal Pole	1 - 5	No Bid	\$3,900.00
		6 - 10	No Bid	\$3,900.00
		11 - 15	No Bid	\$3,800.00
		16 - 20	No Bid	\$3,800.00
		21 >	No Bid	\$3,700.00
				GPT HMP
4	50' Hinged Metal Pole	1 - 5	No Bid	\$4,900.00
		6 - 10	No Bid	\$4,900.00
		11 - 15	No Bid	\$4,800.00
		16 - 20	No Bid	\$4,800.00
		21 >	No Bid	\$4,700.00
				GPT HMP
5	30' Hinged Truss Tower	1 - 5	No Bid	No Bid
		6 - 10	No Bid	No Bid
		11 - 15	No Bid	No Bid
		16 - 20	No Bid	No Bid
		21 >	No Bid	No Bid
6	CCTV Pole Cabinet	1 - 5	\$2,990.00	No Bid
		6 - 10	\$2,940.00	No Bid
		11 - 15	\$2,890.00	No Bid
		16 - 20	\$2,890.00	No Bid
		21 >	\$2,890.00	No Bid
			Povolny POVO 60620	

	Vendor:		Electronic Communications, Inc.	Great Plains Towers, Inc.
Item	Description	Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price
7	Rack Mntd. Fiber Optic Term. Panel	1 - 5	\$124.00	No Bid
		6 - 10	\$114.00	No Bid
		11 - 15	\$114.00	No Bid
		16 - 20	\$114.00	No Bid
		21 >	\$114.00	No Bid
			Optic Cable RTR 12B	
8	Rack Mntd. Outlet Strip	1 - 5	\$110.00	No Bid
		6 - 10	\$105.00	No Bid
		11 - 15	\$105.00	No Bid
		16 - 20	\$105.00	No Bid
		21 >	\$105.00	No Bid
			Geist SPF-064-3	