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ND DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 
SUMMARY OF BIDS  

 
BID NO: 975-34-16-050 OPENING: February 4, 2016; 2:00 PM COMMODITY: Construction Equipment Rental BUYER: Vanessa Brosten 

 
 

Bidder: Item 
no. Quantity Make Model Price per Hour Total Price 

NORTH CENTRAL RENTAL & LEASING 

Motor Grader with RH Wing 
100 hours minimum 1 3 2012-2016 140M2/3 AWD $210.00 $63,000.00 

FWD Articulated Wheel Loader 
100 hours minimum 2 12 2013-2016 924k OR 926m $42.00 $50,400.00 

Tractor Backhoe 
100 hours minimum 3 1 2014-2016 420F OR 420F2 $70.00 $7,000.00 

LGP Dozer 
100 hours minimum 4 2 2013-2016 D6N $170.00 $34,000.00 

LGP Dozer Optional (Small spec unit) 5 4 2013-2016 Caterpillar D6K2 $115.00 $46,000.00 

RDO EQUIPMENT CO. 

Motor Grader with RH Wing 
100 hours minimum 1 3 2014-2015 

DEERE 772GP 200.00 $60,000.00 

FWD Articulated Wheel Loader 
100 hours minimum 2 12 NO BID    

Tractor Backhoe 
100 hours minimum 3 1 NO BID    

LGP Dozer 
100 hours minimum 4 2 NO BID    

LGP Dozer Optional (Small spec unit) 5 4 NO BID    
MACHINERY POWER & EQUIPMENT 

Motor Grader with RH Wing 
100 hours minimum 1 3 NO BID    

FWD Articulated Wheel Loader 
100 hours minimum 2 12 2014-2015 930K $2000/MONTH 

*$240.10 $288,120.00 

Tractor Backhoe 
100 hours minimum 3 1 NO BID    

LGP Dozer 
100 hours minimum 4 2 2014 D6N $3500/MONTH 

*$420.17 $42,016.81 

LGP Dozer Optional (Small spec unit) 5 4 2014 D6K $3000/MONTH 
*$360.14 $144,056.00 

*To calculate hourly rate, we will use the monthly rate divided by 8.33 hours per Amendment No. 1 of the bid. 


