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BIDDER
BISMARCK
DISTRICT

VALLEY CITY 
DISTRICT

DEVILS LAKE
DISTRICT

MINOT
DISTRICT

DICKINSON
DISTRICT

GRAND FORKS
DISTRICT

WILLISTON
DISTRICT

FARGO
DISTRICT

TOTAL
ESTIMATE

 Estimated Usage
TONS 9,000 3,000 800 1,400 2,525 2,358 3,590 6,150 28,823

North American
Salt Co., Overland Park
KS

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Bidder Total Est.

NSC Minerals
Saskatoon SK $78.85 $94.86 $77.85 $70.59 $84.74 $86.68 $81.32 $98.61
Bidder Total Est. $709,650.00 $284,580.00 $62,280.00 $98,826.00 $213,968.50 $204,391.44 $291,938.80 $606,451.50 2,472,086.24$    
 

Kleysen Group LP
Oak Blufff, MB $150.00 NO BID $134.31 $110.50 NO BID NO BID $113.33 NO BID
Bidder Total Est.

ND DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
SUMMARY OF BIDS

775-45-14-050 2:00 PM Central, July 30, 2014
BUYER:
Sue Eberle

COMMODITY:
Salt, Road Maintenance

OPENING:BID NO:
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