
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BUYER:  GABRIEL HOGGARTH

 PROCUREMENT/FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT
608 E BLVD AVE

BISMARCK ND  58505-0700

BID #305-00-16-050                                BID OPENING:  4/21/2016, 2:30 P.M.                                    ITEM:  Engineering Equipment

Item
 No. Item & Vendor 1-3 Units/Ea 4-7 Units/Ea 8 or More/Ea

Acme Tools No Bid No Bid No Bid
Frontier Equipment, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid
    

Acme Tools No Bid No Bid No Bid
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 108.00$      108.00$      108.00$      
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid
    

Acme Tools No Bid No Bid No Bid
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 100.00$      90.00$        90.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 95.00$        95.00$        95.00$        
Bierschbach Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid
    

Acme Tools 76.91$        76.91$        76.91$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 100.00$      82.00$        82.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 96.00$        90.00$        90.00$        
Bierschbach Equipment 78.69$        78.69$        78.69$        
    

Acme Tools 179.27$      179.27$      179.27$      
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 215.00$      203.00$      203.00$      
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 219.00$      210.00$      210.00$      
Bierschbach Equipment 204.89$      204.89$      204.89$      
    

Acme Tools 47.36$        47.36$        47.36$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 54.00$        46.00$        46.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 50.00$        50.00$        50.00$        
Bierschbach Equipment 48.39$        48.39$        48.39$        
    

Acme Tools 522.95$      522.95$      522.95$      
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 552.00$      552.00$      552.00$      
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 599.00$      590.00$      590.00$      
Bierschbach Equipment 535.19$      535.19$      535.19$      
    

3

1

     GPS Accessories

     DMI
GPS DMI

2

GPS Rover Batteries
GPS Rover Batteries
GPS Rover Batteries
GPS Rover Batteries

5

Topo Shoe Adapter for GPS Bracket
Topo Shoe Adapter for GPS Bracket
Topo Shoe Adapter for GPS Bracket

98 of the 100 bid items were bid by at least 1 bidder. Acme Tools was low bid on 81 of the 98 items bid. 

As the sole awardee, Acme Tools can provide 93 of the 98 items bid.

Due to the administrative costs associated with administering multiple contracts and as allowed by Bidder Instruction No. 3,                   
Acme Tools will be awarded the entire contract. 

Item Description

GPS DMI
GPS DMI
GPS DMI

1

 

Radio Whip Antenna for GPS Rover
Radio Whip Antenna for GPS Rover
Radio Whip Antenna for GPS Rover
Radio Whip Antenna for GPS Rover

6

GPS Truck Door Bracket
GPS Truck Door Bracket
GPS Truck Door Bracket

Radio Whip Antenna for GPS Rover

Radio Antenna Bracket for Tripod
Radio Antenna Bracket for Tripod
Radio Antenna Bracket for Tripod
Radio Antenna Bracket for Tripod
Radio Antenna Bracket for Tripod

Triple Mag mount
Triple Mag mount
Triple Mag mount
Triple Mag mount

 

Topo Shoe Adapter for GPS Bracket
 

GPS Truck Door Bracket
 

4



SUMMARY OF BIDS

BUYER:  GABRIEL HOGGARTH

 PROCUREMENT/FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT
608 E BLVD AVE

BISMARCK ND  58505-0700

Acme Tools 522.95$      522.95$      522.95$      
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 552.00$      552.00$      552.00$      
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 599.00$      590.00$      590.00$      
Bierschbach Equipment 535.19$      535.19$      535.19$      
    

Acme Tools 239.79$      239.79$      239.79$      
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 272.00$      272.00$      272.00$      
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 285.00$      275.00$      275.00$      
Bierschbach Equipment 245.39$      245.39$      245.39$      
    

Acme Tools 62.03$        62.03$        62.03$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 76.00$        76.00$        76.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 80.00$        77.00$        77.00$        
Bierschbach Equipment 63.39$        63.39$        63.39$        
    

Acme Tools 14.60$        14.60$        14.60$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 15.00$        15.00$        15.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 16.00$        15.00$        15.00$        
Bierschbach Equipment 14.89$        14.89$        14.89$        
    

Acme Tools 57.20$        57.20$        57.20$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 74.00$        74.00$        74.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 70.00$        68.00$        68.00$        
Bierschbach Equipment 58.49$        58.49$        58.49$        
 

Acme Tools 52.37$        52.37$        52.37$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 69.00$        69.00$        69.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 67.00$        64.00$        64.00$        
Bierschbach Equipment 53.59$        53.59$        53.59$        
 

Acme Tools 52.37$        52.37$        52.37$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 69.00$        69.00$        69.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 67.00$        64.00$        64.00$        
Bierschbach Equipment 53.59$        53.59$        53.59$        
 

Acme Tools No Bid No Bid No Bid
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 30.00$        30.00$        30.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid
    

Acme Tools 13.79$        13.79$        13.79$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 30.00$        30.00$        30.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid
    

Fiberglass Handle Round Shovel
Fiberglass Handle Round Shovel

 

SitePro Hammer
SitePro Hammer
SitePro Hammer

 

Fiberglass Handle Round Shovel
Fiberglass Handle Round Shovel

Claw Clamp with 1 inch Ball - Plain
Claw Clamp with 1 inch Ball - Plain
Claw Clamp with 1 inch Ball - Plain
Claw Clamp with 1 inch Ball - Plain

SitePro Hammer

Claw Pole Clamp Plain
Claw Pole Clamp Plain
Claw Pole Clamp Plain
Claw Pole Clamp Plain

Ball Clamp for ATV
 

Quick Release Controller Cradles
Quick Release Controller Cradles
Quick Release Controller Cradles
Quick Release Controller Cradles

Pole Clamp w/ 0.15 X 0.92 In. Slot
Pole Clamp w/ 0.15 X 0.92 In. Slot

 

Ball Clamp for ATV
Ball Clamp for ATV
Ball Clamp for ATV

Pole Clamp w/ 0.15 X 0.92 In. Slot
Pole Clamp w/ 0.15 X 0.92 In. Slot

7

13

1

2

    Hand Tools

GPS Truck Door Bracket -Flo Orange
GPS Truck Door Bracket -Flo Orange
GPS Truck Door Bracket -Flo Orange

 

2 M Two-Piece Rover Rod
2 M Two-Piece Rover Rod8

9

2 M Two-Piece Rover Rod
2 M Two-Piece Rover Rod

 

10

11

12

GPS Truck Door Bracket -Flo Orange



SUMMARY OF BIDS

BUYER:  GABRIEL HOGGARTH

 PROCUREMENT/FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT
608 E BLVD AVE

BISMARCK ND  58505-0700

Acme Tools 8.81$          8.81$          8.81$          
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 23.00$        23.00$        23.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid
 

Acme Tools 24.91$        23.92$        23.92$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 29.00$        29.00$        29.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid
    

Acme Tools 21.88$        20.11$        20.11$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 31.00$        31.00$        31.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid
    

Acme Tools 25.05$        24.15$        24.15$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 40.00$        40.00$        40.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid
    

Acme Tools 14.50$        14.50$        14.50$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 34.00$        34.00$        34.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid
 

Acme Tools No Bid No Bid No Bid
Frontier Equipment, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid
 

Acme Tools 38.75$        35.64$        35.64$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 45.00$        45.00$        45.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment 44.89$        44.89$        44.89$        
    

Acme Tools 26.80$        24.65$        24.65$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 35.00$        35.00$        35.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment 33.39$        33.39$        33.39$        
 

Acme Tools 10.71$        10.71$        10.71$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 13.00$        13.00$        13.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment 10.89$        10.89$        10.89$        
     

Rock Pick

13 In. Machete
13 In. Machete
13 In. Machete
13 In. Machete

6 Lb. Hammer

Camper’s Axe with Sheath
Camper’s Axe with Sheath
Camper’s Axe with Sheath

Rock Pick

Shovels, Square Point
Shovels, Square Point

6 Lb. Hammer
6 Lb. Hammer
6 Lb. Hammer

Rip Claw Hammer, 16 oz.
Rip Claw Hammer, 16 oz.

 

Rip Claw Hammer, 20 oz.
Rip Claw Hammer, 20 oz.

Shovels, Square Point

48 oz. Engineers Hammer
48 oz. Engineers Hammer
48 oz. Engineers Hammer

 

Rip Claw Hammer, 16 oz.
Rip Claw Hammer, 16 oz.

3 Lb. Engineer Hammer

3

9

10

11

Camper’s Axe with Sheath
 

Rock Pick
Rock Pick

6

7

8

Rip Claw Hammer, 20 oz.
Rip Claw Hammer, 20 oz.

 

Shovels, Square Point

4

5

4 Lb. Engineer Hammer
5 Lb. Engineer Hammer
6 Lb. Engineer Hammer

48 oz. Engineers Hammer



SUMMARY OF BIDS

BUYER:  GABRIEL HOGGARTH

 PROCUREMENT/FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT
608 E BLVD AVE

BISMARCK ND  58505-0700

Acme Tools 149.02$      149.02$      149.02$      
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 138.00$      138.00$      138.00$      
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 200.00$      195.00$      195.00$      
Bierschbach Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid
 

Acme Tools 593.96$      593.96$      593.96$      
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 600.00$      575.00$      550.00$      
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 695.00$      670.00$      670.00$      
Bierschbach Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid
    

Acme Tools 728.44$      728.44$      728.44$      
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 790.00$      785.00$      725.00$      
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment 745.49$      745.49$      745.49$      
 

Acme Tools 117.07$      117.07$      117.07$      
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 140.00$      140.00$      140.00$      
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid
 

Acme Tools 99.63$        99.63$        99.63$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 130.00$      125.00$      120.00$      
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid
    

Acme Tools 24.35$        24.35$        24.35$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 47.00$        47.00$        47.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid
    

Acme Tools 13.24$        13.24$        13.24$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 27.00$        27.00$        27.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid
 

Acme Tools 15.75$        15.75$        15.75$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 11.00$        11.00$        11.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid
    

Acme Tools 15.75$        15.75$        15.75$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 18.00$        18.00$        18.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid
    

Aervoe Marking Stick
Aervoe Marking Stick
Aervoe Marking Stick

 

Aervoe Marking Stick
Aervoe Marking Stick
Aervoe Marking Stick
Aervoe Marking Stick

 

Aervoe Marking Stick

Rust Oleum Marking Wand
Rust Oleum Marking Wand
Rust Oleum Marking Wand
Rust Oleum Marking Wand

 

Measuring Wheel 
Measuring Wheel 
Measuring Wheel 
Measuring Wheel 

 

 

Magnetic Locator
Magnetic Locator
Magnetic Locator
Magnetic Locator

Rotary Laser Detector
Rotary Laser Detector
Rotary Laser Detector
Rotary Laser Detector

Laser Level, Rotating

3

4

2

Adir Can Holder/Flag Tape Dispenser
Adir Can Holder/Flag Tape Dispenser
Adir Can Holder/Flag Tape Dispenser
Adir Can Holder/Flag Tape Dispenser

1

2

1

    Measuring Wheels

    Paint and Marking Tools

Measuring Wheel
Measuring Wheel
Measuring Wheel
Measuring Wheel

1

2

1

   Laser Level

   Magnetic Locator

Laser Level, Rotating
Laser Level, Rotating
Laser Level, Rotating



SUMMARY OF BIDS

BUYER:  GABRIEL HOGGARTH

 PROCUREMENT/FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT
608 E BLVD AVE

BISMARCK ND  58505-0700

Acme Tools 17.35$        17.35$        17.35$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid
 

Acme Tools 13.76$        13.76$        13.76$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 2.95$          2.95$          2.95$          
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment 14.09$        14.09$        14.09$        
    

Acme Tools 13.76$        13.76$        13.76$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 2.95$          2.95$          2.95$          
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment 14.09$        14.09$        14.09$        
 

Acme Tools 13.76$        13.76$        13.76$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 2.95$          2.95$          2.95$          
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment 14.09$        14.09$        14.09$        
 

Acme Tools 15.47$        15.47$        15.47$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 16.00$        16.00$        16.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment 15.79$        15.79$        15.79$        
    

Acme Tools 3.70$          3.70$          3.70$          
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 3.00$          3.00$          2.75$          
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment 3.79$          3.79$          3.79$          
    

Acme Tools 61.22$        61.22$        61.22$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 75.00$        75.00$        75.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 64.00$        63.00$        63.00$        
Bierschbach Equipment 62.59$        62.59$        62.59$        
    

Acme Tools 61.22$        61.22$        61.22$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 75.00$        75.00$        75.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 64.00$        63.00$        63.00$        
Bierschbach Equipment 62.59$        62.59$        62.59$        
    

Acme Tools 46.28$        46.28$        46.28$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 55.00$        55.00$        55.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 58.00$        56.00$        56.00$        
Bierschbach Equipment 47.29$        47.29$        47.29$        
    

 

Quick Release Adapter Rover Rods
Quick Release Adapter Rover Rods
Quick Release Adapter Rover Rods
Quick Release Adapter Rover Rods

 

 

Mini Stakeout Pole - Red
Mini Stakeout Pole - Red
Mini Stakeout Pole - Red
Mini Stakeout Pole - Red

 

Flagging Tape Dispenser
 

Presco Marking Whiskers - Pink Glo
Presco Marking Whiskers - Pink Glo
Presco Marking Whiskers - Pink Glo
Presco Marking Whiskers - Pink Glo

Presco Roll Flagging - Yellow Glo
Presco Roll Flagging - Yellow Glo

Flagging Tape Dispenser
Flagging Tape Dispenser
Flagging Tape Dispenser

Presco Roll Flagging - Pink Glo
Presco Roll Flagging - Pink Glo
Presco Roll Flagging - Pink Glo

Presco Roll Flagging - Yellow Glo
Presco Roll Flagging - Yellow Glo

Presco Roll Flagging - Orange Glo
Presco Roll Flagging - Orange Glo
Presco Roll Flagging - Orange Glo
Presco Roll Flagging - Orange Glo

 

Presco Roll Flagging - Pink Glo

Quick Mark Wheel Hand Held Wand
Quick Mark Wheel Hand Held Wand
Quick Mark Wheel Hand Held Wand
Quick Mark Wheel Hand Held Wand

8

9

1

2

3

   Poles/Points

Mini Stakeout Pole
Mini Stakeout Pole
Mini Stakeout Pole
Mini Stakeout Pole

7

10

5

6



SUMMARY OF BIDS

BUYER:  GABRIEL HOGGARTH

 PROCUREMENT/FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT
608 E BLVD AVE

BISMARCK ND  58505-0700

Acme Tools 109.04$      109.04$      109.04$      
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 145.00$      145.00$      145.00$      
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 135.00$      131.00$      131.00$      
Bierschbach Equipment 111.59$      111.59$      111.59$      
 

Acme Tools 109.04$      109.04$      109.04$      
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 145.00$      145.00$      145.00$      
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 135.00$      131.00$      131.00$      
Bierschbach Equipment 111.59$      111.59$      111.59$      
 

Acme Tools 245.02$      245.02$      245.02$      
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 298.00$      298.00$      298.00$      
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 285.00$      279.00$      279.00$      
Bierschbach Equipment 250.69$      250.69$      250.69$      
 

Acme Tools 250.99$      250.99$      250.99$      
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 320.00$      320.00$      320.00$      
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 285.00$      279.00$      279.00$      
Bierschbach Equipment 256.89$      256.89$      256.89$      
    

Acme Tools 267.44$      267.44$      267.44$      
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 325.00$      325.00$      325.00$      
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 310.00$      304.00$      304.00$      
Bierschbach Equipment 273.69$      273.69$      273.69$      
    

Acme Tools 44.78$        44.78$        44.78$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 45.00$        45.00$        45.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 51.00$        49.00$        49.00$        
Bierschbach Equipment 45.79$        45.79$        45.79$        
    

Acme Tools 19.38$        19.38$        19.38$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 25.00$        25.00$        25.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 25.00$        25.00$        25.00$        
Bierschbach Equipment 19.79$        19.79$        19.79$        
 

Acme Tools 6.91$          6.91$          6.91$          
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 10.00$        10.00$        10.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 11.00$        11.00$        11.00$        
Bierschbach Equipment 6.99$          6.99$          6.99$          
    

Acme Tools 9.62$          9.62$          9.62$          
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 13.00$        13.00$        13.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 13.00$        13.00$        13.00$        
Bierschbach Equipment 9.79$          9.79$          9.79$          
 

Prism Pole Topo Shoe

Prism Pole Point-Steel Body Point
Prism Pole Point-Steel Body Point

 

Prism Pole Topo Shoe
Prism Pole Topo Shoe
Prism Pole Topo Shoe

52 cm/1.25 in. OD Carbon Fiber Ext.
53 cm/1.25 in. OD Carbon Fiber Ext.

 

Range Pole - 4 Ft.
Range Pole - 4 Ft.

Prism Pole Point-Steel Body Point

2 m Snap-Lock Rover Rod
2 m Snap-Lock Rover Rod
2 m Snap-Lock Rover Rod

 

50 cm/1.25 in. OD Carbon Fiber Ext.
51 cm/1.25 in. OD Carbon Fiber Ext.

2 m Carbon Fiber Rod
2 m Carbon Fiber Rod
2 m Carbon Fiber Rod

2m Two-Piece Rod w/ Cable Slot

2 m Snap-Lock Rover Rod

Snap Lock Rod w/ Outer Grad -YLW
Snap Lock Rod w/ Outer Grad -YLW
Snap Lock Rod w/ Outer Grad -YLW
Snap Lock Rod w/ Outer Grad -YLW

2 m Carbon Fiber Rod

10

11

12

Range Pole - 4 Ft.
Range Pole - 4 Ft.

Prism Pole Point-Steel Body Point

7

8

9

2m Two-Piece Rod w/ Cable Slot
2m Two-Piece Rod w/ Cable Slot
2m Two-Piece Rod w/ Cable Slot

 

Snap Lock Rod w/ Outer Grad -YLW
Snap Lock Rod w/ Outer Grad -YLW
Snap Lock Rod w/ Outer Grad -YLW
Snap Lock Rod w/ Outer Grad -YLW

4

5

6



SUMMARY OF BIDS

BUYER:  GABRIEL HOGGARTH

 PROCUREMENT/FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT
608 E BLVD AVE

BISMARCK ND  58505-0700

Acme Tools 19.38$        19.38$        19.38$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 23.00$        23.00$        23.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 25.00$        25.00$        25.00$        
Bierschbach Equipment 19.79$        19.79$        19.79$        
    

Acme Tools 44.80$        44.80$        44.80$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 53.00$        53.00$        53.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 55.00$        55.00$        55.00$        
Bierschbach Equipment 45.79$        45.79$        45.79$        
 

Acme Tools 2.03$          2.03$          2.03$          
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 2.50$          2.50$          2.50$          
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 3.00$          3.00$          3.00$          
Bierschbach Equipment 2.09$          2.09$          2.09$          
    

Acme Tools 2.03$          2.03$          2.03$          
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 2.50$          2.50$          2.50$          
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 3.00$          3.00$          3.00$          
Bierschbach Equipment 2.09$          2.09$          2.09$          
    

Acme Tools 8.18$          8.18$          8.18$          
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 17.00$        17.00$        17.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 10.00$        10.00$        10.00$        
Bierschbach Equipment 8.29$          8.29$          8.29$          
 

Acme Tools 30.59$        30.59$        30.59$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 95.00$        95.00$        95.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 40.00$        39.00$        39.00$        
Bierschbach Equipment 31.29$        31.29$        31.29$        
    

Acme Tools 12.61$        12.61$        12.61$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 18.00$        18.00$        18.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 18.00$        18.00$        18.00$        
Bierschbach Equipment 12.89$        12.89$        12.89$        
    

Acme Tools 42.50$        42.50$        42.50$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 60.00$        55.00$        55.00$        
Bierschbach Equipment 43.49$        43.49$        43.49$        
    

Acme Tools 57.89$        57.89$        57.89$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 79.00$        79.00$        79.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 78.00$        70.00$        70.00$        
Bierschbach Equipment 59.19$        59.19$        59.19$        
 

Level Rod - Rectangular

Level Rod - Rectangular

Pocket Rod w/ 10 Graduations

16 Ft. Aluminum Grade Rod

16 Ft. Aluminum Grade Rod

 

Level Rod - Rectangular

Level Rod - Rectangular

Pocket Rod w/ 10 Graduations
Pocket Rod w/ 10 Graduations
Pocket Rod w/ 10 Graduations

 

16 Ft. Aluminum Grade Rod

16 Ft. Aluminum Grade Rod

1m/1.25 In. OD Carbon Fiber Ext.
1m/1.25 In. OD Carbon Fiber Ext.
1m/1.25 In. OD Carbon Fiber Ext.
1m/1.25 In. OD Carbon Fiber Ext.

 

 

Sharp Point for Tripod or Prism Pole
Sharp Point for Tripod or Prism Pole
Sharp Point for Tripod or Prism Pole
Sharp Point for Tripod or Prism Pole

Center Punch Point

Topo Shoe & Point Combo

Prism Pole Point
Prism Pole Point
Prism Pole Point
Prism Pole Point

Wide Base Topo Shoe
Wide Base Topo Shoe
Wide Base Topo Shoe

Topo Shoe & Point Combo

   Rods

1

2

3

16

17

18

 

Center Punch Point
Center Punch Point
Center Punch Point

13

14

15

Wide Base Topo Shoe
 

Topo Shoe & Point Combo
Topo Shoe & Point Combo



SUMMARY OF BIDS

BUYER:  GABRIEL HOGGARTH

 PROCUREMENT/FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT
608 E BLVD AVE

BISMARCK ND  58505-0700

Acme Tools 153.06$      153.06$      153.06$      
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 195.00$      195.00$      195.00$      
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 185.00$      175.00$      175.00$      
Bierschbach Equipment 156.59$      156.59$      156.59$      
 

Acme Tools 130.99$      130.99$      130.99$      
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 165.00$      165.00$      165.00$      
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 168.00$      162.00$      162.00$      
Bierschbach Equipment 134.09$      134.09$      134.09$      
 

Acme Tools 205.00$      205.00$      205.00$      
Frontier Equipment, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid
 

Acme Tools 37.26$        37.26$        37.26$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 45.00$        45.00$        45.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment 38.09$        38.04$        38.04$        
    

Acme Tools No Bid No Bid No Bid
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 65.00$        65.00$        65.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment 58.49$        58.49$        58.49$        
    

Acme Tools 57.20$        57.20$        57.20$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 65.00$        65.00$        65.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment 58.49$        58.49$        58.49$        

Acme Tools 8.83$          8.83$          8.83$          
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 19.00$        19.00$        19.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid
 

Acme Tools 7.67$          7.67$          7.67$          
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 7.00$          7.00$          7.00$          
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid
    

Acme Tools 7.67$          7.67$          7.67$          
Frontier Equipment, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment 8.99$          8.99$          8.99$          
    

100 Ft. Tape - ft/10ths/100ths
 

50 Ft. Open Reel Fiberglass Tape
 

100 Ft. Tape - ft/10ths/100ths
100 Ft. Tape - ft/10ths/100ths
100 Ft. Tape - ft/10ths/100ths

Heavy Duty Bag - 38 In.
Heavy Duty Bag - 38 In.
Heavy Duty Bag - 38 In.
Heavy Duty Bag - 38 In.

50 Ft. Open Reel Fiberglass Tape

 

Heavy Duty Bag
Heavy Duty Bag
Heavy Duty Bag
Heavy Duty Bag

 

Smart Level 4 Ft.
Smart Level 4 Ft.
Smart Level 4 Ft.
Smart Level 4 Ft.

Heavy Duty Bag - 18 In.

25 Ft. Rod SVR Oval
25 Ft. Rod SVR Oval
25 Ft. Rod SVR Oval
25 Ft. Rod SVR Oval

4

25 Ft. Engineering Tape
25 Ft. Engineering Tape
25 Ft. Engineering Tape
25 Ft. Engineering Tape

50 Ft. Open Reel Fiberglass Tape
50 Ft. Open Reel Fiberglass Tape

   Tapes

2

3

1

2

3

1

   Stake Bags
Heavy Duty Bag - 18 In.
Heavy Duty Bag - 18 In.
Heavy Duty Bag - 18 In.

5

1

   Smart Level

17 ft SVR Rod - 10ths/Metric Grad
17 ft SVR Rod - 10ths/Metric Grad
17 ft SVR Rod - 10ths/Metric Grad
17 ft SVR Rod - 10ths/Metric Grad



SUMMARY OF BIDS

BUYER:  GABRIEL HOGGARTH

 PROCUREMENT/FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT
608 E BLVD AVE

BISMARCK ND  58505-0700

Acme Tools 17.03$        17.03$        17.03$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment 17.39$        17.39$        17.39$        
 

Acme Tools 11.77$        11.77$        11.77$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 13.00$        13.00$        13.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment 8.99$          8.99$          8.99$          
    

Acme Tools 18.93$        18.93$        18.93$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment 19.29$        19.29$        19.29$        
 

Acme Tools No Bid No Bid No Bid
Frontier Equipment, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment 19.29$        19.29$        19.29$        
 

Acme Tools 34.10$        34.10$        34.10$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment 34.89$        34.89$        34.89$        
 

Acme Tools 34.10$        34.10$        34.10$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment 34.89$        34.89$        34.89$        
    

Acme Tools 7.55$          7.55$          7.55$          
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 11.00$        11.00$        11.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment 7.69$          7.69$          7.69$          
 

Acme Tools 9.44$          9.44$          9.44$          
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 13.00$        13.00$        13.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment 9.69$          9.69$          9.69$          
    

Acme Tools 14.44$        14.44$        14.44$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 18.00$        18.00$        18.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment 14.69$        14.69$        14.69$        
    

 

Fiberglass Folding Ruler
Fiberglass Folding Ruler
Fiberglass Folding Ruler
Fiberglass Folding Ruler

 

25 Ft. Heavy Duty Tape

33 Ft. Heavy Duty Tape
33 Ft. Heavy Duty Tape
33 Ft. Heavy Duty Tape
33 Ft. Heavy Duty Tape

200 Ft. Tape - ft/10ths/100ths

200 Ft. Tape - ft/in/10ths (Dual Grad)
200 Ft. Tape - ft/in/10ths (Dual Grad)
200 Ft. Tape - ft/in/10ths (Dual Grad)
200 Ft. Tape - ft/in/10ths (Dual Grad)

100 Ft. Tape - ft/10ths/100th
100 Ft. Tape - ft/10ths/100th

200 Ft. Tape - ft/10ths/100ths
200 Ft. Tape - ft/10ths/100ths
200 Ft. Tape - ft/10ths/100ths

100 Ft. Open Reel Fiberglass Tape
100 Ft. Open Reel Fiberglass Tape

 

100 Ft. Open Reel Nylon Coated Steel
100 Ft. Open Reel Nylon Coated Steel
100 Ft. Open Reel Nylon Coated Steel

200 Ft. Open Reel Fiberglass Tape
200 Ft. Open Reel Fiberglass Tape
200 Ft. Open Reel Fiberglass Tape

100 Ft. Open Reel Fiberglass Tape
100 Ft. Open Reel Fiberglass Tape

200 Ft. Open Reel Fiberglass Tape

12

9

10

11

 

25 Ft. Heavy Duty Tape
25 Ft. Heavy Duty Tape
25 Ft. Heavy Duty Tape

6

7

8

100 Ft. Open Reel Nylon Coated Steel

100 Ft. Tape - ft/10ths/100th
100 Ft. Tape - ft/10ths/100th

4

5



SUMMARY OF BIDS

BUYER:  GABRIEL HOGGARTH

 PROCUREMENT/FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT
608 E BLVD AVE

BISMARCK ND  58505-0700

Acme Tools 41.66$        41.66$        41.66$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 75.00$        75.00$        75.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid
    

Acme Tools 130.19$      130.19$      130.19$      
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 195.00$      195.00$      195.00$      
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 159.00$      154.00$      154.00$      
Bierschbach Equipment 133.19$      133.19$      133.19$      
    

Acme Tools 40.30$        40.30$        40.30$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 49.00$        49.00$        49.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 50.00$        50.00$        50.00$        
Bierschbach Equipment 41.19$        41.19$        41.19$        
    

Acme Tools 128.13$      128.13$      128.13$      
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 169.00$      169.00$      169.00$      
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 165.00$      160.00$      160.00$      
Bierschbach Equipment 131.09$      131.09$      131.09$      
    

Acme Tools 278.73$      278.73$      278.73$      
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 325.00$      325.00$      325.00$      
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 340.00$      330.00$      330.00$      
Bierschbach Equipment 285.29$      285.29$      285.29$      
 

Acme Tools No Bid No Bid No Bid
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 70.00$        70.00$        70.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid
 

Acme Tools 8.93$          8.93$          8.93$          
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 9.00$          9.00$          9.00$          
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid
 

Acme Tools No Bid No Bid No Bid
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 3,800.00$   3,800.00$   3,800.00$   
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid
    

Acme Tools 27.78$        27.78$        27.78$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 40.00$        40.00$        40.00$        
Bierschbach Equipment 28.39$        28.39$        28.39$        
     

 

Fixed Tribrach Adapter
Fixed Tribrach Adapter
Fixed Tribrach Adapter
Fixed Tribrach Adapter

Rolling Straight Edge - 16 Ft.
Rolling Straight Edge - 16 Ft.
Rolling Straight Edge - 16 Ft.
Rolling Straight Edge - 16 Ft.

Survey Caps w/custom lettering

Surveyors Stake Tacks
Surveyors Stake Tacks
Surveyors Stake Tacks
Surveyors Stake Tacks

Tri-Max Dual Clamp Instrument Tripod
Tri-Max Dual Clamp Instrument Tripod

Survey Caps w/custom lettering
Survey Caps w/custom lettering
Survey Caps w/custom lettering

Heavy Duty Wood/Fiberglass Tripod
Heavy Duty Wood/Fiberglass Tripod
Heavy Duty Wood/Fiberglass Tripod

 

Tri-Max Dual Clamp Instrument Tripod
Tri-Max Dual Clamp Instrument Tripod

 

Laser Tribrach
Laser Tribrach
Laser Tribrach
Laser Tribrach

 

4

1

2

12 In. Open Clamp Bipod
12 In. Open Clamp Bipod
12 In. Open Clamp Bipod
12 In. Open Clamp Bipod

3

   Miscellaneous

1

2

 

Heavy Duty Wood/Fiberglass Tripod

1

1

   Thermometers

   Tribrach

Infrared Thermometer
Infrared Thermometer
Infrared Thermometer
Infrared Thermometer

3

   Tripod



SUMMARY OF BIDS

BUYER:  GABRIEL HOGGARTH

 PROCUREMENT/FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT
608 E BLVD AVE

BISMARCK ND  58505-0700

Acme Tools 143.47$      143.47$      143.47$      
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 200.00$      200.00$      200.00$      
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 169.00$      169.00$      169.00$      
Bierschbach Equipment 146.79$      146.79$      146.79$      
    

Acme Tools 20.13$        20.13$        20.13$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 23.00$        23.00$        23.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment 20.59$        20.59$        20.59$        
    

Acme Tools 9.94$          9.94$          9.94$          
Frontier Equipment, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment 10.09$        10.09$        10.09$        
 

Acme Tools 83.57$        83.57$        83.57$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 90.00$        90.00$        90.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 95.00$        95.00$        95.00$        
Bierschbach Equipment 85.49$        85.49$        85.49$        
    

Acme Tools 11.97$        11.97$        11.97$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 16.00$        16.00$        16.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 18.00$        18.00$        18.00$        
Bierschbach Equipment 12.19$        12.19$        12.19$        
    

Acme Tools 46.28$        46.28$        46.28$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 55.00$        55.00$        55.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 59.00$        59.00$        59.00$        
Bierschbach Equipment 47.29$        47.29$        47.29$        
 

Acme Tools 327.20$      327.20$      327.20$      
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 400.00$      400.00$      400.00$      
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 387.00$      387.00$      387.00$      
Bierschbach Equipment 334.89$      334.89$      334.89$      
    

Acme Tools 66.74$        66.74$        66.74$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 78.00$        78.00$        78.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment 68.29$        68.29$        68.29$        
    

Acme Tools 35.82$        35.82$        35.82$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 45.00$        45.00$        45.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 45.00$        45.00$        45.00$        
Bierschbach Equipment 36.59$        36.59$        36.59$        
    

 

Pole Peg Adjustment Jig
Pole Peg Adjustment Jig
Pole Peg Adjustment Jig
Pole Peg Adjustment Jig

 

 UTV Roll Cage Transporter for Rods
 

Center Punch Point
Center Punch Point
Center Punch Point
Center Punch Point

Quick Release Adapter, Rover Rods
Quick Release Adapter, Rover Rods

 UTV Roll Cage Transporter for Rods
 UTV Roll Cage Transporter for Rods
 UTV Roll Cage Transporter for Rods

Standard Rod Level
Standard Rod Level
Standard Rod Level

 

Quick Release Adapter, Rover Rods
Quick Release Adapter, Rover Rods

MagNail - 1-1/2 x 1/4 In.
MagNail - 1-1/2 x 1/4 In.
MagNail - 1-1/2 x 1/4 In.

Hand level
Hand level

Marking Pins
Marking Pins
Marking Pins
Marking Pins

 

MagNail - 1-1/2 x 1/4 In.

Tribrach w/ Optical Plummet
Tribrach w/ Optical Plummet
Tribrach w/ Optical Plummet
Tribrach w/ Optical Plummet

 

5

12

13

8

9

10

11

Hand level
Hand level

 

Standard Rod Level

6

7



SUMMARY OF BIDS

BUYER:  GABRIEL HOGGARTH

 PROCUREMENT/FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT
608 E BLVD AVE

BISMARCK ND  58505-0700

Acme Tools 125.48$      125.48$      125.48$      
Frontier Equipment, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. 148.00$      148.00$      148.00$      
Bierschbach Equipment 128.39$      128.39$      128.39$      
    

Acme Tools 45.64$        45.64$        45.64$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 38.00$        38.00$        38.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment 46.69$        46.69$        46.69$        
 

Acme Tools 45.64$        45.64$        45.64$        
Frontier Equipment, Inc. 38.00$        38.00$        38.00$        
General Equipment & Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bierschbach Equipment 46.69$        46.69$        46.69$        
    

Black Ideal-Mark Valve Marker Per 12
Black Ideal-Mark Valve Marker Per 13
Black Ideal-Mark Valve Marker Per 14
Black Ideal-Mark Valve Marker Per 15

 

 

Red Ideal-Mark Valve Marker Per 12
Red Ideal-Mark Valve Marker Per 12
Red Ideal-Mark Valve Marker Per 12
Red Ideal-Mark Valve Marker Per 12
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15

16

Tripod Laptop Bracket
Tripod Laptop Bracket
Tripod Laptop Bracket
Tripod Laptop Bracket
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