
BID NO.: 020-89-16-050       ITEM: Tractor, FWA, 120 PTO       DATE: November 14, 2010, 2:00 PM       BUYER: Vanessa Brosten

F:\PROCURE\TRACTORS\2016\Bid Summary020-89.xlsx

Plains Ag LLC, DBA 
Northern Plains 

Equipment

Valley Plains 
Equipment Acme Tools Butler Machinery Co RDO Equipment Co. Dakota Farm Equipment True North 

Equipment
Gooseneck 
Implement

Mandan, ND Jamestown, ND Grand Forks, ND Bismarck, ND Dickinson, ND Grafton, ND Minot, ND
120 PTO HP Front Wheel Assist Tractor 
with Loader per SSP-76-280-4

   Tractor Make/Model Case IH Puma 150 CVT John Deere 6155R Kubota M7-151 
Premium

AGCO Challenger 
MT525E John Deere 6155R John Deere 6155R John Deere 6155R John Deere 6155R

   Loader Make/Model Case IH L765 John Deere 640R Kubota LM2605 AGCO Challenger ML68 John Deere H360 John Deere 640R John Deere 640R John Deere 640R

ITEM 1 – FOB Bismarck 2 EA $246,000.00 $280,200.00 $283,444.00 $256,700.00 $283,664.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid
ITEM 2 – FOB Valley City 2 EA $247,000.00 $280,200.00 $283,444.00 $256,700.00 $283,664.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid

ITEM 3 – FOB Devils Lake 1 EA $124,000.00 $140,100.00 $141,722.00 $128,350.00 $141,832.03 No Bid No Bid No Bid
ITEM 4 – FOB Minot 2 EA $246,000.00 $280,200.00 $283,444.00 $256,700.00 $283,664.06 No Bid No Bid $316,672.00

ITEM 5 – FOB Dickinson 1 EA $123,000.00 $140,100.00 $141,722.00 $128,350.00 $141,832.03 $141,580 No Bid No Bid
ITEM 6 – FOB Grand Forks 2 EA $249,000.00 $280,200.00 $283,444.00 $256,700.00 $283,664.06 No Bid $286,638.76 No Bid

ITEM 7 – FOB Williston 2 EA $246,000.00 $280,200.00 $283,444.00 $256,700.00 $283,664.06 No Bid No Bid $316,672.00
ITEM 8 – FOB Fargo 2 EA $248,000.00 $280,200.00 $283,444.00 $256,700.00 $283,664.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid

ITEM 9 - Filter Package 1 SET $639.55 $475.31 $615.00 $578.76 $393.06 $491.00 $392.60 $728.43
ITEM 10, OPT 1 – 120 PT HT, FWA 
W/Loader, less freight through September 
30, 2017.

1 EA $123,000.00 $140,575.31 $141,722.00 $128,350.00 $140,154.74 $141,580.00 $143,319.38 No Bid

ITEM 11, OPT 2 – Front 3 Point Hitch and 
PTO through September 30, 2017.                                                1 EA $11,850.00 $7,970.00 $13,000.00 $7,525.00 $11,760.00 $4,340.00 $6,918.96 $8,200.00

ITEM 12, OPT 3 – Front Axle Suspension 
through September 30, 2017.  1 EA $3,750.00 $3,800.00 $3,760.00 $7,435.00 $3,109.26 $2,680.00 $2,715.38 $3,959.00

Delivery ARO 120 Days 90-120 60-150 120 140 120 90
ITEM 13 – Trade-In John Deere 7320 IVT 
w/Loader 1 EA $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $8,000.00 $10,000.00 $30,000.00 $10,000.00 $8,500.00 No Bid
ITEM 14 – Trade-In New Holland TM130 
w/Loader 1 EA $27,000.00 $10,000.00 $22,500.00 $20,000.00 $7,250.00 $6,500.00 No Bid No Bid

ITEM 15 – Trade-In Kubota M8200 w/Side 
Rotary Mower 1 EA $4,500.00 $6,000.00 $4,000.00 $6,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 No Bid No Bid

ITEM 16 – Trade-In New Holland TN70DA 
w/Side Sickle Mower 1 EA $13,500.00 $15,000.00 $13,500.00 $13,500.00 $15,500.00 $19,000.00 No Bid No Bid

ITEM 17 – Trade-In New Holland TN70DA 
w/Side Sickle Mower 1 EA $14,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $14,500.00 $17,000.00 $19,000.00 No Bid No Bid

ITEM 18 – Trade-In New Holland TN70DA 
w/Side Sickle Mower 1 EA $13,200.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $12,500.00 $15,000.00 $19,000.00 No Bid No Bid

Total All Trades $82,200.00 $81,000.00 $78,000.00 $77,000.00 $88,250.00
Total Bid Price (including all options) $1,745,239.55 $1,973,645.31 $2,001,483.00 $1,812,438.76 $2,000,910.74

Total Bid Price less trades $1,663,039.55 $1,892,645.31 $1,923,483.00 $1,735,438.76 $1,912,660.74
Returned Amendment No. 1? Yes No Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No
Returned Amendment No. 2? Yes No Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No
Returned Amendment No. 3? Yes No Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No
Returned Amendment No. 4? Yes No Yes No Yes Yes Yes No
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