Site	LOCATION	EA	FUEL TYPE	TANK TYPE	LEGEND TECHNICAL SERVICES	DR. FUEL GOOD	
1	Capital Motor Pool Fleet Services	1	Gas	Cathodically protected steel (Underground.) 10,000 Gal			
				Travel expense - Mileage, Per Diem, Lodging			
				Sub-total Site 1	NO BID	\$	3,500.00
_	Diamonals Diatriat	1	0	Fiberaless reinforced plactic (Underground \ 40,000 Cal			
2	Bismarck District	1		Fiberglass reinforced plastic (Underground.) 10,000 Gal Fiberglass reinforced plastic (Underground.) 10,000 Gal			
		+ '	Diesei	i t j			
				Travel expense - Mileage, Per Diem, Lodging Sub-total Site 2	NO BID	\$	5,100.00
3	Devils Lake District	1	Diesel	Double wall steel storage (Above ground) 10,000 Gal			
				Travel expense - Mileage, Per Diem, Lodging			
				Out (a) 1 0 1 a	NO DID	Φ.	0.000.00
				Sub-total Site 3	NO BID	\$	2,300.00
4	Dickinson District	1	Gas	Fiberglass reinforced plastic (Underground.) 10,000 Gal			
		1	Diesel	Fiberglass reinforced plastic (Underground.) 10,000 Gal			
				Travel expense - Mileage, Per Diem, Lodging			
				Sub-total Site 4	NO BID	\$	5,100.00
5	Fargo District	1	Gas	Fiberglass reinforced plastic (Underground.) 10,000 Gal			
		1		Fiberglass reinforced plastic (Underground.) 10,000 Gal			
				Travel expense - Mileage, Per Diem, Lodging			
				Sub-total Site 5	NO BID	\$	5,100.00
6	Grand Forks District	1	Gas	Fiberglass reinforced plastic (Underground.) 10,000 Gal			
		1		Cathodically protected steel (Underground.) 10,000 Gal			
				Travel expense - Mileage, Per Diem, Lodging			
				Sub-total Site 6	NO BID	\$	5,100.00
7	Minot District		Caa	Fiberglass reinforced plastic (Underground.) 10,000 Gal			
<i>'</i>	Williot District	1		Fiberglass reinforced plastic (Underground.) 10,000 Gal			
		+ '	Diesei	Travel expense - Mileage, Per Diem, Lodging			
				Sub-total Site 7	NO BID	\$	5,100.00
				Sub-total Site 1	NO DID	Ψ	3,100.00
8	Valley City District	1	Gas	Fiberglass reinforced plastic (Underground.) 10,000 Gal			
		1	Diesel	Fiberglass reinforced plastic (Underground.) 10,000 Gal			
				Travel expense - Mileage, Per Diem, Lodging			
				Sub-total Site 8	NO BID	\$	5,100.00
	Jamestown Section					_	
9	Valley City District	1	Gas	Double wall steel storage (Above ground) 10,000 Gal			
	valicy Oily District	1		Double wall steel storage (Above ground) 10,000 Gal			
		+	D10361	Travel expense - Mileage, Per Diem, Lodging			
				Sub-total Site 9	NO BID	\$	5,600.00
				Sub-total Sites 8 & 9		\$	10,700.00
40	Willioton District		C==	Cothodically protected start // Independent 4 \ 40.000 C-1			
10	Williston District	1	Gas	Cathodically protected steel (Underground.) 10,000 Gal			
		1	Diesel	Cathodically protected steel (Underground.) 10,000 Gal			
				Travel expense - Mileage, Per Diem, Lodging Sub-total Site 10	NO BID	\$	5,100.00
							,
	Total All Sites	19				\$	47,100.00