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Bidder Make/Model 
Item 1

 Side Dump 
Trailer

Item 2 Opt 1
Upgrade to 
Galv. Frame

Item 3
20 Ton Tilt 
Bed Trailer

Item 4 Opt 2
Trade-In Belly 
Dump Trailer

Item 5 Opt 3
Trade-In Tilt 
Bed Trailer

Item 6 Opt 4
Trade-In Tilt 
Bed Trailer

Item 7 Opt 5
Trade-In Tilt 
Bed Trailer

Item 8 Opt 6
Extended 

Pricing

Net Price with 
Trade-In 

(Basis for award)

RDO Equipment
Bismarck, ND Cros Country 420 SD $49,500.00 NO BID $28,500.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 yes $49,500.00
Jim Hawk Truck Trailers
Fargo, ND Sidump'r SDR 342-49 $51,550.00 NO BID $31,400.00 $8,000.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 yes $43,550.00
Westlie Truck Center
Minot, ND Dakota 4353 SDT $47,900.00 NO BID NO BID -$8,000.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 yes $39,900.00
Precision Equipment MFG
Fargo, ND Precision Titan $41,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.00 0.00 yes $41,500.00
Titan Machinery
West Fargo, ND Precision Titan $47,750.00 NO BID $28,750.00 NO BID -$950.00 -$525.00 -$525.00 yes $26,750.00
Northern Truck Equipment
Sioux Falls, SD NO BID NO BID NO BID $29,670.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00 0.00 yes $29,670.00
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