
BID NO: 570-44-15-050
OPENING: DECEMBER 8, 2012; 2:00 p.m. Central

COMMODITY: POSTS, U-CHANNEL BUYER: ALEXIS WINGO

District Size Finish Qty - EA Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

Bismarck 7' Galv 0 $11.38 $ $14.02 $ $ $ $11.96 $

8’ Galv 0 $12.82 $ $16.03 $ $ $ $13.60 $

Valley City 7' Galv 200 $11.38 $2,276.00 $14.02 $2,804.00 $26.97 $5,394.00 $11.96 $2,392.00

8’ Galv 0 $12.82 $ $16.03 $ $ $ $13.60 $

Devils Lake 7' Galv 400 $11.38 $4,552.00 $14.02 $5,608.00 $17.97 $7,188.00 $11.96 $4,784.00

8’ Galv 0 $12.82 $ $16.03 $ $ $ $13.60 $

Minot 7' Galv 500 $11.38 $5,690.00 $14.02 $7,010.00 $16.17 $8,085.00 $11.96 $5,980.00

8’ Galv 0 $12.82 $ $16.03 $ $ $ $13.60 $

Dickinson 7' Galv 100 $11.38 $1,138.00 $14.02 $1,402.00 $46.97 $4,697.00 $11.96 $1,196.00

8’ Galv 200 $12.82 $2,564.00 $16.03 $3,206.00 $28.26 $5,652.00 $13.60 $2,720.00

Grand Forks 7' Galv 500 $11.38 $5,690.00 $14.02 $7,010.00 $16.17 $8,085.00 $11.96 $5,980.00

8’ Galv 500 $12.82 $6,410.00 $16.03 $8,015.00 $17.46 $8,730.00 $13.60 $6,800.00

Williston 7' Galv 0 $11.38 $ $14.02 $ $ $ $11.96 $

8’ Galv 0 $12.82 $ $16.03 $ $ $ $13.60 $

Fargo 7' Galv 300 $11.38 $3,414.00 $14.02 $4,206.00 $20.97 $6,291.00 $11.96 $3,588.00

8’ Galv 0 $12.82 $ $16.03 $ $ $ $13.60 $

Reorder Prices Per Post Vulcan, Inc.

6’ Galv(57044-110609) $12.02

7' Galv(57044-110708) $14.02

8' Galv(57044-111003) $16.03

DELINEATOR POSTS 

2.0 lbs. per lineal foot

Comade, Inc.MD Solutions Vulcan, Inc.

TOTAL DOLLAR $31,734.00 $39,261.00 $54,122.00

Plain City, OH Foley, AL Santa Ana, CA

MD Solutions

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Comade, Inc.

$14.32

$12.88

$10.95

$11.96

$13.60

Newman Signs

Jamestown, ND

$33,440.00

Newman Signs

$10.32



BID NO: 570-44-15-050
OPENING: DECEMBER 8, 2012; 2:00 p.m. Central

COMMODITY: POSTS, U-CHANNEL BUYER: ALEXIS WINGO

District Size Finish Qty - EA Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

Bismarck 6' Galv 0 $6.41  $                        -  $7.30  $         $ $6.20 $

7' Galv 0 $7.27  $                        -  $8.53 $ $ $7.15 $

Valley City 6' Yellow 200 $8.41 $1,682.00 $8.17 $1,634.00 NO BID $ $14.79 $2,958.00

6' Galv 0 $6.41  $                        -  $7.30 $ $ $6.20 $

Devils Lake 6' Galv 0 $6.41  $                        -  $7.30 $ $ $6.20 $

7' Galv 0 $7.27  $                        -  $8.53 $ $ $7.15 $

Minot 6' Galv 500 $6.41 $3,205.00 $7.30 $3,650.00 $12.46 $6,230.00 $6.20 $3,100.00

7' Galv 0 $7.27  $                        -  $8.53 $ $ 47.15 $

Dickinson 6' Galv 0 $6.41  $                        -  $7.30 $ $ $6.20 $

7' Galv 0 $7.27  $                        -  $8.53 $ $ $7.15 $

Grand Forks 6' Galv 0 $6.41  $                        -  $7.30 $ $ $6.20 $

7' Galv 0 $7.27  $                        -  $8.53 $ $ $7.15 $

Williston 6' Galv 0 $6.41  $                        -  $7.30 $ $ $6.20 $

7' Galv 0 $7.27  $                        -  $8.53 $ $ $7.15 $

Fargo 6' Galv 0 $6.41  $                        -  $7.30 $ $ $6.20 $

7' Galv 100 $7.27 $727.00 $8.53 $853.00 $42.14 $4,214.00 $7.15 $715.00

$5,614.00

Reorder Prices Per Post Vulcan, Inc.

6' galv. (57044-841559) $7.30

6' yellow (57044-271302) $8.17

6' orange (57044-271203) $8.17

6' green (57044-           ) $8.17

6' black (57044-271005) $7.30

7' galv. (57044-841740) $8.53

7' yellow (57044-271609) $9.55

7' orange (57044-271500) $9.55

7' green (57044-           ) $9.55
*300 min. order for 
powder coated color 
posts

Barrier Posts

$5,614.00

$6,137.00

$10,444.00

$6,773.00   

TOTAL DOLLAR $6,137.00 $10,444.00

Comade, Inc.Vulcan, Inc.MD SolutionsBARRIER POSTS  

1.12 lbs. per lineal foot Santa Ana, CAFoley, ALPlain City, OH

NO BID

NO BID

MD Solutions

$8.27

$13.47

$12.47

$8.27

$10.41

$7.41

$10.41

$9.41

$7.41

Newman Signs

$6.20

$54,122.00

$39,261.00

$31,734.00

Delineator Posts

$64,566.00

$45,398.00

$37,348.00

Total

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Comade, Inc.

NO BID

Newman Signs

Jamestown, ND

$6,773.00

$14.79

$14.79

$4.82

$6.44

$7.15

Newman Signs $40,213.00$33,440.00

$15.79

$15.79

$5.55
*must order in qty. of 
200 of any 1 post

Conditions for re-order

Comade, Inc.

MD Solutions

Vulcan, Inc.

NO BID

NO BID
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