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ND DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

SUMMARY OF BIDS  
 

BID NO:   

ITB 988-89-13-050 

OPENING:   

April 15, 2013; 2:00 PM CENTRAL 

COMMODITY:  

WEED SPRAYING, RIGHT-OF-WAY 

BUYER:  

MARILYN LANGEHAUG 

 

BIDDER 

BID PRICE PER SPRAY HOUR 

ADD PER 

HOUR 

References 

Provided 

(Y/N) 

 

Proof of 

Spraying 

Certification 

Provided 

(Y/N) 

ITEM 1 ITEM 2 ITEM 3 ITEM 4 ITEM 5 

ITEM 6 

Option 1 

BURKE 

COUNTY 

DIVIDE 

COUNTY 

WILLIAMS 

COUNTY 

MCLEAN 

COUNTY 

GRIGGS 

COUNTY 

GPS 

REPORTING 

Mid Dakota Vegetation 
Management (MVM) 
Miller, SD 

NO BID NO BID NO BID $39.75 NO BID $2.75 Y Y 

Walker Lawncare, LLC 
Hillsboro, ND 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $55.00 $5.00 Y Y 

Right-A-Way Applicators, Inc. 
Cooperstown, ND 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $62.50 $0.00 Y Y 

Walker Landscaping & 
Construction LLC 
Rugby, ND 

$50.00 $55.00 $145.00 $65.00 NO BID $0.00 Y Y 

DeAngelo Brothers, Inc. 
Albert Lea, MN 

$140.00 $140.00 $140.00 $140.00 $140.00 $2.00 Y Y 

         

         

         

         

Not to Exceed Annual Contract 
Amount Includes Chemicals 

$9,000.00 $9,000.00 $17,000.00 $10,000.00 $7,500.00    

 


